
Price quote 

Vendor NamBert's Truck Equipment, Inc
Contact PerJim McLaughlin
Street Addr 3804 Highway 75 North
P.O. Box: 336
City, State, Moorhead, MN 56561-0336
Phone #: Toll Free #: 800-232-3787
Fax #:

Email Addre

Body Manufacture
No 
Bid

Primer Applaction Method (Dipped, Other) Explain

Body Manufacture
No 
Bid

Body Manufacture
No 
Bid

Body Manufacture
No 
Bid

Primer Applaction Method (Dipped, Other) Explain

Body Manufacture
No 
Bid

Primer Applaction Method (Dipped, Other) Explain

Body Manufacture
Primer Applaction Method (Dipped, Other) Explain

Body Manufacture

Knapheide

Custom Steel and / or Aluminum Fabricated Truck Bodies

Body Version 1
      Steel

Aluminum

Body Version 5   Not used this contract

Body Version 7  Steel

Body Version 8  Steel

Custom Steel and/or Aluminum Fabricated Truck Bodies

Knapheide E-coat

Body Version 9  Steel
Knapheide

218-233-8681
218-233-9548

jimmc@bertsonline.com

Body Version 6   Not used this contract

Body Version 2  Aluminum

Body Version 3  Steel

Body Version 4  Not used this contract

mailto:jimmc@bertsonline.com


Primer Applaction Method (Dipped, Other) Explain

Per Spec

1.0 Body version 1 
1.0 Body version 1 per Specification 1.0 made in steel No Bid
1.1 Body Version 1 per Specification 1.0 made in aluminum -$            

2.0 Body version 2 
2.1 Body Version 2 as per Specification 2.0 No Bid

3.0 Body Version 3
3.1 Body Version 3.0 per Specification 3.0 No Bid

4.0 Body Version 4 Not used this contract
5.0 Body Version 5 Not used this contract
6.0 Body Version 6  Not used this contract

7.0 Body Version 7 
7.1 Body version 7 Made of steel per Specification 7.0 No Bid

8.0 Body Version 8 
8.1 Body version 8 Made of steel per Specification 8.0 31,910.00$ -$            
8.25 Crane Reinforcement 1,750.00$   

8.25A Vista Lighting Installed 2,795.00$   

9.0 Body Version 9 
9.1 Body version 9 per Specification 9.0 43,185.00$ -$            

10.0 Body Version 10  Not used this contract

10.0 Front Deck
10.1 Per Specification 11.0 27,395.00$ -$            
10.1 Per Specification 11.0 with 15 foot total extension 28,895.00$ -$            

10.1A Radio Remote for catwalk 1,895.00$   
10.1b 12' Manual swing cat walk, installed 7,495.00$   

11.0 Options for Bodys 1 through 9
Use this section for adding optional body items,such as 
renmovable containment items, ladder boxes, Stake poctet doors, 

11.1 Charge for adding dimensions DUI 12/3000 inverter 3,645.00$   -$            
11.1A Group 31 Battery with Box, installed (each) 295.00$      
11.2 Charge for adding cab mounted GFI duplex 

receptacle 250.00$      -$            
11.3 charge for 50' 12-3 electric cord  reel with plug end, 

installed. 850.00$      -$            
11.4 charge for 50' 14-3 electric reel with light, installed 695.00$      -$            
11.5 Charge for cab mounted 12 volt power port, installed 135.00$      -$            

Front Deck

Body Version 10   Not used this contract

Knapheide E-coat



11.6 Charge for installing rope style lights in cabinets on 3 
sides of doors 240.00$      -$            

11.7 charge for installing Betts 32-5001 3 wire par 36 12v 
work light. 385.00$      -$            

11.8 Charge for installing K&H industries model 475-20 
remote control flood light No-Bid

11.9 Charge for installing additional loop or pool style hand 
rail at rear of body. 160.00$      -$            

11.10 Charge for switching deck material to 3/16" Smooth 
surface & coating it with thick layer of Vortex traction 
material including 6" up back side of cabinets 1,195.00$   -$            

11.11 Charge for switch top of step bumper to 3/16" 
Smooth surface & coating it with thick layer of Vortex 
material. 150.00$      -$            

11.12 Charge for installing twin 50' hose, Hydraulic hose 
reel with 4 way roller and selector valve. 1,590.00$   -$            

11.13 Hydraulic/pnumatic operated tools,  post pounder, 
post Pullers and chipping hammers. No bid

11.14 Front bumper, frame extension, with sign post holder, 
3/16 " Aluminum tread plate work surface. 995.00$      -$            

11.15 Charge for strobe lights in Specification 1.28 & 1.29 No Bid
11.16 Charge for second expanded metal basket on curb 

side as in Specidication 1.12 840.00$      -$            
11.17 Price for Braden Winch Per Specification 3.32 No Bid
11.18 3/8 x 50'  air hose reel plumbed & installed on body 405.00$      -$            
11.19 1/2 x 50'  air hose reel plumbed & installed on body 405.00$      -$            
11.20 3/4 x 50'  air hose reel plumbed & installed on body 950.00$      -$            
11.21 Water separator and oiler with a 1/2inch inlet 195.00$      -$            
11.22 Water separator and oiler with a ¾ inch inlet 445.00$      -$            
11.23 Whelen L31HAF warning lights installed per Spec 1,525.00$   -$            
11.24 Whelen 2FA00ZAR installed per spec 535.00$      -$            
11.25 Whelen 2EA00ZAR warning lights per Spec 535.00$      -$            
11.26 Go Light model 2020 per spec 9.42 390.00$      -$            
11.27 Moon roof vent per spec 9.36 1,935.00$   -$            
11.28 Slide out for welder per spec 9.44 1,460.00$   -$            
11.29 Windowless door option per spec 9.23 (177.00)$     -$            
11.30 Rollup rear door per Spec 9.23 3,150.00$   -$            
11.31 Lift gate per spec 9.25 & 9.46  $   6,725.00 -$            
11.32 Backup Camers per spec 1.8 165.00$      -$            
11.33 Rostra Bullet camera compatible to OEM System, 

installed  $      300.00 
11.34 48"x24"x3/4" Groved Sign holder Plastic (each) 525.00$      
11.35 48"x6"x3/4" Slotted Sign holder Plastic (each) 200.00$      
11.36 Liftwise PPF-203 10,000# Hydraulic Post Puller with 

12V electric pump 5,395.00$   
11.37 Liftwise PPF-295 30,000# Heavy Duty Hydraulic Post 

Puller (Less Hydraulics)  requires 17500 GVWR 
Chassis or Larger 6,425.00$   

11.38 PPJ-205 Jaw set 875.00$      
11.39 Installation of Liftwise Post puller PPF203 1,065.00$   
11.40 Installtion of Liftwise Post Puller PPF295 1,655.00$   



12.0
12.1 DELIVERY STARTING POINT - City, State, Zip Moorhead MN 56560

Delivery Time Frame in calendar days ARO 120-240

13.0 DISCOUNT OFF LIST PRICE FOR RELATED 
PARTS AND ACCESSORIES 2% 2% 0.00$          

14.0 Equipment Inspection and Repair per Hour
14.1 Rate for Mechanical Work per hour 110.00$      
14.2 Rate for Body Work per hour 110.00$      

Price List Date and Number #######

Total 0.00$          

DELIVERY CHARGES


	Custom Bodies

