STATE OF MINNESOTA
PRICING PAGE ) )
Price quote for: Custom Steel and / or Aluminum Fabricated Truck Bodies

vendorname:  Aspen Equipment Co.

contact Person: ~ Mark Lundeen

Street Address: 9150 PI"SbUI’y Ave South

P.O. Box:

city, state, zip  Bloomington, MN 55420

Phone #: 952-888-2525 Toll Free #:  800-888-7671

Fax #: 952-656-7159

Email Address: Mlundeen@aspeneq.com

Custom Steel and/or Aluminum Fabricated Truck Bodies

Body Version 1

Steel
Body Manufacture|Dakota Body

Primer Applaction Method (Dipped, Other) Explain|Sprayed

Aluminum
Body Manufacture NOT BID

Body Version 2 Aluminum
Body Manufacture|Dakota Body

Body Version 3 Steel
Body Manufacture|Dakota Body

Primer Applaction Method (Dipped, Other) Explain Sprayed

Body Version 4 Not used this contract
Body Version 5 Not used this contract
Body Version 6 Not used this contract

Body Version 7 Steel
Body Manufacture|Dakota Body

Primer Applaction Method (Dipped, Other) Explain Sprayed

Body Version 8 Steel
Body Manufacture|Dakota Body

Primer Applaction Method (Dipped, Other) Explain|Sprayed

Body Version 9 Steel
Body Manufacture|Dakota Body

Primer Applaction Method (Dipped, Other) Explain|Sprayed

Body Version 10 Not used this contract

Front Deck
Per Spec No Bid

1.0 Body version 1
1.0 Body version 1 per Specification 1.0 made in steel $50,605.00 | $ -

1.1 Body Version 1 per Specification 1.0 made in aluminum $57,927.00 | $ -

2.0 Body version 2
2.1 Body Version 2 as per Specification 2.0 ‘ $46,064.00 | $ -

3.0 Body Version 3
3.1 Body Version 3.0 per Specification 3.0 ‘ $66,347.00 | $ -

4.0 Body Version 4 Not used this contract
5.0 Body Version 5 Not used this contract
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Body Version 6 Not used this contract

Body Version 7

Body version 7 Made of steel per Specification 7.0 \ $35,972.00 | $
Body Version 8
Body version 8 Made of steel per Specification 8.0 | $36,460.00 | $
Body Version 9
Body version 9 per Specification 9.0 | $49,463.00 | $
Body Version 10 Not used this contract
Front Deck NO BID
Per Specification 11.0 NO BID
Per Specification 11.0 with 15 foot total extension NO BID
[é)ﬂtrihgns for Bodys 1 through 9

Se this section for adding optional body items,such as renmovable containment tems, ladder boxes,
Stake poctet doors,
Price for adding dimensions DUI 12/3000 inverter. $ 3,354.00 | $
Price for adding cab mounted GFI duplex receptacle. $ 59300 %
Price for 50" 12-3 electric cord reel with plug end, installed. L5550 123 3A $ 77800 %
Price for 50' 14-3 electric reel with light, installed L4050 A 163 5 $ 1,074.00 | $
Price for cab mounted 12 volt power port, installed $ 188.00 | $
Price for installing rope style lights in cabinets on 3 sides of doors $ 1,491.00 | $
Price for installing Betts 32-5001 3 wire par 36 12v work light. $ 41100 | $
Price for installing K&H industries model 475-20 remote control flood light $ 777.00 (%
Price for installing additional loop or pool style hand rail at rear of body. $ 14000 | $
Price for switching deck material to 3/16" smooth surface & coating it with thick
layer of Vortex traction material including 6" up back side of compartments. $ 1,290.00 | $
Price for switch top of step bumper to 3/16" Smooth surface & coating it with thick
layer of Vortex material. $ 64500 | $
Price for installing twin 50" hose, Hydraulic hose reel with 4 way roller and selector
valve. $ 3,874.00 | $
Hydraulic/pnumatic operated tools, post pounder, post Pullers and chipping hammers. NO BID $
Front bumper, frame extension, sign post holder, 3/16 " Aluminum tread plate work
surface. $ 1,800.00 | $
Price for strobe lights in Specification. $ 2,876.00 | $
Price for second expanded metal basket on curbside as in Specification. $ 1,107.00 | $
Price for Braden Winch Per Specification. $11,625.00 | $
Reel Craft 3/8" X 50 Ft. spring retract air reel $ 73400 (%
Reel Craft 1/2" X 35 Ft. spring retract air reel $ 70400 (S
Reel Craft 3/4" X 50 Ft.spring retract air reel $ 1,194.00 | $
Water separator and oiler with a 1/2 inch inlet. $ 42300 %
Water separator and oiler with a 3/4 inch inle. $ 573.00|%
Whelen L31LAF Warning Lights installed per Spec. $ 62500 $
Whelen 2FAO0ZAR installed per Spec. $ 31300 %
Whelen 2EA00ZAR warning lights per Spec. $ 313.00 (%
Go Light Model 2020GT per Spec. $ 664.00 [$
Moon roof vent per Spec. $ 90200 | $
Slide out for welder per Spec. $ 1,354.00 | $
Windowless Door option per Spec. $ (105.00)| $
Rollup rear door per Spec 9.23 NO BID $
Lift gate per spec 9.25 & 9.46 NO BID $
Backup Camers per spec 1.8 NO BID $
Body Version 1 per Specification 1.0 made in aluminum, adder $ 7,322.00 | $
Body Version 1 Roll up roors ILO standard curbside $ 1,027.00 | $
Body Version 1 Wheel well area steps $ 45700 $
Body Version 1 24" deep rear bumper ILO standard $ 57.00 [ $
Body Version 1 Traffic cone holder, 3/4" round, 36" tall, each $ 11100 (%
Body Version 1 Over size post "Goal Post Rack" storage, above CS tool boxes $ 14400 $
Body Version 1 LED Rope lighting, per compartment $ 259.00 %
Body Version 1 94" x 16" grip strut pullout walkway $ 2,866.00 [ $
Protech tool box, 24" x 24" x 24" with 2 drawer modual, UB rear CS or SS mount $ 2,415.00 [ $
Body Version 2 Roll up doors ILO standard $ 7,482.00 [ $
Body Version 3 Curb-Side #2 Air, Cord, Oxy/Acy reels and accessories $ 3,667.00 | $
Body Version 3 Vmac 12v Aftercooler plumbed and installed $ 1,623.00 | $
Body Version 3 Aluminum construction ILO steel $ 6,646.00 | $
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Body Version 3 Roll up doors ILO standard $ 9,510.00 | $
Two Poly outrigger pads (24"x24") for Body #2 $ 64200 (%
Body Version 7 Towing bumper, brake control, socket and hitch for Body #7 $ 1,417.00 | $
Body Version 7 Oxy/Acy hose reel installed $ 2,838.00 | $
Body Version 7 Roll up doors, SS # 1 & 2, CS rear ILO standard, add $ 1,909.00 | $
Body Version 8 Adder For Alum. Construction w/Rollup doors HCSD $ 9,255.00 | $
Body Version 8 Towing bumper, brake control, socket and hitch for Body #2 $ 1,411.00 | $
Body Version 8 Roll up doors ILO standard $ 2,608.00 | $
Body Version 8 Front mounted oversize sign storage with retainer $ 343.00( %
Body Version 8 Oxy/Acy hose reel installed $ 868.00 9%
Body Version 8 Whelen Warning light option (2) L32HAF Front, (2) 2EAO0ZAR
Rear $ 2,196.00 | $
Body Version 8 Hydraulic hose reel, 50ft. 1/2"(2) hydraulic hose $ 1,769.00 | $
Body Version 8 Van Tech 12V Hydraulic oil cooler with Thermal bypass valve $ 1,348.00 | $
Body Version 8 Two Poly outrigger pads (24"x24") for Body #2 $ 865.00 (9%
Body Version 8 6000 Ibs. crane compartment as standard $ - $
American Eagle (Stellar) 8 Drawer toolbox $ 2,225.00 | $
Body Version 9 Roll up doors ILO standard $ 4,831.00 | $
Body Version 9 Aluminum construction ILO standard $ 6,613.00 | $
Reel Craft 1/2" X 50 Ft. spring retract air reel $ 819.00 %
Reelcraft 100" x 3/4" Spring Retract air reel $ 1,207.00 | $
Shaver Model 3400 Hydraulic Post Pounder $ 3,341.00 | $
Bimis Model PPFHD295 Front Mounted Hydraulic Post Puller $ 8,695.00 | $
Install Electric Cord Reel $ 37100 (9%
Install Air Hose Reel $ 37100 (9%
Install Acc / O2 hose reel includes required fttings $ 49300 $
DELIVERY PRICES
DELIVERY STARTING POINT - City, State, Zip B, Mg
Delivery Time Frame in Calendar days ARO
DISCOUNT OFF LIST PRICE FOR RELATED PARTS AND ACCESSORIES -
(See Special Terms and Conditions) % Discount 0%]| $
Equipment Inspection and Repair per hour
Rate for Mechanical Work per hour 116 $
Rate for Body Work per hour 116[ $
Price List Date and Number NA
Total $
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