
T-628(5)
TRACTORS, AG TYPE and ATTACHMENTS
#422-1118

AGRICULTURAL TYPE TRACTORS AND ATTACHMENTS
DISCOUNT OFF LIST
SPECIFICATION 3.0

November, 2019

Vendor Name:
Contact Person:
Street Address:
P.O. Box:
City, State, Zip
Phone #:
Toll Free #:
Email Address: seth@welters.net

Spec. Number Information Requested Answer

3.1 MANUFACTURER Case IH

3.2 DATE AND ID. OF PRICE LIST PL-100 FA Rev 5 Jan.2,2020

3.3 CATALOG SECTION TITLE Farmall A Series 55A,65A,75A CAB

3.4 PERCENTAGE DISCOUNT FROM PRICE LIST 14%

3.5 DISCOUNT OFF LIST PRICE FOR RELATED PARTS  & ACCESSORIES 
 (See Special Terms and Conditions) NO BID

3.6 PRICE FOR MANUALS (1 operator's manual included at no cost, per specs)
SERVICE MANUAL

Digital $150.00
Paper $750.00

PARTS MANUAL 
Digital Free on Line
Paper N/A

PRICE FOR ADDITIONAL OPERATIONS MANUAL 
Digital $100.00
Paper $250.00

3.7 PRICE FOR SET OF FLUID AND AIR FILTERS $500.00

3.8 STANDARD WARRANTY:  24 Month/2000 Hours

3.9 PERFORMANCE/EXTENDED WARRANTY OPTIONS
Offer performance/warranty options.  (Add additional lines if necessary.)
(Specify years, miles or hours extended term covers.)

______________________________________________ NO BID
______________________________________________ NO BID

3.10 INSTALLATION - PER HOUR  (Hourly Shop Rate) $119.00
Installation services may be requested on an "as needed" basis.
See Special Terms and Conditions

3.11 NEW EQUIPMENT RENTAL PROGRAM
If rental programs are available on the new equipment offered, with the option to purchase, list 
the hourly/weekly/monthly rental rate.  Indicate the percent of rental fee paid by the purchaser 
that will be applied to the purchase price.  See Solicitation Special Terms & Conditions.

Hourly Rental Rate: NO BID
Weekly Rental Rate:  NO BID
Monthly Rental Rate:  NO BID

Percent (%) of Rental Fee applied to purchase price:  NO BID

If the new rental equipment is purchased and finance
charges are applicable for the actual rental term only,
state the actual interest rate here:  ________________

3.12 VENDOR OWNED RENTAL RETURN OR DEMO EQUIPMENT PROGRAM
(See Special Terms and Conditions.)
DEDUCT cost per Used Hour from the original Contract Price NO BID

3.13 DELIVERY STARTING POINT -                                                   City, State, Zip Buffalo,Mn 55313
See Special Terms and Conditions - No flat rate allowed               $3.50 Per Loaded Mile

$250.00 Minimum

Buffalo,Mn<55313
763-682-2200
n/a

Trueman Welters
Seth Strehler
1600 Highway 55 east

mailto:seth@welters.net
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FARMALL 55A
US PRICE LIST

-T1NN  01

Standard Equipment

 ENGINE: restricted (dynamic) axle capacity
   5,291 lbs. (2400 kg)

 Farmall 55A unrestricted (static) axle capacity
 54 Gross Engine hp    Turning radius of 144 in.
 43 PTO hp @ 2300 rpm (3650mm) without brakes
 3 Cyl Turbocharged Engine
 179 cu in (2.9 L) Displacement   FRONT AXLE: (cont.)

  Track widths from 54 in. (1362 mm)
 Tier 4 B/Final Emissions Compliant: to 69 in. (1762 mm) with adjustable
   (CEGR + DOC) rims and axle
 Electronic Injection Bosch
   High-pressure Common Rail System   MFD: (Optional)
 Electric Engine Shutoff    Limited Slip
 Hand and Foot Throttle Controls   Electro-Hydraulic engagement standard
 Grid Heater Starting Aid   Adjustable Tread Width from 51.5 in.
 Powercore Dry Air Cleaner     to 79.4 in.
 Under Hood Muffler
 Vertical Exhaust   REAR AXLE:
 21.6 gal Fuel Tank   Flange Type

  Adjustable Tread Width 60.1 in.
 EXHAUST:     to 76.0 in.
   Under Hood Muffler with Vertical

Exhaust   TIRES:
  2WD:

 TRANSMISSION:   7.50-16 F-2 Front
 LH side steering column mounted   16.9X30 R-1 Rear
 Mechanical Shuttle
   8 Forward and 8 Reverse Speeds   MFD:

(4) Synchronized Gears    11.2x24 R1 Front
(2) Non-synchronized Ranges    16.9X30 R1 Rear
11 Inch Single Dry Disk Clutch
19 mph (30 KPH)   HYDRAULIC SYSTEM:

 Power Shuttle (Optional)   Open Center System
   12 Forward and 12 Reverse Sp.   Dual Gear Pumps

(4) Synchronized Gears     Implement Pump: 12.5 gpm (47.7 L)
(3) Non-Sunchronized Ranges     Steering Pump: 7.6 gpm (28.7 L)
(2) Clutches; (5) Wet Disk Plates     Total Flow: 20.1 gpm (76.4 L)
25 MPH (40KPH) (2) Open Center Remote Valves with

 Speed varies with tire selection Detent & Kickout on #2
 Hand Operated Park Brake

  PTO:
 FRONT AXLE:   Fully Independent
 2WD:   Flip-up PTO Shaft Guard
  Inverted "U" axle design   4WD power shuttle:
  6,614 lbs. (3000 kg) -540 RPM hydraulic wet clutch

-T1NN   01 051 000 02-JAN-201 of 34



FARMALL 55A
US PRICE LIST

-T1NN  01

Standard Equipment

-Electronic engagement
-Wet clutch   OPERATIVE PROTECTIVE STRUCTURE:

1-3/8 in. 6 splines     CAB MODELS
    ROPS protected, flat deck platform

with heat and air conditioning, tinted
windshield, retractable sun screen,

  (cont.)
 HITCH: front wiper and washer, two doors

3-point Category II with fixed lower with locks, two external mirrors,
 links openable side windows, hinged rear

and telescoping stabilizers window (fully opens), High Visibily
   4300 lbs. Lift Capacity at 24 inches roof panel (openable)
   Swinging Drawbar     Steering Wheel - adjustable tilt
   Mechanical Draft Control     Seat - Cloth covered with mechanical
   Upper Link Draft Sensing suspension, operator's presence

sensor, retractable seat belt, arm
 STEERING/BRAKES: rests
   Hydrostatic Power Steering     Suspended pedals
   Brakes- Hydraulic assist wet brakes     Radio ready (speakers and antenna)

    Instructor seat ready
 INSTRUMENTATION:
 Analog Instrumentation with warning   MISCELLANEOUS:
   lights for turn signals, high beam,     Pivoting Engine Hood
   work lights, side lights, rear PTO,     SMV Emblem, and Toolbox
   4WD, differential lock, low fuel,
   alternator, oil pressure, brake fluid,   WARRANTY:
   grid heater & hand brake   Case IH Standard Warranty Applies
 Gauges for fuel level, engine
   temperature and tachometer
 Digital Readout for PTO speed,   Tier 4 B/Final Emissions Compliant:
   ground speed, battery & hours

  L610 Front Loader, OPTIONAL
 ELECTRICAL:   STANDARD FEATURES:
(1) 840 cca Heavy-Duty Battery   Quick attach design(Skid

 120 amp Alternator    Steer or Euro style)
7-pin Outlet for trailer/implement lighting 4-Bar bucket linkage
and signals Bucket level indicator

 25 amp socket Parking stands
 12V power socket (cigarette lighter) Grill guard

(Not compatible with 2WD tractors)
 LIGHTING:

Front: (2) Halogen Headlights and   SPECIFICATIONS:
(2) cab mounted worklights   L610 NON SELF-LEVELING

Rear:  (2) cab mounted worklights   Maximum Lift Height @
Turn Signals/Flashers/Rear Lights   pivot pin: 132"

-T1NN   01 051 000 02-JAN-202 of 34



FARMALL 55A
US PRICE LIST

-T1NN  01

Standard Equipment

 Dump Clearance @ 45 deg: 99"   Maximum Lift Height @
 Digging Depth: 5"   pivot pin: 130"
 Lift Capacity @ 800mm: 1,828 LBS   Dump Clearance @ 45 deg: 97"
 Reach @ Max Lift Height @ 45 deg: 44"   Digging Depth: 6"
 Reach @ Ground Level: 84"   Lift Capacity @ 800mm: 3,153 LBS
 Bucket Rollback Angle: 42 degrees   Reach @ Max Lift Height @ 45 deg: 44"
 Bucket Dump Angle: 58 degrees   Reach @ Ground Level: 84"
 (Not compatible with 2WD tractors)   Bucket Rollback Angle: 42 degrees

  Bucket Dump Angle: 61 degrees
 L610 MECHANICAL SELF-LEVELING   (Not compatible with 2WD tractors)

-T1NN   01 051 000 02-JAN-203 of 34



FARMALL 55A
US PRICE LIST

-T1NN  01

Models

COMMERCIAL
MODEL

 VERSION  ENGINE POWER  TRACTION Weight Factory Data List Price

 FARMALL 55A
TRACTOR

 Cab  55 HP  2WD  6,173 LB  9024852P36            $31,862.00

 FARMALL 55A
TRACTOR

 Cab  55 HP  MFD  6,173 LB  9028904P46            $37,057.00

Factory Supplied Options

Order Code Description Weight Factory Data List Price
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FARMALL 55A
US PRICE LIST

-T1NN  01

  OPERATOR STRUCTURE

     OPERATOR STRUCTURE

          SD_T8500    SEAT

       338379  FABRIC W/ MECH SUSPE

  Standard equipment for cab

No Charge

       342240  FABRIC W/AIR SUSPENS    9000401P70 $515.00

          SD_T9200    OPERATOR STRUCTURE #1

       333606  CAB FIX SCREEN OPEN No Charge

     RADIO

          SD_T9160    RADIO READY

       330777  Radio ready - for cab

  CAB only

No Charge

       342174  RADIO W/BLUETOOTH

  CAB only

   9000201P24 $258.00

     SEAT

          SD_T8520    INSTRUCTIONAL SEAT

       332865  INSTRUCTIONAL SEAT    9000292P50 $375.00

  ENGINE

     EXHAUST SYSTEMS

          SD_T1510    ENGINE EXHAUST

       390466  EXHAUST A PILLAR GS No Charge

       391151  Vertical Exhaust w/Guard No Charge

  TRANSMISSION

     TRANSMISSION

          SD_T2800    SPEED

       393280  30 KPH.

  8x8 (30KPH)

No Charge

       337280  40 KPH

  12x12 (40KPH)

   9001558P44 $1,998.00

          SD_T2810    TRANSMISSION

       759317  MECH SHUT.W/MECH PTO No Charge

       759318  POWER SHUT W/SERVO    9001621P62 $2,079.00
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FARMALL 55A
US PRICE LIST

-T1NN  01

          SD_T3230    CREEPER or Interlock

       391111  L/CREEP F/MEC TRANSM No Charge

       330112  CREEP 20+20 F/MEC TR    9000626P34 $803.00

  HITCH

          SD_T8130    3 POINT HITCH CONTROL

       391035  Less 3 Pt Hitch Ground Control No Charge

       332035  Mech 3 Pt Hitch Ground Control

  External Mechanical Rear Control for 3-Point Hitch

   9000195P00 $250.00

          SD_T8200    HITCH

       390831  Hitch w/Mech Top Link Draft Co

  (4,300 lbs/1,950 Kgs lift capacity) @ 24"

No Charge

       332785  MDC Hitch aux lift ram

  Hydraulic lift with 1 internal and 1 external lift cylinders

  (4,740 lbs/2,150 kgs lift capacity) @ 24"

   9000354P90 $455.00

          SD_T8960    DRAWBAR AND 3 POINT HITCH

       390259  FIX END LOWER LINKS. No Charge

       334316  FLEXIBLE ENDS    9000201P24 $258.00

  HYDRAULICS

     REAR REMOTE VALVES

          SD_T8270    REAR REMOTES

       335413  2 Rem. Valve (1 S/D No Charge

       335640  3 REMOTE VALVE    9000626P34 $803.00

     MID-MOUNT VALVES

          SD_T8280    MID-MOUNT VALVES

       390124  Less Mid-Mount No Charge

       336125  2Mid-Mount w/MecJoy L/CPL    9000968P76 $1,242.00

  PTO

          SD_T8010    PTO

       743565  540 RPM PTO No Charge

       743566  540/540E PTO    9000418P08 $536.00
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FARMALL 55A
US PRICE LIST

-T1NN  01

  FRONT WHEELS AND TIRES

          SD_T4940    FRONT WHEELS AND TIRES

       8199801  Non-Return Ship Wheels - 2WD  (900210P60) ($270.00)

       8111301  7.50-16 6PR

  For 2WD

No Charge

       8290904  12.5/80-18 10PR R4

  For MFD

  12.5/80 X 18 (R-4) Industrial

   9000290P16 $372.00

       8299801  Non-Return Ship Wheels - 4WD

  Shipping Wheels MFD

 (900595P14) ($763.00)

       8232304  11.2 x 24 6PR R1

  11.2X24 Ag Tread (R-1) Bias Ply

  For MFD

No Charge

       8225201  9.5L-15

  9.5L-15

  For 2WD

   9000113P88 $146.00

       8203401  12.4R20 A8

  12.4R20 Ag Tread (R-1W) Radial

  For MFD

   9000287P04 $368.00

  REAR WHEELS AND TIRES

          SD_T4950    REAR WHEELS AND TIRES

       8399801  Non-Returnable Shipping Wheel

  Shipping Wheels

 (901152P06)           ($1,477.00)

       8355304  16.9-30 6PR R1

  16.9X30 Ag Tread (R-1) Bias Ply

  For MFD

No Charge

       8391904  19.5L-24 10 PR R4

  19.5L X 24 (R-4) Industrial

   9000410P28 $526.00

       8352401  16.9R28 A8

  16.9R28 Ag Tread (R-1W) Radial

   9000450P84 $578.00

  FENDERS

          SD_T8740    FRONT FENDERS

       390860  Less Front Fenders No Charge

       744674  Dynamic Fenders    9000542P88 $696.00
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FARMALL 55A
US PRICE LIST

-T1NN  01

  LOADER

     LOADER EQUIPMENT

          SD_T8110    LOADER BRACKETS

       391489  Less Loader Bracket

  Does not include Loader Mounting Brackets or Loader.

No Charge

       344743  LOADER-NSL-2F-EU-WGG

  L610 NON Self Leveling Loader Euro Style Attach

  (Includes Grill Guard)

  Requires Mid-Mount Valve

  Bucket NOT included.

  A 72" bucket is AVAILABLE.

  Not allowed with Horizontal Exhaust

  (Not compatible with 2WD tractors)

   9005981P82 $7,669.00

       344739  LOADER-NSL.2F.SSLWGG

  L610 NON Self Leveling Loader with Skidsteer Style Quick Attach

  (Includes Grill Guard)

  Requires Mid-Mount Valve

  Bucket NOT included.

  A 72" bucket is AVAILABLE.

  Not allowed with Horizontal Exhaust

  (Not compatible with 2WD tractors)

   9005981P82 $7,669.00

       344742  LOADER-MSL-2F-EU-WGG

  L610 Self Leveling Loader Euro Style Attach

  (Includes Grill Guard)

  Requires Mid-Mount Valve

  Bucket NOT included.

  A 72" bucket is AVAILABLE.

  Not allowed with Horizontal Exhaust

  (Not compatible with 2WD tractors)

   9006838P26 $8,767.00

       344738  LOADER-MSL.2F.SSLWGG

  L610 Self Leveling Loader with Skidsteer Style Attach

  (Includes Grill Guard)

  Requires Mid-Mount Valve

  Bucket NOT included.

  A 72" bucket is AVAILABLE.

  Not allowed with Horizontal Exhaust

  (Not compatible with 2WD tractors)

   9006838P26 $8,767.00

  BUCKET

          SD_T8140    BUCKET

       XT8140X  Less Bucket No Charge

       336749  72" BUCKET EU T.A.    9000418P08 $536.00
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FARMALL 55A
US PRICE LIST

-T1NN  01

       336748  72" Bucket    9000418P08 $536.00

  OTHER EQUIPMENT

          SD_T2150    FRONT BALLAST

       390215  Less Front Carrier and Weights No Charge

       330183  FRONT WEIGHT 8X30KG    9000819P00 $1,050.00

          SD_T4961    REAR BALLAST

       XT4961X  Standard less rear ballast No Charge

       330470  4 x 110 lb Rear Wheel Weights    9000476P58 $611.00

-T1NN   01 051 000 02-JAN-2010 of 34



FARMALL 65A
US PRICE LIST

-T1NN  02

Standard Equipment

 ENGINE: restricted (dynamic) axle capacity
   5,291 lbs. (2400 kg)

 Farmall 65A unrestricted (static) axle capacity
 64 Gross Engine hp    Turning radius of 144 in.
 51 PTO hp @ 2300 rpm (3650mm) without brakes
 3 Cyl Turbocharged Engine
 179 cu in (2.9 L) Displacement   2WD: (Continued)

   Track widths from 54 in. (1362 mm)
 Tier B Emissions Compliant: to 69 in. (1762 mm) with adjustable
   (CEGR + DOC) rims and axle
 Electronic Injection Bosch
   High-pressure Common Rail System   MFD: (Optional)
 Electric Engine Shutoff    Limited Slip
 Hand and Foot Throttle Controls   Electro-Hydraulic engagement standard
 Grid Heater Starting Aid   Adjustable Tread Width from 51.5 in.
 Powercore Dry Air Cleaner     to 79.4 in.
 Under Hood Muffler
 Vertical Exhaust   REAR AXLE:
 21.6 gal Fuel Tank   Flange Type

  Adjustable Tread Width 60.1 in.
 EXHAUST:     to 76.0 in.
   Under Hood Muffler with Vertical

Exhaust   TIRES:
  2WD:

 TRANSMISSION:   7.50-16 F-2 Front
 LH side steering column mounted   16.9X30 R-1 Rear
 Mechanical Shuttle
    8 Forward and 8 Reverse Speeds   MFD:

(4) Synchronized Gears    11.2x24 R1 Front
(2) Non-Synchronized Ranges    16.9X30 R1 Rear
11 Inch Single Dry Disk Clutch
19 mph (30 KPH)   HYDRAULIC SYSTEM:

 Power Shuttle (Optional)   Open Center System
   12 Forward and 12 Revers Sp.   Dual Gear Pumps

(4) Synchronized Gears     Implement Pump: 12.5 gpm (47.7 L)
(3) Non-Synchronized Ranges     Steering Pump: 7.6 gpm (28.7 L)
(2) Clutches; (5) Wet Disk Plates     Total Flow: 20.1 gpm (76.4 L)
25 MPH (40KPH) (2) Open Center Remote Valves with

 Speed varies with tire selection Detent & Kickout on #2
 Hand Operated Park Brake

  PTO:
 FRONT AXLE:   Fully Independent
 2WD:   Flip-up PTO Shaft Guard
 Inverted "U" axle design   4WD power shuttle:
  6,614 lbs. (3000 kg) -540 RPM hydraulic wet clutch
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FARMALL 65A
US PRICE LIST

-T1NN  02

Standard Equipment

-Electronic engagement   OPERATIVE PROTECTIVE STRUCTURE:
-Wet clutch     CAB MODELS

1-3/8 in. 6 splines     ROPS protected, flat deck platform
with heat and air conditioning, tinted
windshield, retractable sun screen,

 HITCH:   CAB MODELS (continued)
3-point Category II with fixed lower front wiper and washer, two doors

 links with locks, two external mirrors,
and telescoping stabilizers openable side windows, hinged rear

   4300 lbs. Lift Capacity at 24 inches window (fully opens), High Visibily
   Swinging Drawbar roof panel (openable)
   Mechanical Draft Control     Steering Wheel - adjustable tilt
   Upper Link Draft Sensing     Seat - Cloth covered with mechanical

suspension, operator's presence
 STEERING/BRAKES: sensor, retractable seat belt, arm
   Hydrostatic Power Steering rests
   Brakes- Hydraulic assist wet brakes     Suspended pedals

    Radio ready (speakers and antenna)
 INSTRUMENTATION:     Instructor seat ready
 Analog Instrumentation with warning
   lights for turn signals, high beam,   MISCELLANEOUS:
   work lights, side lights, rear PTO,     Pivoting Engine Hood
   4WD, differential lock, low fuel,     SMV Emblem, and Toolbox
   alternator, oil pressure, brake fluid,
   grid heater & hand brake   WARRANTY:
 Gauges for fuel level, engine   Case IH Standard Warranty Applies
   temperature and tachometer
 Digital Readout for PTO speed,   Tier 4 B/Final Emissions Compliant:
   ground speed, battery & hours

  L610 Front Loader, OPTIONAL
 ELECTRICAL:   STANDARD FEATURES:
(1) 840 cca Heavy-Duty Battery   Quick attach design(Skid

 120 amp Alternator    Steer or Euro style)
7-pin Outlet for trailer/implement lighting 4-Bar bucket linkage
and signals Bucket level indicator

 25 amp socket Parking stands
 12V power socket (cigarette lighter) Grill guard

(Not compatible with 2WD tractors)
 LIGHTING:

Front: (2) Halogen Headlights and   SPECIFICATIONS:
(2) cab mounted worklights   L610 NON SELF-LEVELING

Rear:  (2) cab mounted worklights   Maximum Lift Height @
Turn Signals/Flashers/Rear Lights   pivot pin: 132"

  Dump Clearance @ 45 deg: 99"
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FARMALL 65A
US PRICE LIST

-T1NN  02

Standard Equipment

 Digging Depth: 5"   pivot pin: 130"
 Lift Capacity @ 800mm: 1,828 LBS   Dump Clearance @ 45 deg: 97"
 Reach @ Max Lift Height @ 45 deg: 44"   Digging Depth: 6"
 Reach @ Ground Level: 84"   Lift Capacity @ 800mm: 3,153 LBS
 Bucket Rollback Angle: 42 degrees   Reach @ Max Lift Height @ 45 deg: 44"
 Bucket Dump Angle: 58 degrees   Reach @ Ground Level: 84"
 (Not compatible with 2WD tractors)   Bucket Rollback Angle: 42 degrees

  Bucket Dump Angle: 61 degrees
 L610 MECHANICAL SELF-LEVELING   (Not compatible with 2WD tractors)
 Maximum Lift Height @

-T1NN   02 051 000 02-JAN-2013 of 34



FARMALL 65A
US PRICE LIST

-T1NN  02

Models

COMMERCIAL
MODEL

 VERSION  ENGINE POWER  TRACTION Weight Factory Data List Price

 FARMALL 65A
TRACTOR

 Cab  65 HP  2WD  6,239 LB  9026857P74            $34,433.00

 FARMALL 65A
TRACTOR

 Cab  65 HP  MFD  6,239 LB  9030909P84            $39,628.00

Factory Supplied Options

Order Code Description Weight Factory Data List Price
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FARMALL 65A
US PRICE LIST

-T1NN  02

  OPERATOR STRUCTURE

     OPERATOR STRUCTURE

          SD_T8500    SEAT

       338379  FABRIC W/ MECH SUSPE

  Standard equipment for cab

No Charge

       342240  FABRIC W/AIR SUSPENS    9000401P70 $515.00

          SD_T9200    OPERATOR STRUCTURE #1

       333606  CAB FIX SCREEN OPEN No Charge

     RADIO

          SD_T9160    RADIO READY

       330777  Radio ready - for cab

  CAB only

No Charge

       342174  RADIO W/BLUETOOTH

  CAB only

   9000201P24 $258.00

     SEAT

          SD_T8520    INSTRUCTIONAL SEAT

       332865  INSTRUCTIONAL SEAT    9000292P50 $375.00

  ENGINE

     EXHAUST SYSTEMS

          SD_T1510    ENGINE EXHAUST

       390466  EXHAUST A PILLAR GS No Charge

       391151  Vertical Exhaust w/Guard No Charge

  TRANSMISSION

     TRANSMISSION

          SD_T2800    SPEED

       393280  30 KPH.

  8x8 (30KPH)

No Charge

       337280  40 KPH

  12x12 (40KPH)

   9001558P44 $1,998.00

          SD_T2810    TRANSMISSION

       759317  MECH SHUT.W/MECH PTO No Charge

       759318  POWER SHUT W/SERVO    9001621P62 $2,079.00
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FARMALL 65A
US PRICE LIST
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          SD_T3230    CREEPER or Interlock

       391111  L/CREEP F/MEC TRANSM No Charge

       330112  CREEP 20+20 F/MEC TR    9000626P34 $803.00

  HITCH

          SD_T8130    3 POINT HITCH CONTROL

       391035  Less 3 Pt Hitch Ground Control No Charge

       332035  Mech 3 Pt Hitch Ground Control

  External Mechanical Rear Control for 3-Point Hitch

   9000195P00 $250.00

          SD_T8200    HITCH

       390831  Hitch w/Mech Top Link Draft Co

  (4,300 lbs/1,950 Kgs lift capacity) @ 24"

No Charge

       332785  MDC Hitch aux lift ram

  Hydraulic lift with 1 internal and 1 external lift cylinders

  (4,740 lbs/2,150 kgs lift capacity) @ 24"

   9000354P90 $455.00

          SD_T8960    DRAWBAR AND 3 POINT HITCH

       390259  FIX END LOWER LINKS. No Charge

       334316  FLEXIBLE ENDS    9000201P24 $258.00

  HYDRAULICS

     REAR REMOTE VALVES

          SD_T8270    REAR REMOTES

       335413  2 Rem. Valve (1 S/D No Charge

       335640  3 REMOTE VALVE    9000626P34 $803.00

     MID-MOUNT VALVES

          SD_T8280    MID-MOUNT VALVES

       390124  Less Mid-Mount No Charge

       336125  2Mid-Mount w/MecJoy L/CPL    9000968P76 $1,242.00

  PTO

          SD_T8010    PTO

       743565  540 RPM PTO No Charge

       743566  540/540E PTO    9000418P08 $536.00
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FARMALL 65A
US PRICE LIST
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  FRONT WHEELS AND TIRES

          SD_T4940    FRONT WHEELS AND TIRES

       8199801  Non-Return Ship Wheels - 2WD  (900210P60) ($270.00)

       8111301  7.50-16 6PR

  For 2WD

No Charge

       8290904  12.5/80-18 10PR R4

  For MFD

  12.5/80 X 18 (R-4) Industrial

   9000290P16 $372.00

       8299801  Non-Return Ship Wheels - 4WD

  Shipping Wheels MFD

 (900595P14) ($763.00)

       8232304  11.2 x 24 6PR R1

  11.2X24 Ag Tread (R-1) Bias Ply

  For MFD

No Charge

       8225201  9.5L-15

  9.5L-15

  For 2WD

   9000113P88 $146.00

       8203401  12.4R20 A8

  12.4R20 Ag Tread (R-1W) Radial

  For MFD

   9000287P04 $368.00

  REAR WHEELS AND TIRES

          SD_T4950    REAR WHEELS AND TIRES

       8399801  Non-Returnable Shipping Wheel

  Shipping Wheels

 (901152P06)           ($1,477.00)

       8355304  16.9-30 6PR R1

  16.9X30 Ag Tread (R-1) Bias Ply

  For MFD

No Charge

       8391904  19.5L-24 10 PR R4

  19.5L X 24 (R-4) Industrial

   9000410P28 $526.00

       8352401  16.9R28 A8

  16.9R28 Ag Tread (R-1W) Radial

   9000450P84 $578.00

  FENDERS

          SD_T8740    FRONT FENDERS

       390860  Less Front Fenders No Charge

       744674  Dynamic Fenders    9000542P88 $696.00
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  LOADER

     LOADER EQUIPMENT

          SD_T8110    LOADER BRACKETS

       391489  Less Loader Bracket

  Does not include Loader Mounting Brackets or Loader.

No Charge

       344743  LOADER-NSL-2F-EU-WGG

  L610 NON Self Leveling Loader Euro Style Attach

  (Includes Grill Guard)

  Requires Mid-Mount Valve

  Bucket NOT included.

  A 72" bucket is AVAILABLE.

  Not allowed with Horizontal Exhaust

  (Not compatible with 2WD tractors)

   9005981P82 $7,669.00

       344739  LOADER-NSL.2F.SSLWGG

  L610 NON Self Leveling Loader with Skidsteer Style Quick Attach

  (Includes Grill Guard)

  Requires Mid-Mount Valve

  Bucket NOT included.

  A 72" bucket is AVAILABLE.

  Not allowed with Horizontal Exhaust

  (Not compatible with 2WD tractors)

   9005981P82 $7,669.00

       344742  LOADER-MSL-2F-EU-WGG

  L610 Self Leveling Loader Euro Style Attach

  (Includes Grill Guard)

  Requires Mid-Mount Valve

  Bucket NOT included.

  A 72" bucket is AVAILABLE.

  Not allowed with Horizontal Exhaust

  (Not compatible with 2WD tractors)

   9006838P26 $8,767.00

       344738  LOADER-MSL.2F.SSLWGG

  L610 Self Leveling Loader with Skidsteer Style Attach

  (Includes Grill Guard)

  Requires Mid-Mount Valve

  Bucket NOT included.

  A 72" bucket is AVAILABLE.

  Not allowed with Horizontal Exhaust

  (Not compatible with 2WD tractors)

   9006838P26 $8,767.00

  BUCKET

          SD_T8140    BUCKET

       XT8140X  Less Bucket No Charge

       336749  72" BUCKET EU T.A.    9000418P08 $536.00
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       336748  72" Bucket    9000418P08 $536.00

  OTHER EQUIPMENT

          SD_T2150    FRONT BALLAST

       390215  Less Front Carrier and Weights No Charge

       330183  FRONT WEIGHT 8X30KG    9000819P00 $1,050.00

          SD_T4961    REAR BALLAST

       XT4961X  Standard less rear ballast No Charge

       330470  4 x 110 lb Rear Wheel Weights    9000476P58 $611.00
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Standard Equipment

 ENGINE: restricted (dynamic) axle capacity
   5,291 lbs. (2400 kg)

 Farmall 75A unrestricted (static) axle capacity
 74 Gross Engine hp    Turning radius of 144 in.
 60 PTO hp @ 2300 rpm (3650mm) without brakes
 3 Cyl Turbocharged Engine
 179 cu in (2.9 L) Displacement   2WD: (Continued)

   Track widths from 54 in. (1362 mm)
  Tier B Emissions Compliant: to 69 in. (1762 mm) with adjustable
   (CEGR + DOC) rims and axle
 Electronic Injection Bosch
   High-pressure Common Rail System   MFD: (Optional)
 Electric Engine Shutoff    Limited Slip
 Hand and Foot Throttle Controls   Electro-Hydraulic engagement standard
 Grid Heater Starting Aid   Adjustable Tread Width from 51.5 in.
 Powercore Dry Air Cleaner     to 79.4 in.
 Under Hood Muffler
 Vertical Exhaust   REAR AXLE:
 21.6 gal Fuel Tank   Flange Type

  Adjustable Tread Width 60.1 in.
 EXHAUST:     to 76.0 in.
   Under Hood Muffler with Vertical

Exhaust   TIRES:
  2WD:

 TRANSMISSION:   7.50-16 F-2 Front
 LH side steering column mounted   16.9X30 R-1 Rear
 Mechanical Shuttle
    8 Forward and 8 Reverse Speeds   MFD:

(4) Synchronized Gears    11.2x24 R1 Front
(2) Non-synchronized Ranges    16.9X30 R1 Rear
11 Inch Single Dry Disk Clutch
19 mph (30 KPH)   HYDRAULIC SYSTEM:

 Power Shuttle (Optional)   Open Center System
   12 Forward and 12 Reverse Sp.   Dual Gear Pumps

(4) Synchronized Gears     Implement Pump: 12.5 gpm (47.7 L)
(3) Non- Synchronized Ranges     Steering Pump: 7.6 gpm (28.7 L)
(2) Clutches; (5) Wet Disk Plates     Total Flow: 20.1 gpm (76.4 L)
25 MPH (40KPH) (2) Open Center Remote Valves with

 Speed varies with tire selection Detent & Kickout on #2
 Hand Operated Park Brake

  PTO:
 FRONT AXLE:   Fully Independent
 2WD:   Flip-up PTO Shaft Guard
 Inverted "U" axle design   4WD power shuttle:
  6,614 lbs. (3000 kg) -540 RPM hydraulic wet clutch
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Standard Equipment

-Electronic engagement   OPERATIVE PROTECTIVE STRUCTURE:
-Wet clutch     CAB MODELS

1-3/8 in. 6 splines     ROPS protected, flat deck platform
with heat and air conditioning, tinted
windshield, retractable sun screen,

 HITCH:   CAB MODELS (Continued)
3-point Category II with fixed lower front wiper and washer, two doors

 links with locks, two external mirrors,
and telescoping stabilizers openable side windows, hinged rear

   4300 lbs. Lift Capacity at 24 inches window (fully opens), High Visibily
   Swinging Drawbar roof panel (openable)
   Mechanical Draft Control     Steering Wheel - adjustable tilt
   Upper Link Draft Sensing     Seat - Cloth covered with mechanical

suspension, operator's presence
 STEERING/BRAKES: sensor, retractable seat belt, arm
   Hydrostatic Power Steering rests
   Brakes- Hydraulic assist wet brakes     Suspended pedals

    Radio ready (speakers and antenna)
 INSTRUMENTATION:     Instructor seat ready
 Analog Instrumentation with warning
   lights for turn signals, high beam,   NON-CAB MODELS
   work lights, side lights, rear PTO, 2-Post Foldable ROPS with ISO and
   4WD, differential lock, low fuel, mounted flat deck platform
   alternator, oil pressure, brake fluid,   Steering Wheel - adjustable tilt
   grid heater & hand brake   Seat - Vinyl covered with mechanical
 Gauges for fuel level, engine    suspension, operator's presence
   temperature and tachometer    sensor, retractable seat belts,
 Digital Readout for PTO speed,    arm rests
   ground speed, battery & hours   Suspended pedals

  Locking brake pedals
 ELECTRICAL:   No Instructor seat
(1) 840 cca Heavy-Duty Battery

 120 amp Alternator   MISCELLANEOUS:
7-pin Outlet for trailer/implement lighting     Pivoting Engine Hood

and signals     SMV Emblem, and Toolbox
 25 amp socket
 12V power socket (cigarette lighter)   WARRANTY:

  Case IH Standard Warranty Applies
 LIGHTING:

Front: (2) Halogen Headlights and
(2) cab mounted worklights

Rear:  (2) cab mounted worklights   Tier 4 B/Final Emissions Compliant:
Turn Signals/Flashers/Rear Lights

  L610 Front Loader, OPTIONAL
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Standard Equipment

 STANDARD FEATURES:   Reach @ Ground Level: 84"
 Quick attach design(Skid   Bucket Rollback Angle: 42 degrees
  Steer or Euro style)   Bucket Dump Angle: 58 degrees
4-Bar bucket linkage   (Not compatible with 2WD tractors)
Bucket level indicator
Parking stands   L610 MECHANICAL SELF-LEVELING
Grill guard   Maximum Lift Height @
(Not compatible with 2WD tractors)   pivot pin: 130"

  Dump Clearance @ 45 deg: 97"
 SPECIFICATIONS:   Digging Depth: 6"
 L610 NON SELF-LEVELING   Lift Capacity @ 800mm: 3,153 LBS
 Maximum Lift Height @   Reach @ Max Lift Height @ 45 deg: 44"
 pivot pin: 132"   Reach @ Ground Level: 84"
 Dump Clearance @ 45 deg: 99"   Bucket Rollback Angle: 42 degrees
 Digging Depth: 5"   Bucket Dump Angle: 61 degrees
 Lift Capacity @ 800mm: 1,828 LBS   (Not compatible with 2WD tractors)
 Reach @ Max Lift Height @ 45 deg: 44"
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Models

COMMERCIAL
MODEL

 VERSION  ENGINE POWER  TRACTION Weight Factory Data List Price

 FARMALL 75A
TRACTOR

 Rops  75 HP  2WD  6,173 LB  9022987P38            $29,471.00

 FARMALL 75A
TRACTOR

 Rops  75 HP  MFD  6,173 LB  9027039P48            $34,666.00

 FARMALL 75A
TRACTOR

 Cab  75 HP  2WD  6,173 LB  9028863P12            $37,004.00

 FARMALL 75A
TRACTOR

 Cab  75 HP  MFD  6,173 LB  9032915P22            $42,199.00

Factory Supplied Options

Order Code Description Weight Factory Data List Price

-T1NN   03 051 000 02-JAN-2024 of 34



FARMALL 75A
US PRICE LIST

-T1NN  03

  OPERATOR STRUCTURE

     OPERATOR STRUCTURE

          SD_T8500    SEAT

       338379  FABRIC W/ MECH SUSPE

  Standard equipment for cab

No Charge

       342240  FABRIC W/AIR SUSPENS    9000401P70 $515.00

          SD_T9200    OPERATOR STRUCTURE #1

       344781  2 POST FOLDABLE ROPS No Charge

       333606  CAB FIX SCREEN OPEN No Charge

       344764  CANOPY (FOPS)

  ROPS Only

   9000683P28 $876.00

     RADIO

          SD_T9160    RADIO READY

       XT9160X  Standard less radio ready

  ROPS only

No Charge

       330777  Radio ready - for cab

  CAB only

No Charge

       342174  RADIO W/BLUETOOTH

  CAB only

   9000201P24 $258.00

     SEAT

          SD_T8520    INSTRUCTIONAL SEAT

       390865  Less Instructional  Seat No Charge

       332865  INSTRUCTIONAL SEAT    9000292P50 $375.00

  ENGINE

     EXHAUST SYSTEMS

          SD_T1510    ENGINE EXHAUST

       330150  Horizontal exhaust w/ guard

  Non-cab only

  Not allowed with loaders

   9000120P90 $155.00

       390466  EXHAUST A PILLAR GS No Charge

       391151  Vertical Exhaust w/Guard No Charge
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  TRANSMISSION

     TRANSMISSION

          SD_T2800    SPEED

       393280  30 KPH.

  8x8 (30KPH)

No Charge

       337280  40 KPH

  12x12 (40KPH)

   9001558P44 $1,998.00

          SD_T2810    TRANSMISSION

       759317  MECH SHUT.W/MECH PTO No Charge

       759318  POWER SHUT W/SERVO    9001621P62 $2,079.00

          SD_T3230    CREEPER or Interlock

       391111  L/CREEP F/MEC TRANSM No Charge

       330112  CREEP 20+20 F/MEC TR    9000626P34 $803.00

  HITCH

          SD_T8130    3 POINT HITCH CONTROL

       391035  Less 3 Pt Hitch Ground Control No Charge

       332035  Mech 3 Pt Hitch Ground Control

  External Mechanical Rear Control for 3-Point Hitch

   9000195P00 $250.00

          SD_T8200    HITCH

       390831  Hitch w/Mech Top Link Draft Co

  (4,300 lbs/1,950 Kgs lift capacity) @ 24"

No Charge

       332785  MDC Hitch aux lift ram

  Hydraulic lift with 1 internal and 1 external lift cylinders

  (4,740 lbs/2,150 kgs lift capacity) @ 24"

   9000354P90 $455.00

          SD_T8960    DRAWBAR AND 3 POINT HITCH

       390259  FIX END LOWER LINKS. No Charge

       334316  FLEXIBLE ENDS    9000201P24 $258.00

  HYDRAULICS

     REAR REMOTE VALVES

          SD_T8270    REAR REMOTES

       335413  2 Rem. Valve (1 S/D No Charge

       335640  3 REMOTE VALVE    9000626P34 $803.00
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     MID-MOUNT VALVES

          SD_T8280    MID-MOUNT VALVES

       390124  Less Mid-Mount No Charge

       336125  2Mid-Mount w/MecJoy L/CPL    9000968P76 $1,242.00

  PTO

          SD_T8010    PTO

       743565  540 RPM PTO No Charge

       743566  540/540E PTO    9000418P08 $536.00

  FRONT WHEELS AND TIRES

          SD_T4940    FRONT WHEELS AND TIRES

       8199801  Non-Return Ship Wheels - 2WD  (900210P60) ($270.00)

       8111301  7.50-16 6PR

  For 2WD

No Charge

       8290904  12.5/80-18 10PR R4

  For MFD

  12.5/80 X 18 (R-4) Industrial

   9000290P16 $372.00

       8299801  Non-Return Ship Wheels - 4WD

  Shipping Wheels MFD

 (900595P14) ($763.00)

       8232304  11.2 x 24 6PR R1

  11.2X24 Ag Tread (R-1) Bias Ply

  For MFD

No Charge

       8225201  9.5L-15

  9.5L-15

  For 2WD

   9000113P88 $146.00

       8203401  12.4R20 A8

  12.4R20 Ag Tread (R-1W) Radial

  For MFD

   9000287P04 $368.00

  REAR WHEELS AND TIRES

          SD_T4950    REAR WHEELS AND TIRES

       8399801  Non-Returnable Shipping Wheel

  Shipping Wheels

 (901152P06)           ($1,477.00)

       8355304  16.9-30 6PR R1

  16.9X30 Ag Tread (R-1) Bias Ply

  For MFD

No Charge

       8391904  19.5L-24 10 PR R4

  19.5L X 24 (R-4) Industrial

   9000410P28 $526.00
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       8352401  16.9R28 A8

  16.9R28 Ag Tread (R-1W) Radial

   9000450P84 $578.00

  FENDERS

          SD_T8740    FRONT FENDERS

       390860  Less Front Fenders No Charge

       744674  Dynamic Fenders    9000542P88 $696.00

  LOADER

     LOADER EQUIPMENT

          SD_T8110    LOADER BRACKETS

       391489  Less Loader Bracket

  Does not include Loader Mounting Brackets or Loader.

No Charge

       344743  LOADER-NSL-2F-EU-WGG

  L610 NON Self Leveling Loader Euro Style Attach

  (Includes Grill Guard)

  Requires Mid-Mount Valve

  Bucket NOT included.

  A 72" bucket is AVAILABLE.

  Not allowed with Horizontal Exhaust

  (Not compatible with 2WD tractors)

   9005981P82 $7,669.00

       344739  LOADER-NSL.2F.SSLWGG

  L610 NON Self Leveling Loader with Skidsteer Style Quick Attach

  (Includes Grill Guard)

  Requires Mid-Mount Valve

  Bucket NOT included.

  A 72" bucket is AVAILABLE.

  Not allowed with Horizontal Exhaust

  (Not compatible with 2WD tractors)

   9005981P82 $7,669.00

       344742  LOADER-MSL-2F-EU-WGG

  L610 Self Leveling Loader Euro Style Attach

  (Includes Grill Guard)

  Requires Mid-Mount Valve

  Bucket NOT included.

  A 72" bucket is AVAILABLE.

  Not allowed with Horizontal Exhaust

  (Not compatible with 2WD tractors)

   9006838P26 $8,767.00
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       344738  LOADER-MSL.2F.SSLWGG

  L610 Self Leveling Loader with Skidsteer Style Attach

  (Includes Grill Guard)

  Requires Mid-Mount Valve

  Bucket NOT included.

  A 72" bucket is AVAILABLE.

  Not allowed with Horizontal Exhaust

  (Not compatible with 2WD tractors)

   9006838P26 $8,767.00

  BUCKET

          SD_T8140    BUCKET

       XT8140X  Less Bucket No Charge

       336749  72" BUCKET EU T.A.    9000418P08 $536.00

       336748  72" Bucket    9000418P08 $536.00

  OTHER EQUIPMENT

          SD_T2150    FRONT BALLAST

       390215  Less Front Carrier and Weights No Charge

       330183  FRONT WEIGHT 8X30KG    9000819P00 $1,050.00

          SD_T4961    REAR BALLAST

       XT4961X  Standard less rear ballast No Charge

       330470  4 x 110 lb Rear Wheel Weights    9000476P58 $611.00
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