T-628(5)

TRACTORS, AG TYPE and ATTACHMENTS

#422-1118

Vendor Name:
Contact Person:
Street Address:
P.O. Box:

City, State, Zip
Phone #:

Toll Free #:
Email Address:

AGRICULTURAL TYPE TRACTORS AND ATTACHMENTS
DISCOUNT OFF LIST
SPECIFICATION 3.0

Trueman Welters Inc

November, 2019

Seth Strehler

1600 Highway 55 east

Buffalo,Mn<55313

763-682-2200

n/a

seth@welters.net

Spec. Number Information Requested Answer
3.1 MANUFACTURER New Holland
3.2 DATE AND ID. OF PRICE LIST Oct 9 2019 No 19-56a
3.3 CATALOG SECTION TITLE WorkMaster 95 105 120
3.4 PERCENTAGE DISCOUNT FROM PRICE LIST 14%
3.5 DISCOUNT OFF LIST PRICE FOR RELATED PARTS & ACCESSORIES
(See Special Terms and Conditions) 0.0%
3.6 PRICE FOR MANUALS (1 operator's manual included at no cost, per specs)
SERVICE MANUAL
Digital $ 150.00
Paper $ 450.00
PARTS MANUAL
Digital free online
Paper n/a
PRICE FOR ADDITIONAL OPERATIONS MANUAL
Digital $ 100.00
Paper $ 150.00
3.7 PRICE FOR SET OF FLUID AND AIR FILTERS $750.00
3.8 STANDARD WARRANTY: 12 month / 2000 hours
3.9 PERFORMANCE/EXTENDED WARRANTY OPTIONS
Offer performance/warranty options. (Add additional lines if necessary.)
(Specify years, miles or hours extended term covers.)
n/a
$
3.10 INSTALLATION - PER HOUR (Hourly Shop Rate) $119.00
Installation services may be requested on an "as needed" basis.
See Special Terms and Conditions
3.11 NEW EQUIPMENT RENTAL PROGRAM
If rental programs are available on the new equipment offered, with the option to purchase, list
the hourly/weekly/monthly rental rate. Indicate the percent of rental fee paid by the purchaser
that will be applied to the purchase price. See Solicitation Special Terms & Conditions.
Hourly Rental Rate: no bid
Weekly Rental Rate: no bid
Monthly Rental Rate: no bid
Percent (%) of Rental Fee applied to purchase price: no bid
If the new rental equipment is purchased and finance
charges are applicable for the actual rental term only,
state the actual interest rate here:
3.12 VENDOR OWNED RENTAL RETURN OR DEMO EQUIPMENT PROGRAM
(See Special Terms and Conditions.)
DEDUCT cost per Used Hour from the original Contract Price No Bid
3.13 DELIVERY STARTING POINT - City, State, Zip Buffalo,Mn <55313
See Special Terms and Conditions - No flat rate allowed 3.50 per mile
Minimum Delivery Charge $250.00
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Y% NEW HOLLAND

WORKMASTER™ Series Tractor Index

EQUIPMENT DESCRIPTION

Index

Models
WORKMASTER 95, 105, 120 STANDARD CAB

WORKMASTER 95, 105, 120 A LA CARTE CAB

WORKMASTER 95, 105, 120 STANDARD ROPS

WORKMASTER 95, 105, 120 POULTRY NSL/NO LOADER

WORKMASTER 95, 105, 120 LOW PROFILE ALL PURPOSE

WORKMASTER 95, 105, 120 ROPS MOWING

WORKMASTER 95, 105, 120 A LA CARTE ROPS

TIRE CHART
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Y% NEW HOLLAND

-T1LA 03

WORKMASTER 95-120 A LA CARTE CAB
US PRICE LIST

Standard Equipment

KEY SELLI NG PO NTS:

- Best-in-Cass value cab

- Instructor seat

- Air suspensions seat

- 12x12 power shuttle transm ssion
- Lift-O-Matic

- Factory installed | oader

Wor kimast er 95

97 Gross Engine hp

78 PTO hp @2300 rpm

4 Cyl Turbocharged Engi ne
207cu in (3.4 L) D splacenent

Wor kmast er 105

112 Gross Engine hp

92 PTO hp @2300 rpm

4 Cyl Turbocharged Engine
207cu in (3.4 L) D splacenent

Wor kmaster 120

120 Gross Engine hp

100 PTO hp @ 2300 rpm

4 Cyl Turbocharged Engine
207cu in (3.4 L) D splacenent

ALL MODELS:
Tier B Em ssions Conpliant:
(CEGR + SCR + CUQ)
El ectronic Injection Bosch
H gh- pressure Conmon Rail System
El ectric Engi ne Shut of f
Hand and Foot Throttle Controls
Gid Heater Starting Ad
Powercore Dry Air C eaner
Under Hood Muffler
Vertical Exhaust
29 gal Fuel Tank
2.9 gal DEF Tank
2 function mid mount valve & joystick
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TRANSM SSI ON:
LH side steering col um nounted
Power Shuttle
12 Forward and 12 Reverse Speeds
Creeper ready
(4) Synchronized Gears
(3) Non-synchroni zed Ranges
(2) clutches, 5 wet disc plates
FWD - 19 nph (30 KPH)
Speed varies with tire selection
Hand Operated Park Brake

STEERI NG BRAKES:
Hydrostatic Power Steering
Brakes- Hydraulically assisted wet disc

4AVD FRONT AXLE:

Limted Slip

El ectro- Hydraul i ¢ engagenment standard
Tread Wdth: 63.8 in. to 72.9 in.

REAR AXLE
Fl ange Type
Tread Wdth: 63.9 in. to 79.7 in.

HYDRAULI C SYSTEM

Open Center System

Dual Gear Punps
I mpl erent Punp: 16.9 gpm (64 L)
Steering Punp: 9.7 gpm (37 L)
Total Flow 26.6 gpm (101 L)

(2) Open Center Rempte Valves with
Detent & Kickout on #2 &
Fl oat on #1

REAR DI FFERENTI AL LOCK:
Mechani cal | y Engaged

PTO

Ful | y I ndependent

Flip-up PTO Shaft Guard

540 RPM hydraulic wet clutch
El ect roni ¢ engagenent

1-3/8 in. 6 splines

-T1LA 03 0035 000 01-JAN-20



S? NEW HOLLAND -T1LA 03

AGRICULTURE

WORKMASTER 95-120 A LA CARTE CAB
US PRICE LIST

Standard Equipment

3-PO NT LI FT SYSTEM
Ri ght hand consol e nount ed

| ever control
Mechani cal Draft Control
3,200 Pounds Lift Capacity
Category I/11 Conbi Ball Ends
Tel escopic Stabilizers
Fl exi bl e Lower Link Ends

ELECTRI CAL:
(1) 900 cca Heavy-Duty Battery
120 anp Al ternator

7-pin Qutlet for trailer/inplenent Iighting

and signal s
30 anmp power plug
12V power socket (cigarette lighter)

| NSTRUMVENTATI ON:
Digital /Analog Instrunentation with
warning lights for turn signals, high
beam work lights, side lights,
rear PTO, 4WD, differential |ock,
|l ow fuel, alternator, oil pressure,
brake fluid, grid heater & hand brake
Gauges for fuel |evel, engine
tenperature and tachoneter
Di gital Readout for PTO speed,
ground speed, battery, hours &
DEF | evel percentage

LI GHTI NG
Front: (2) Hal ogen Headlights

(2) cab mounted worklights
Rear: (2) cab nounted worklights
Turn Signal s/ Fl ashers/ Rear Lights

Tl RES:
12. 4x24 R1 Front
18. 4X30 R1 Rear
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OPERATOR PROTECTI VE STRUCTURE:

CAB MODELS

ROPS protected, 4 post, flat deck
platformw th heat and air
condi tioning, tinted w ndshield,
retractabl e sun screen, front w per
and washer, rear w per and washer,
two doors with | ocks, two external
mrrors, hinged rear wi ndow (opens
conpl etely)

Steering Weel - adjustable tilt

Seat - Cloth covered air suspension,
operator's presence sensor,
retractabl e seat belt and armrests

Instructor Seat

Suspended pedal s

Radi o, speakers, and antenna

M SCELLANEQUS:

Pi voti ng Engi ne Hood
SW Enbl em

Tool box

WARRANTY:
New Hol I and Standard Warranty Applies

LOADER:

632TL NON SELF- LEVELI NG
Maxi mum Li ft Hei ght @
pi vot pin: 134.5"
Dunp Cl earance @45 deg: 98.4"
Di ggi ng Depth: 5.1"
Lift Capacity @800mm 2,028 LBS
Br eakout Force @800mm 3,102 LBS
Reach @ Max Lift Height @45
deg: 37.8"
Reach @ Ground Level: 87.4"
Bucket Rol | back Angle: 40 degrees
Bucket Dunp Angl e: 53 degrees
Skid Steer style bucket attach
84" bucket
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Y% NEW HOLLAND

AGRICULTURE

-T1LA 03

WORKMASTER 95-120 A LA CARTE CAB

US PRICE LIST
Models
COMMERCIAL VERSION TRACTION Weight Factory Data List Price
MODEL
WORKMASTER 95 Cab MFD 6,768 LB 9058106P10 $74,495.00
TIER4
WORKMASTER 105 | Cab MFD 7,936 LB| 9060368P10 $77,395.00
TIER4
WORKMASTER 120 | Cab MFD 7,253 LB 9063176P10 $80,995.00
TIER4
Factory Supplied Options
| Order Code Description | Weight | Factory Data List Price |
| OPERATOR PLATFORM |
SD 79200 OPERATOR STRUCTURE #1
Cab
762204 HVAC CAB 2 REMOTE PS No Charge
Cab with TWO rear remotes includes:
- Blacked out vent panel
- 2 rear view mirrors
- Air suspension seat
- Bluetooth radio
- Rear wiper/wwasher
- 12x12 powershuttle transmission
762205 HVAC CAB 3 REMOTE PS 9000624P00 $800.00

Cab with THREE rear remotes includes:
- Blacked out vent panel

- 2 rear view mirrors

- Air suspension seat

- Bluetooth radio

- Rear wiper/wwasher

- 12x12 powershuttle transmission

DELAYED OPTION WILL NOT BE AVAILABLE UNTIL
MID 2020 AT THE EARLIEST
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S'ﬁ NEW HOLLAND -T1LA 03

AGRICULTURE

WORKMASTER 95-120 A LA CARTE CAB
US PRICE LIST

| TIRES

[ FRONT

SD_T4940 FRONT WHEELS AND TIRES

AWD Front Tires - Ag

8220701 | 11.2-24 (900046P80) ($60.00)
Requires 16.9-30 rear tires

8230506 | FRONT 12.4-24 No Charge
Requires 18.4-30 rear tires

8230505 | 13.6 -24 9000171P60 $220.00

Requires 16.9-34 rear tires

4WD Front Tires - Ind

8230503 | FRONT 12.5-18 9000546P00 $700.00
Requires 19.5L-24 rear tires

REAR

SD_T4950 REAR WHEELS AND TIRES

Rear tires - Ag

8930602 | REAR 16.9 - 30 9000234P00 $300.00
Requires 11.2-24 4WD front or 7.50-16 2WD front

8930605 | REAR 18.4 - 30 No Charge
Requires 12.4-24 4WD front or 10.0-16 2WD front

8930601 | REAR 16.9 - 34 (900109P20) ($140.00)

Requires 13.6-24 4WD front or 10.0-16 2WD front

Rear tires - Ind

8930603 | REAR 19.5-24 9000487P50 $625.00
Requires 12.5/80-18 4WD front tires

| LoADER

| LoADER

SD_T8110 LOADER BRACKETS

345324 | L/ LOADER FOR MMV (905070P00) ($6,500.00)
Mid Mount Valve and Joystick ONLY.
343422 | LOADER READY 343422 (901154P40) ($1,480.00)

Complete loader ready includes:

- Horizontal and Vertical TPS loader brackets

- 2 function mid mount valve and joystick

- Hoses from mid mount valve to vertical bracket
- Grill guard

762057 | TL632 FULL NS762057 No Charge
632TL Non self leveling loader with 84" SSL Bucket

Page 9 of 36 -TILA 03 0035 000 01-JAN-20



Y% NEW HOLLAND

-T1LA 03

WORKMASTER 95-120 A LA CARTE CAB
US PRICE LIST

| pTO

[ REARPTO

SD_T8010 PTO

759271 [ 540 RPM W CAP No Charge
759272 [ 540-540E RPM W CAP 9000354P90 $455.00
759273 | 540-1000 RPM W CAP 9000413P40 $530.00
| WEIGHTS
[ FRONT WEIGHTS
SD_T2151 WEIGHT PACK
342070 | 110KgFCW/10X40-510kg 9000975P00 $1,250.00
Front carrier (154 Ibs) + 10 weights (88lbs each) = 1,034 Ibs
342069 | 110KgFC W/8X40-430kg 9000780P00 $1,000.00
Front carrier (154 Ibs) + 8 weights (88lbs each) = 858 Ibs
REAR WHEEL WEIGHTS
SD_T4960 WHEEL WEIGHTS
762028 | 2X550r32Kg EACH SIDE 9000491P40 $630.00
2 (110 Ib) rear weights per side = 220 Ibs total for all rear tires
sizes except 500/60-22.5
2 (70 1b) rear weights per side = 140 Ibs total for 500/60-22.5
rear tires
759650 | 4X550r32Kg EACH SIDE 9000982P80 $1,260.00
4 (110 Ib) rear weights per side = 440 Ibs total for all rear tires
sizes except 500/60-22.5
4 (70 Ib) rear weights per side = 280 Ibs total for 500/60-22.5
rear tires
OPERATOR'S MANUALS
SD_T9805 OPERATOR MANUAL (SE
342076 French (Canada) No Charge
342077 | Spanish No Charge
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Y% NEW HOLLAND

AGRICULTURE

-T1LA 04

WORKMASTER 95-120 STANDARD ROPS FASTPICK

US PRICE LIST

Standard Equipment

KEY SELLI NG PO NTS:

- Sem straddl e ROPS

- Air suspensions seat

- 12x12 power shuttle transm ssion
- Lift-OMtic

- Factory installed | oader

Wor knmast er 95

97 Gross Engine hp

78 PTO hp @2300 rpm

4 Cyl Turbocharged Engine
207cu in (3.4 L) D splacenent

Wor kmast er 105

112 Gross Engine hp

92 PTO hp @2300 rpm

4 Cyl Turbocharged Engi ne
207cu in (3.4 L) D splacenent

Wor kmast er 120

120 Gross Engine hp

100 PTO hp @ 2300 rpm

4 Cyl Turbocharged Engine
207cu in (3.4 L) D splacenent

ALL MODELS:
Tier B Em ssions Conpliant:
(CEGR + SCR + CUQ)
El ectronic Injection Bosch
H gh- pressure Conmmon Rail System
El ectric Engi ne Shutoff
Hand and Foot Throttle Controls
Gid Heater Starting Aid
Powercore Dry Air C eaner
Under Hood Muffler
Hori zontal Rearward Exhaust
24 gal Fuel Tank
2.9 gal DEF Tank
2 function md nmount valve & joystick
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TRANSM SSI ON:
LH side steering col um nounted
Power Shuttle

Creeper ready

12 Forward and 12 Reverse Speeds

(4) Synchronized Gears

(3) Non-synchroni zed Ranges

(2) clutches, 5 wet disc plates
FWD - 19 nph (30 KPH) speed nmay vary
Hand Operated Park Brake

STEERI NG BRAKES:
Hydrostatic Power Steering
Brakes- Hydraulically assisted wet disc

AWD FRONT AXLE:

Limted Slip

El ectro-Hydraul i ¢ engagenent standard
Tread Wdth: 66.5 in. to 72.9 in.

REAR AXLE
Fl ange Type
Tread Wdth: 63.8 in. to 79.5 in.

HYDRAULI C SYSTEM

Open Center System

Dual Gear Punps
I mpl enent Punp: 16.9 gpm (64 L)
Steering Punp: 9.7 gpm (37 L)
Total Flow 26.6 gpm (101 L)

(2) Open Center Renpte Valves with
Detent & Kickout on #2
Fl oat on #1

REAR DI FFERENTI AL LOCK:
Mechani cal | y Engaged

PTO

Ful Il y I ndependent

Flip-up PTO Shaft Guard

540 RPM hydraulic wet clutch
El ectroni ¢ engagenent

1-3/8 in. 6 splines

-T1LA 04 0035 000 01-JAN-20




Y% NEW HOLLAND

-T1LA 04

WORKMASTER 95-120 STANDARD ROPS FASTPICK
US PRICE LIST

Standard Equipment

3-PO NT LI FT SYSTEM
Ri ght hand consol e nount ed

| ever control
Mechani cal Draft Control
3,200 Pounds Lift Capacity
Category I/11 Conbi Ball Ends
Tel escopic Stabilizers
Fl exi bl e Lower Link Ends

ELECTRI CAL:

(1) 800 cca Heavy-Duty Battery

120 anp Al ternator

7-pin Qutlet for trailer/inplenment
and signal s

30 anmp power plug

12V power socket

lighting

(cigarette lighter)

| NSTRUMVENTATI ON:
Digital /Analog Instrunentation with
warning lights for turn signals, high
beam work lights, side lights,
rear PTO, 4WD, differential |ock,
|l ow fuel, alternator, oil pressure,
brake fluid, grid heater & hand brake
Gauges for fuel |evel, engine
tenperature and tachoneter
Di gital Readout for PTO speed,
ground speed, battery, hours &

DEF | evel percentage
LI GHTI NG
Front: (2) Hal ogen Headlights

Rear: (1) Right hand fender
nmount ed wor kl i ghts

Turn Signal s/ Fl ashers/ Rear Lights

TI RES:

12. 4x24 R1 Front

18. 4X30 Rl Rear

OPERATOR PROTECTI VE STRUCTURE:

ROPS MODELS

2- Post Fol dabl e ROPS with | SO
mounted flat deck platform

Steering Weel - adjustable tilt

Seat - Low profile air suspension seat,
operator's presence sensor, and
retractabl e seat belts

Suspended pedal s

Locki ng brake pedal s

M SCELLANECUS:

Pi voti ng Engi ne Hood
SW Enbl em

Tool box

WARRANTY:
New Hol I and Standard Warranty Applies

LOADER:

632TL NON SELF- LEVELI NG
Maxi mum Li ft Hei ght @
pi vot pin: 134.5"
Dunp C earance @45 deg: 98.4"
Di ggi ng Depth: 5.1"
Lift Capacity @800mm 2,028 LBS
Br eakout Force @800mm 3,102 LBS
Reach @ Max Lift Height @45
deg: 37.8"
Reach @ Ground Level : 87.4"
Bucket Rol | back Angle: 40 degrees
Bucket Dunmp Angl e: 53 degrees
Ski d Steer bucket attach
84" bucket
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Y% NEW HOLLAND

AGRICULTURE

-T1LA 04

WORKMASTER 95-120 STANDARD ROPS FASTPICK

US PRICE LIST
Models
COMMERCIAL VERSION TRACTION Weight Factory Data List Price
MODEL
WORKMASTER 95 Rops MFD 7,451 LB 9046694P70 $59,865.00
TIER4
WORKMASTER 105 | Rops MFD 7,451 LB 9048956P70 $62,765.00
TIER4
WORKMASTER 120 | Rops MFD 7,936 LB 9051764P70 $66,365.00
TIER4
Factory Supplied Options
| Order Code Description | Weight | Factory Data List Price |
| PACKAGE SELECTION |
SD_T9980 PACKAGING
XF9913X | Standard ROPS Fast Pick (902886P00) ($3,700.00)
ROPS Standard Fast Pick pricing includes:
2 rear remotes
632LA NSL loader with SSL quick attach and 84" bucket
Allows for choice of the following:
Tires:
18.4-30 R1 rear with 12.4-24 R1 front OR
16.4-34 R1 rear with 13.6-24 R1 front
PTO:
540 OR 540/1000 RPM
Rear weights:
4 rear wheel weights OR NO rear wheel weights
| TIRES |
[ FRONT |
SD _T4940 FRONT WHEELS AND TIRES
4WD Front Tires - Ag
No Charge

8230506 | FRONT 12.4-24
Requires 18.4-30 rear tires
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Y% NEW HOLLAND

-T1LA 04

WORKMASTER 95-120 STANDARD ROPS FASTPICK

US PRICE LIST
8230505 | 13.6 -24 9000171P60 $220.00
Requires 16.9-34 rear tires
REAR
SD_T4950 REAR WHEELS AND TIRES
Rear tires - Ag
8930605 | REAR 18.4 - 30 No Charge
Requires 12.4-24 4WD front or 10.0-16 2WD front
8930601 | REAR 16.9 - 34 (900109P20) ($140.00)
Requires 13.6-24 4WD front or 10.0-16 2WD front
| PTO
[ REARPTO
SD_T8010 PTO
759271 540 RPM W CAP No Charge
759273 540-1000 RPM W CAP 9000413P40 $530.00
| WEIGHTS
| REAR WHEEL WEIGHTS
SD_T4960 WHEEL WEIGHTS
762028 2X550r32Kg EACH SIDE 9000491P40 $630.00
2 (110 Ib) rear weights per side = 220 Ibs total for all rear tires
sizes except 500/60-22.5
2 (70 Ib) rear weights per side = 140 Ibs total for 500/60-22.5
rear tires
OPERATOR'S MANUALS
SD_T9805 OPERATOR MANUAL (SE
342076 French (Canada) No Charge
342077 | Spanish No Charge
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S? NEW HOLLAND -T1LA 06

AGRICULTURE

WORKMASTER 95-120 AP LOW PRO FAST PICK
US PRICE LIST

Standard Equipment

KEY SELLI NG PO NTS:

- Low profile sem straddl e ROPS

- Low profile air suspensions seat
- 12x12 power shuttle transm ssion
- Lift-OMtic

- Factory installed | oader

Wor knmast er 95

97 Gross Engine hp

78 PTO hp @2300 rpm

4 Cyl Turbocharged Engine
207cu in (3.4 L) D splacenent

Wor kmast er 105

112 Gross Engine hp

92 PTO hp @2300 rpm

4 Cyl Turbocharged Engi ne
207cu in (3.4 L) D splacenent

Wor kmast er 120

120 Gross Engine hp

100 PTO hp @ 2300 rpm

4 Cyl Turbocharged Engine
207cu in (3.4 L) D splacenent

ALL MODELS:
Tier B Em ssions Conpliant:
(CEGR + SCR + CUQ)
El ectronic Injection Bosch
H gh- pressure Conmmon Rail System
El ectric Engi ne Shutoff
Hand and Foot Throttle Controls
Gid Heater Starting Aid
Powercore Dry Air C eaner
Under Hood Muffler
Hori zontal Rearward Exhaust
24 gal Fuel Tank
2.9 gal DEF Tank
2 function md nmount valve & joystick
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TRANSM SSI ON:
LH side steering col um nounted
Power Shuttle

Creeper ready

12 Forward and 12 Reverse Speeds

(4) Synchronized Gears

(3) Non-synchroni zed Ranges

(2) clutches, 5 wet disc plates
FWD - 19 nph (30 KPH) speed nmay vary
Hand Operated Park Brake

STEERI NG BRAKES:
Hydrostatic Power Steering
Brakes- Hydraulically assisted wet disc

AWD FRONT AXLE:

Limted Slip

El ectro-Hydraul i ¢ engagenent standard
Tread Wdth: 63.8 in. to 71.6 in.

REAR AXLE
Fl ange Type
Tread Wdth: 63.9 in. to 79.7 in.

HYDRAULI C SYSTEM

Open Center System

Dual Gear Punps
I mpl erent Punp: 16.9 gpm (64 L)
Steering Punp: 9.7 gpm (37 L)
Total Flow 26.6 gpm (101 L)

(2) Open Center Rempte Valves with
Detent & Ki ckout on #2
Fl oat on #1

REAR DI FFERENTI AL LOCK:
Mechani cal | y Engaged

PTO

Ful | y I ndependent

Flip-up PTO Shaft Guard

540 RPM hydraulic wet clutch
El ect roni ¢ engagenent

1-3/8 in. 6 splines

-T1LA 06 0035 000 01-JAN-20



Y% NEW HOLLAND

AGRICULTURE

-T1LA 06

WORKMASTER 95-120 AP LOW PRO FAST PICK

US PRICE LIST

Standard Equipment

3-PO NT LIFT SYSTEM
Ri ght hand consol e nmount ed

| ever control
Mechani cal Draft Control
3,200 Pounds Lift Capacity
Category I/11 Conbi Ball Ends
Tel escopic Stabilizers
Fl exi bl e Lower Link Ends

ELECTRI CAL:
(1) 800 cca Heavy-Duty Battery
120 anp Alternator

7-pin Qutlet for trailer/inplement |ighting

and signals
30 anmp power plug
12V power socket (cigarette lighter)

| NSTRUMENTATI ON:
Digital /Analog Instrunentation with
warning lights for turn signals, high
beam work lights, side lights,
rear PTO, 4WD, differential Iock,
|l ow fuel, alternator, oil pressure,
brake fluid, grid heater & hand brake
Gauges for fuel |evel, engine
tenmperature and tachoneter
Di gi tal Readout for PTO speed,
ground speed, battery, hours &
DEF | evel percentage

LI GHTI NG

Front: (2) Hal ogen Headlights

Rear: (1) Right hand fender
nmount ed worklights

Turn Signal s/ Fl ashers/ Rear Lights

Page 16 of 36

OPERATOR PROTECTI VE STRUCTURE:

ROPS MODELS

2-Post Fol dable ROPS with | SO
mounted flat deck platform

Steering Wheel - adjustable tilt

Seat - Low profile air suspension seat,
operator's presence sensor, and
retractabl e seat belts

Suspended pedal s

Locki ng brake pedal s

Tl RES:
11.5/80-15.3 Rl Front
500/ 60-22.5 Rl Rear
R
12.5/80-18 R4 Front
19.5L24 R4 Rear
R
11. 2- 24 Front
16. 9x30 Rear

M SCELLANEQUS:

Pi voti ng Engi ne Hood
SW Enbl em

Tool box

WARRANTY:
New Hol | and Standard Warranty Applies
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Y% NEW HOLLAND

AGRICULTURE

-T1LA 06

WORKMASTER 95-120 AP LOW PRO FAST PICK

US PRICE LIST
Models
COMMERCIAL VERSION TRACTION Weight Factory Data List Price
MODEL
WORKMASTER 95 | Rops MFD 7451 LB| 9046694P70 $59,865.00
TIER4
WORKMASTER 105 | Rops MFD 7,451 LB| 9048956P70 $62,765.00
TIER4
WORKMASTER 120 | Rops MFD 7,936 LB| 9051764P70 $66,365.00
TIER4
Factory Supplied Options
| Order Code Description | Weight | Factory Data List Price |
| PACKAGE SELECTION |
SD_T9980 PACKAGING
XF9917X | Low Profile All Purpose Fast P (902886P00) ($3,700.00)

Low Profile All Purpose Fast Pick

Allows for choice of the following:
Tires:
16.9-30 R1 rear with 11.2-24 R1 front OR
19.5L.27 R4 rear with 12.5-80/18 R4 front OR
500/60-22.5 R1 rear with 11.5/80-15.3 R1 front
Rear Remotes:
2 or 3remotes
PTO:
540 OR 540/1000 RPM
Rear weights:
4 rear wheel weights OR NO rear wheel weights
Front weights:
8, 10 OR NO front weights
Mid mount valve / loader:
NO mid mount valve or loader OR
Mid mount valve with NO brackets & NO Loader OR
Complete loader ready (mid mount valve, hoses and brackets)
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Y% NEW HOLLAND

AGRICULTURE

-T1LA 06

WORKMASTER 95-120 AP LOW PRO FAST PICK

US PRICE LIST

| TIRES

[ FRONT

SD_T4940 FRONT WHEELS AND TIRES

AWD Front Tires - Ag

8220701

11.2-24
Requires 16.9-30 rear tires

(900046P80)

($60.00)

8811501

11.5/80-15.3
Requires 500/60-22.5 rear tires
(ROPS ONLY)

9000546P00

$700.00

4AWD Front Tires - Ind

8230503

FRONT 12.5-18
Requires 19.5L-24 rear tires

9000546P00

$700.00

REAR

SD_T4950 REAR WHEELS AND TIRES

Rear tires - Ag

8930602

REAR 16.9 - 30
Requires 11.2-24 4WD front or 7.50-16 2WD front

9000234P00

$300.00

8310501

500/60-22.5
Requires 11.5/80-15.3 4WD front tires
(ROPS ONLY)

9000487P50

$625.00

Rear tires - Ind

8930603

REAR 19.5-24
Requires 12.5/80-18 4WD front tires

9000487P50

$625.00

| HYDRAULICS

| REAR REMOTES

SD_T8270 REAR REMOTES

762052

2 REMOTE 762052

2 rear remotes for Open Platform with foldable ROPS
Float on remote 1
Extend and retract detent and kick-out on remote 2

No Charge

762053

3 REMOTE 762053

3 rear remotes for Open Platform with foldable ROPS
Float on remote 1 & 3
Extend and retract detent and kick-out on remote 2

9000624P00

$800.00
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Y% NEW HOLLAND

AGRICULTURE

-T1LA 06

WORKMASTER 95-120 AP LOW PRO FAST PICK

US PRICE LIST

| LoADER

| LOADER

SD_T8110 LOADER BRACKETS

343422 | LOADER READY 343422 (901154P40) ($1,480.00)
Complete loader ready includes:
- Horizontal and Vertical TPS loader brackets
- 2 function mid mount valve and joystick
- Hoses from mid mount valve to vertical bracket
- Grill guard
762057 TL632 FULL NS762057 No Charge
632TL Non self leveling loader with 84" SSL Bucket
| PTO
| REARPTO
SD _T8010 PTO
759271 540 RPM W CAP No Charge
759273 [ 540-1000 RPM W CAP 9000413P40 $530.00
| WEIGHTS
[ FRONT WEIGHTS
SD_T2151 WEIGHT PACK
342070 110KgFCW/10X40-510kg 9000975P00 $1,250.00
Front carrier (154 Ibs) + 10 weights (88lbs each) = 1,034 Ibs
342069 | 110KgFC W/8X40-430kg 9000780P00 $1,000.00
Front carrier (154 Ibs) + 8 weights (88lbs each) = 858 |bs
REAR WHEEL WEIGHTS
SD_T4960 WHEEL WEIGHTS
762028 | 2X550r32Kg EACH SIDE 9000491P40 $630.00

2 (110 Ib) rear weights per side = 220 Ibs total for all rear tires
sizes except 500/60-22.5

2 (70 1b) rear weights per side = 140 Ibs total for 500/60-22.5
rear tires
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Y% NEW HOLLAND

-T1LA 06

WORKMASTER 95-120 AP LOW PRO FAST PICK

US PRICE LIST
OPERATOR'S MANUALS
SD_T9805 OPERATOR MANUAL (SE
342076 French (Canada) No Charge
342077 | Spanish No Charge
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Y% NEW HOLLAND TILA 07

AGRICULTURE

WORKMASTER 95-120 POULTRY FAST PICKS
US PRICE LIST

Standard Equipment

KEY SELLI NG PO NTS:

- Low profile sem straddl e ROPS

- Low profile air suspensions seat
- 12x12 power shuttle transm ssion
- Lift-OMtic

- Factory installed | oader

Wor knmast er 95

97 Gross Engine hp

78 PTO hp @2300 rpm

4 Cyl Turbocharged Engine
207cu in (3.4 L) D splacenent

Wor kmast er 105

112 Gross Engine hp

92 PTO hp @2300 rpm

4 Cyl Turbocharged Engi ne
207cu in (3.4 L) D splacenent

Wor kmast er 120

120 Gross Engine hp

100 PTO hp @ 2300 rpm

4 Cyl Turbocharged Engine
207cu in (3.4 L) D splacenent

ALL MODELS:
Tier B Em ssions Conpliant:
(CEGR + SCR + CUQ)
Engi ne Reversi ng Fan
El ectronic Injection Bosch
H gh- pressure Conmon Rail System
El ectric Engi ne Shut of f
Hand and Foot Throttle Controls
Gid Heater Starting Ad
Powercore Dry Air C eaner
Under Hood Muffler
Hori zontal Rearward Exhaust
24 gal Fuel Tank
2.9 gal DEF Tank
2 function mid mount valve & joystick
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TRANSM SSI ON:
LH side steering col um nounted
Power Shuttle

Creeper ready

12 Forward and 12 Reverse Speeds

(4) Synchronized Gears

(3) Non-synchroni zed Ranges

(2) clutches, 5 wet disc plates
FWD - 19 nph (30 KPH) speed nmay vary
Hand Operated Park Brake

STEERI NG BRAKES:
Hydrostatic Power Steering
Brakes- Hydraulically assisted wet disc

AWD FRONT AXLE:

Limted Slip

El ectro-Hydraul i ¢ engagenent standard
Tread Wdth: 63.8 in. to 68.5 in.

REAR AXLE
Fl ange Type
Tread Wdth: 64.8 in. to 72.7 in.

HYDRAULI C SYSTEM

Open Center System

Dual Gear Punps
I mpl enent Punp: 16.9 gpm (64 L)
Steering Punp: 9.7 gpm (37 L)
Total Flow 26.6 gpm (101 L)

(2) Open Center Renpte Valves with
Detent & Kickout on #2
Fl oat on #1

REAR DI FFERENTI AL LOCK:
Mechani cal | y Engaged

PTO

Ful Il y I ndependent

Flip-up PTO Shaft Guard

540 RPM hydraulic wet clutch
El ectroni ¢ engagenent

1-3/8 in. 6 splines
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Y% NEW HOLLAND

AGRICULTURE

-T1LA 07

WORKMASTER 95-120 POULTRY FAST PICKS

US PRICE LIST

Standard Equipment

3-PO NT LI FT SYSTEM
Ri ght hand consol e nount ed

| ever control
Mechani cal Draft Control
3,200 Pounds Lift Capacity
Category I/11 Conbi Ball Ends
Tel escopic Stabilizers
Fl exi bl e Lower Link Ends

ELECTRI CAL:
(1) 800 cca Heavy-Duty Battery
120 anp Al ternator

7-pin Qutlet for trailer/inplenent Iighting

and signal s
30 anmp power plug
12V power socket (cigarette lighter)

| NSTRUMVENTATI ON:
Digital /Analog Instrunentation with
warning lights for turn signals, high
beam work lights, side lights,
rear PTO, 4WD, differential |ock,
|l ow fuel, alternator, oil pressure,
brake fluid, grid heater & hand brake
Gauges for fuel |evel, engine
tenperature and tachoneter
Di gital Readout for PTO speed,
ground speed, battery, hours &
DEF | evel percentage

LI GHTI NG

Front: (2) Hal ogen Headlights

Rear: (1) Right hand fender
nmount ed wor kl i ghts

Turn Signal s/ Fl ashers/ Rear Lights

M SCELLANEQUS:

Pi voti ng Engi ne Hood
SW Enbl em

Tool box
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TI RES:

11.5/80-15.3 R1l Front

500/ 60-22.5 Rl Rear
OR

12.5/80-18 R4 Front

19.5L24 R4 Rear

OPERATOR PROTECTI VE STRUCTURE:

ROPS MODELS

2- Post Fol dabl e ROPS with | SO
mounted flat deck platform

Steering Wieel - adjustable tilt

Seat - Low profile air suspension seat,
operator's presence sensor, and
retractabl e seat belts

Suspended pedal s

Locki ng brake pedal s

WARRANTY:
New Hol I and Standard Warranty Applies

LOADER:

632TL NON SELF- LEVELI NG
Maxi mum Li ft Hei ght @
pi vot pin: 134.5"
Dump Cl earance @45 deg: 98. 4"
Di ggi ng Depth: 5.1"
Lift Capacity @800mm 2,028 LBS
Br eakout Force @800mm 3,102 LBS
Reach @ Max Lift Height @45
deg: 37.8"
Reach @ Ground Level: 87.4"
Bucket Rol | back Angle: 40 degrees
Bucket Dunmp Angl e: 53 degrees
Ski d Steer bucket attach
84" bucket
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Y% NEW HOLLAND TILA 07

AGRICULTURE

WORKMASTER 95-120 POULTRY FAST PICKS

US PRICE LIST
Models
COMMERCIAL VERSION TRACTION Weight Factory Data List Price
MODEL
WORKMASTER 95 | Rops MFD 7,451 LB | 9046694P70 $59,865.00
TIER4
WORKMASTER 105 | Rops MFD 7,451 LB | 9048956P70 $62,765.00
TIER4
WORKMASTER 120 | Rops MFD 7,936 LB| 9051764P70 $66,365.00
TIER4
Factory Supplied Options
| Order Code Description | Weight | Factory Data List Price |
| PACKAGE SELECTION |
SD_T9980 PACKAGING
(900429P00) ($550.00)

XF9915X | Poultry NSL Loader Fast Pick

Poultry NSL Loader Fast Pick pricing includes:
Reversing engine fan
632LA NSL loader with SSL quick attach and 84" bucket

Allows for choice of the following:
Tires:
19.5L.27 R4 rear with 12.5-80/18 R4 front OR
500/60-22.5 R1 rear with 11.5/80-15.3 R1 front
Rear Remotes:
2 or 3remotes
PTO:
540 OR 540/1000 RPM
Rear weights:
4 rear wheel weights OR NO rear wheel weights
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Y% NEW HOLLAND

AGRICULTURE

-T1LA 07

WORKMASTER 95-120 POULTRY FAST PICKS

US PRICE LIST

XF9916X | Poultry NO Loader Fast Pick (906653P40) ($8,530.00)
Poultry NSL Loader Fast Pick pricing includes:
Reversing engine fan
Less loader and mid mount valve
Allows for choice of the following:
Tires:
19.5L.27 R4 rear with 12.5-80/18 R4 front OR
500/60-22.5 R1 rear with 11.5/80-15.3 R1 front
Rear Remotes:
2 or 3remotes
PTO:
540 OR 540/1000 RPM
Rear weights:
4 rear wheel weights OR NO rear wheel weights
| TIRES
| FrRONT
SD_T4940 FRONT WHEELS AND TIRES
4AWD Front Tires - Ag
8811501 | 11.5/80-15.3 9000546P00 $700.00
Requires 500/60-22.5 rear tires
(ROPS ONLY)
4AWD Front Tires - Ind
8230503 | FRONT 12.5-18 9000546P00 $700.00
Requires 19.5L-24 rear tires
REAR
SD_T4950 REAR WHEELS AND TIRES
Rear tires - Ag
8310501 | 500/60-22.5 9000487P50 $625.00
Requires 11.5/80-15.3 4WD front tires
(ROPS ONLY)
Rear tires - Ind
8930603 | REAR 19.5-24 9000487P50 $625.00

Requires 12.5/80-18 4WD front tires
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Y% NEW HOLLAND

-T1LA 07

WORKMASTER 95-120 POULTRY FAST PICKS
US PRICE LIST

| HYDRAULICS

|  REAR REMOTES

SD_T8270 REAR REMOTES

3 rear remotes for Open Platform with foldable ROPS
Float on remote 1 & 3
Extend and retract detent and kick-out on remote 2

762052 | 2 REMOTE 762052 No Charge
2 rear remotes for Open Platform with foldable ROPS
Float on remote 1
Extend and retract detent and kick-out on remote 2
762053 3 REMOTE 762053 9000624P00 $800.00

| pTO

| REARPTO

SD_T8010 PTO

759271 540 RPM W CAP No Charge
759273 | 540-1000 RPM W CAP 9000413P40 $530.00
| WEIGHTS
| REAR WHEEL WEIGHTS

SD_T4960 WHEEL WEIGHTS

762028 | 2X550r32Kg EACH SIDE 9000491P40 $630.00
2 (110 Ib) rear weights per side = 220 Ibs total for all rear tires
sizes except 500/60-22.5
2 (70 Ib) rear weights per side = 140 Ibs total for 500/60-22.5
rear tires
OPERATOR'S MANUALS
SD_T9805 OPERATOR MANUAL (SE
342076 French (Canada) No Charge
342077 | Spanish No Charge
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S? NEW HOLLAND -T1LA 08

AGRICULTURE

WORKMASTER 95-120 ROPS MOWING FAST PICK
US PRICE LIST

Standard Equipment

KEY SELLI NG PO NTS:

- Sem straddl e ROPS

- Air suspensions seat

- 12x12 power shuttle transm ssion
- Lift-OMtic

- Factory installed | oader

Wor knmast er 95

97 Gross Engine hp

78 PTO hp @2300 rpm

4 Cyl Turbocharged Engine
207cu in (3.4 L) D splacenent

Wor kmast er 105

112 Gross Engine hp

92 PTO hp @2300 rpm

4 Cyl Turbocharged Engi ne
207cu in (3.4 L) D splacenent

Wor kmast er 120

120 Gross Engine hp

100 PTO hp @ 2300 rpm

4 Cyl Turbocharged Engine
207cu in (3.4 L) D splacenent

ALL MODELS:
Tier B Em ssions Conpliant:
(CEGR + SCR + CUQ)
El ectronic Injection Bosch
H gh- pressure Conmmon Rail System
El ectric Engi ne Shutoff
Hand and Foot Throttle Controls
Gid Heater Starting Aid
Powercore Dry Air C eaner
Under Hood Muffler
Hori zontal Rearward Exhaust
24 gal Fuel Tank
2.9 gal DEF Tank
2 function md nmount valve & joystick
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TRANSM SSI ON:
LH side steering col um nounted
Power Shuttle

Creeper ready

12 Forward and 12 Reverse Speeds

(4) Synchronized Gears

(3) Non-synchroni zed Ranges

(2) clutches, 5 wet disc plates
FWD - 19 nph (30 KPH) speed nmay vary
Hand Operated Park Brake

STEERI NG BRAKES:
Hydrostatic Power Steering
Brakes- Hydraulically assisted wet disc

AWD FRONT AXLE:

Limted Slip

El ectro-Hydraul i ¢ engagenent standard
Tread Wdth: 66.5 in. to 72.9 in.

REAR AXLE
Fl ange Type
Tread Wdth: 63.8 in. to 79.5 in.

HYDRAULI C SYSTEM

Open Center System

Dual Gear Punps
I mpl enent Punp: 16.9 gpm (64 L)
Steering Punp: 9.7 gpm (37 L)
Total Flow 26.6 gpm (101 L)

(3) Open Center Renpte Valves with
Detent & Kickout on #2
Fl oat on #1 & #3

REAR DI FFERENTI AL LOCK:
Mechani cal | y Engaged

PTO

Ful Il y I ndependent

Flip-up PTO Shaft Guard

540 RPM hydraulic wet clutch
El ectroni ¢ engagenent

1-3/8 in. 6 splines
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S? NEW HOLLAND -T1LA 08

AGRICULTURE

WORKMASTER 95-120 ROPS MOWING FAST PICK
US PRICE LIST

Standard Equipment

3-PAO NT LI FT SYSTEM LI GHTI NG
Ri ght hand consol e nount ed Front: (2) Hal ogen Headlights
| ever control Rear: (1) Right hand fender
Mechani cal Draft Control nmount ed workl i ghts
3,200 Pounds Lift Capacity Turn Signal s/ Fl ashers/ Rear Lights
Category I/11 Conbi Ball Ends
Tel escopic Stabilizers OPERATOR PROTECTI VE STRUCTURE:
Fl exi bl e Lower Link Ends ROPS MODELS
2- Post Fol dable ROPS with | SO
ELECTRI CAL: mounted flat deck platform
(1) 800 cca Heavy-Duty Battery Steering Weel - adjustable tilt
120 amp Alternator Seat - Low profile air suspension seat,
7-pin Qutlet for trailer/inplenent Iighting operator's presence sensor, and
and signals retractabl e seat belts
30 anmp power plug Suspended pedal s
12V power socket (cigarette lighter) Locki ng brake pedal s
| NSTRUMVENTATI ON: Tl RES:
Digital /Analog Instrunentation with 12. 4x24 R1 Front
warning lights for turn signals, high 18. 4X30 R1 Rear
beam work lights, side lights,
rear PTO 4WD, differential I ock, M SCELLANECUS:
|l ow fuel, alternator, oil pressure, Pi voti ng Engi ne Hood
brake fluid, grid heater & hand brake SW Enbl em
Gauges for fuel |evel, engine Tool box
tenperature and tachoneter
Di gital Readout for PTO speed, WARRANTY:
ground speed, battery, hours & New Hol I and Standard Warranty Applies

DEF | evel percentage
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Y% NEW HOLLAND

AGRICULTURE

-T1LA 08

WORKMASTER 95-120 ROPS MOWING FAST PICK

US PRICE LIST
Models
COMMERCIAL VERSION TRACTION Weight Factory Data List Price
MODEL
WORKMASTER 95 | Rops MFD 7,451 LB | 9046694P70 $59,865.00
TIER4
WORKMASTER 105 | Rops MFD 7,451 LB | 9048956P70 $62,765.00
TIER4
WORKMASTER 120 | Rops MFD 7,936 LB| 9051764P70 $66,365.00
TIER4
Factory Supplied Options
| Order Code Description | Weight | Factory Data List Price |
| PACKAGE SELECTION |
SD_T9980 PACKAGING
(908486P40) ($10,880.00)

XF9918X

ROPS Mowing Fast Pick
ROPS Mowing Fast Pick
3 rear remotes
NO mid mount valve or loader

Allows for choice of the following:
Tires:
18.4-30 R1 rear with 12.4-24 R1 front OR
16.4-34 R1 rear with 13.6-24 R1 front
PTO:
540 OR 540/1000 RPM
Rear weights:
4, 8 OR NO rear wheel weights
Front weights:
8, 10 OR NO front weights
Mid mount valve / loader:
NO mid mount valve or loader OR
Mid mount valve with NO brackets & NO Loader OR
Complete loader ready (mid mount valve, hoses and brackets)
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S'ﬁ NEW HOLLAND -T1LA 08

AGRICULTURE

WORKMASTER 95-120 ROPS MOWING FAST PICK
US PRICE LIST

| TIRES

[ FRONT

SD_T4940 FRONT WHEELS AND TIRES

AWD Front Tires - Ag

8230506 | FRONT 12.4-24 No Charge
Requires 18.4-30 rear tires

8230505 | 13.6 -24 9000171P60 $220.00
Requires 16.9-34 rear tires

REAR

SD_T4950 REAR WHEELS AND TIRES

Rear tires - Ag

8930605 | REAR 18.4 - 30 No Charge
Requires 12.4-24 4WD front or 10.0-16 2WD front

8930601 | REAR 16.9 - 34 (900109P20) ($140.00)
Requires 13.6-24 4WD front or 10.0-16 2WD front

| LoADER

| LoADER

SD_T8110 LOADER BRACKETS

345324 L/ LOADER FOR MMV 9001154P40 $1,480.00
Mid Mount Valve and Joystick ONLY.
343422 | LOADER READY 343422 9005070P00 $6,500.00

Complete loader ready includes:

- Horizontal and Vertical TPS loader brackets

- 2 function mid mount valve and joystick

- Hoses from mid mount valve to vertical bracket
- Grill guard

| pTO

[ REARPTO

SD T8010 PTO

759271 [ 540 RPM W CAP No Charge
759272 | 540-540E RPM W CAP 9000354P90 $455.00
759273 | 540-1000 RPM W CAP 9000413P40 $530.00
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Y% NEW HOLLAND

AGRICULTURE

-T1LA 08

WORKMASTER 95-120 ROPS MOWING FAST PICK
US PRICE LIST

| WEIGHTS

[ FRONT WEIGHTS

SD_T2151 WEIGHT PACK

342070 | 110KgFCW/10X40-510kg 9000975P00 $1,250.00
Front carrier (154 |bs) + 10 weights (88lbs each) = 1,034 Ibs

342069 | 110KgFC W/8X40-430kg 9000780P00 $1,000.00
Front carrier (154 Ibs) + 8 weights (88lbs each) = 858 Ibs

REAR WHEEL WEIGHTS

SD_T4960 WHEEL WEIGHTS

762028 | 2X550r32Kg EACH SIDE
2 (110 Ib) rear weights per side = 220 Ibs total for all rear tires
sizes except 500/60-22.5

2 (70 1b) rear weights per side = 140 Ibs total for 500/60-22.5
rear tires

9000491P40 $630.00

759650 4X550r32Kg EACH SIDE
4 (110 Ib) rear weights per side = 440 Ibs total for all rear tires
sizes except 500/60-22.5

4 (70 Ib) rear weights per side = 280 Ibs total for 500/60-22.5
rear tires

9000982P80 $1,260.00

OPERATOR'S MANUALS

SD_T9805 OPERATOR MANUAL (SE

342076 French (Canada)

No Charge

342077 | Spanish

No Charge
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S? NEW HOLLAND -T1LA 09

AGRICULTURE

WORKMASTER 95-120 A LA CARTE ROPS
US PRICE LIST

Standard Equipment

KEY SELLI NG PO NTS:

- Sem straddl e ROPS

- Air suspensions seat

- 12x12 power shuttle transm ssion
- Lift-OMtic

- Factory installed | oader

Wor knmast er 95

97 Gross Engine hp

78 PTO hp @2300 rpm

4 Cyl Turbocharged Engine
207cu in (3.4 L) D splacenent

Wor kmast er 105

112 Gross Engine hp

92 PTO hp @2300 rpm

4 Cyl Turbocharged Engi ne
207cu in (3.4 L) D splacenent

Wor kmast er 120

120 Gross Engine hp

100 PTO hp @ 2300 rpm

4 Cyl Turbocharged Engine
207cu in (3.4 L) D splacenent

ALL MODELS:
Tier B Em ssions Conpliant:
(CEGR + SCR + CUQ)
El ectronic Injection Bosch
H gh- pressure Conmmon Rail System
El ectric Engi ne Shutoff
Hand and Foot Throttle Controls
Gid Heater Starting Aid
Powercore Dry Air C eaner
Under Hood Muffler
Hori zontal Rearward Exhaust
24 gal Fuel Tank
2.9 gal DEF Tank
2 function md nmount valve & joystick
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TRANSM SSI ON:
LH side steering col um nounted
Power Shuttle

Creeper ready

12 Forward and 12 Reverse Speeds

(4) Synchronized Gears

(3) Non-synchroni zed Ranges

(2) clutches, 5 wet disc plates
FWD - 19 nph (30 KPH) speed nmay vary
Hand Operated Park Brake

STEERI NG BRAKES:
Hydrostatic Power Steering
Brakes- Hydraulically assisted wet disc

AWD FRONT AXLE:

Limted Slip

El ectro-Hydraul i ¢ engagenent standard
Tread Wdth: 63.8 in. to 72.9 in.

REAR AXLE
Fl ange Type
Tread Wdth: 63.9 in. to 79.7 in.

HYDRAULI C SYSTEM

Open Center System

Dual Gear Punps
I mpl enent Punp: 16.9 gpm (64 L)
Steering Punp: 9.7 gpm (37 L)
Total Flow 26.6 gpm (101 L)

(2) Open Center Renpte Valves with
Detent & Kickout on #2
Fl oat on #1

REAR DI FFERENTI AL LOCK:
Mechani cal | y Engaged

PTO

Ful Il y I ndependent

Flip-up PTO Shaft Guard

540 RPM hydraulic wet clutch
El ectroni ¢ engagenent

1-3/8 in. 6 splines
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Y% NEW HOLLAND

AGRICULTURE

-T1LA 09

WORKMASTER 95-120 A LA CARTE ROPS

US PRICE LIST

Standard Equipment

3-PO NT LI FT SYSTEM
Ri ght hand consol e nount ed

| ever control
Mechani cal Draft Control
3,200 Pounds Lift Capacity
Category I/11 Conbi Ball Ends
Tel escopic Stabilizers
Fl exi bl e Lower Link Ends

ELECTRI CAL:
(1) 800 cca Heavy-Duty Battery
120 anp Al ternator

7-pin Qutlet for trailer/inplenent Iighting

and signal s
30 anmp power plug
12V power socket (cigarette lighter)

| NSTRUMVENTATI ON:
Digital /Analog Instrunentation with
warning lights for turn signals, high
beam work lights, side lights,
rear PTO, 4WD, differential |ock,
|l ow fuel, alternator, oil pressure,
brake fluid, grid heater & hand brake
Gauges for fuel |evel, engine
tenperature and tachoneter
Di gital Readout for PTO speed,
ground speed, battery, hours &
DEF | evel percentage

Tl RES:
12. 4x24 R1 Front
18. 4X30 R1 Rear

M SCELLANEQUS:

Pi voti ng Engi ne Hood
SW Enbl em

Tool box
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LI GHTI NG

Front: (2) Hal ogen Headlights

Rear: (1) Right hand fender
nmount ed workl i ghts

Turn Signal s/ Fl ashers/ Rear Lights

OPERATOR PROTECTI VE STRUCTURE:

ROPS MODELS

2- Post Fol dable ROPS with | SO
mounted flat deck platform

Steering Weel - adjustable tilt

Seat - Low profile air suspension seat,
operator's presence sensor, and
retractabl e seat belts

Suspended pedal s

Locki ng brake pedal s

WARRANTY:
New Hol I and Standard Warranty Applies

LOADER:

632TL NON SELF- LEVELI NG
Maxi mum Li ft Hei ght @
pi vot pin: 134.5"
Dunmp Cl earance @45 deg: 98. 4"
Di ggi ng Depth: 5.1"
Lift Capacity @800mm 2,028 LBS
Br eakout Force @800mm 3,102 LBS
Reach @ Max Lift Height @45
deg: 37.8"
Reach @ Ground Level : 87.4"
Bucket Rol | back Angle: 40 degrees
Bucket Dunp Angl e: 53 degrees
Ski d Steer bucket attach
84" bucket
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Y% NEW HOLLAND

AGRICULTURE

-T1LA 09

WORKMASTER 95-120 A LA CARTE ROPS

US PRICE LIST
Models
COMMERCIAL VERSION TRACTION Weight Factory Data List Price
MODEL
WORKMASTER 95 Rops MFD 7,451 LB 9046694P70 $59,865.00
TIER4
WORKMASTER 105 | Rops MFD 7,451 LB 9048956P70 $62,765.00
TIER4
WORKMASTER 120 | Rops MFD 7,936 LB 9051764P70 $66,365.00
TIER4
Factory Supplied Options
| Order Code Description | Weight | Factory Data List Price |
| TIRES |
| FRONT |
SD _T4940 FRONT WHEELS AND TIRES
4WD Front Tires - Ag
8220701 | 11.2-24 (900046P80) ($60.00)
Requires 16.9-30 rear tires
8230506 | FRONT 12.4-24 No Charge
Requires 18.4-30 rear tires
8230505 | 13.6 -24 9000171P60 $220.00
Requires 16.9-34 rear tires
8811501 | 11.5/80-15.3 9000546P00 $700.00
Requires 500/60-22.5 rear tires
(ROPS ONLY)
4WD Front Tires - Ind
8230503 | FRONT 12.5-18 9000546P00 $700.00
Requires 19.5L-24 rear tires
REAR |
SD_T4950 REAR WHEELS AND TIRES
Rear tires - Ag
8930602 | REAR 16.9 - 30 9000234P00 $300.00
Requires 11.2-24 4WD front or 7.50-16 2WD front
8930605 | REAR 18.4 - 30 No Charge
Requires 12.4-24 4WD front or 10.0-16 2WD front
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WORKMASTER 95-120 A LA CARTE ROPS
US PRICE LIST

8930601 | REAR 16.9 - 34 (900109P20) ($140.00)
Requires 13.6-24 4WD front or 10.0-16 2WD front
8310501 | 500/60-22.5 9000487P50 $625.00
Requires 11.5/80-15.3 4WD front tires
(ROPS ONLY)
Rear tires - Ind
8930603 | REAR 19.5-24 9000487P50 $625.00
Requires 12.5/80-18 4WD front tires
| HYDRAULICS
| REAR REMOTES
SD_T8270 REAR REMOTES
762052 | 2 REMOTE 762052 No Charge
2 rear remotes for Open Platform with foldable ROPS
Float on remote 1
Extend and retract detent and kick-out on remote 2
762053 | 3REMOTE 762053 9000624P00 $800.00
3 rear remotes for Open Platform with foldable ROPS
Float on remote 1 & 3
Extend and retract detent and kick-out on remote 2
|LOADER
| LOADER
SD_T8110 LOADER BRACKETS
345324 | L/ LOADER FOR MMV (905070P00) ($6,500.00)
Mid Mount Valve and Joystick ONLY.
343422 | LOADER READY 343422 (901154P40) ($1,480.00)
Complete loader ready includes:
- Horizontal and Vertical TPS loader brackets
- 2 function mid mount valve and joystick
- Hoses from mid mount valve to vertical bracket
- Grill guard
762057 | TL632 FULL NS762057 No Charge
632TL Non self leveling loader with 84" SSL Bucket
| PTO
| REARPTO
SD_T8010 PTO
759271 | 540 RPM W CAP No Charge
759272 | 540-540E RPM W CAP 9000354P90 $455.00
759273 | 540-1000 RPM W CAP 9000413P40 $530.00
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| WEIGHTS

[ FRONT WEIGHTS

SD_T2151 WEIGHT PACK

342070 | 110KgFCW/10X40-510kg 9000975P00 $1,250.00
Front carrier (154 |bs) + 10 weights (88lbs each) = 1,034 Ibs

342069 | 110KgFC W/8X40-430kg 9000780P00 $1,000.00
Front carrier (154 Ibs) + 8 weights (88lbs each) = 858 Ibs

REAR WHEEL WEIGHTS

SD_T4960 WHEEL WEIGHTS

762028 | 2X550r32Kg EACH SIDE
2 (110 Ib) rear weights per side = 220 Ibs total for all rear tires
sizes except 500/60-22.5

2 (70 1b) rear weights per side = 140 Ibs total for 500/60-22.5
rear tires

9000491P40 $630.00

759650 4X550r32Kg EACH SIDE
4 (110 Ib) rear weights per side = 440 Ibs total for all rear tires
sizes except 500/60-22.5

4 (70 Ib) rear weights per side = 280 Ibs total for 500/60-22.5
rear tires

9000982P80 $1,260.00

OPERATOR'S MANUALS

SD_T9805 OPERATOR MANUAL (SE

342076 French (Canada)

No Charge

342077 | Spanish

No Charge
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WORKMASTER 95, 105 & 120 Tire Chart

Tire Order Code Tire Order Code
16.9-30 8930602 11.2-24 8220701
Bias Agricultural - R1 18.4-30 8930605 12.4-24 8230506
16.9-34 8930601 13.6-24 8230505
Specialty Agricultural - R1 500/60-22.5 8310501 11.5/80-15.3 8811501
Industrial - R4 19.5L.24 8930603 12.5/80-18 8290904
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