T-628(5)
TRACTORS, AG TYPE and ATTACHMENTS
#422-1118

AGRICULTURAL TYPE TRACTORS AND ATTACHMENTS
DISCOUNT OFF LIST
SPECIFICATION 3.0

Vendor Name: Trueman Welters Inc

November, 2019

Contact Person:  Seth Strehler

Street Address: 1600 Highway 55 east

P.O. Box:

City, State, Zip Buffalo,Mn<55313
Phone #: 763-682-2200

Toll Free #: n/a

Email Address: seth@welters.net

Spec. Number Information Requested Answer
3.1 MANUFACTURER CaselH
3.2 DATE AND ID. OF PRICE LIST Jan 1 2020 PL-100 MG R1
3.3 CATALOG SECTION TITLE Vestrum
3.4 PERCENTAGE DISCOUNT FROM PRICE LIST 30
3.5 DISCOUNT OFF LIST PRICE FOR RELATED PARTS & ACCESSORIES
(See Special Terms and Conditions) 0
3.6 PRICE FOR MANUALS (1 operator's manual included at no cost, per specs)
SERVICE MANUAL
Digital 150.00
Paper 450.00
PARTS MANUAL
Digital free on line
Paper N/A
PRICE FOR ADDITIONAL OPERATIONS MANUAL
Digital 100.00
Paper 150.00
3.7 PRICE FOR SET OF FLUID AND AIR FILTERS $950
3.8 STANDARD WARRANTY: 24 month / 2000 hours
3.9 PERFORMANCE/EXTENDED WARRANTY OPTIONS
Offer performance/warranty options. (Add additional lines if necessary.)
(Specify years, miles or hours extended term covers.)
no bid
nobid
3.10 INSTALLATION - PER HOUR (Hourly Shop Rate) 119
Installation services may be requested on an "as needed" basis.
See Special Terms and Conditions
3.11 NEW EQUIPMENT RENTAL PROGRAM
If rental programs are available on the new equipment offered, with the option to purchase, list
the hourly/weekly/monthly rental rate. Indicate the percent of rental fee paid by the purchaser
that will be applied to the purchase price. See Solicitation Special Terms & Conditions.
Hourly Rental Rate: no bid
Weekly Rental Rate: no bid
Monthly Rental Rate: no bid
Percent (%) of Rental Fee applied to purchase price: no bid
If the new rental equipment is purchased and finance
charges are applicable for the actual rental term only,
state the actual interest rate here:
3.12 VENDOR OWNED RENTAL RETURN OR DEMO EQUIPMENT PROGRAM
(See Special Terms and Conditions.)
DEDUCT cost per Used Hour from the original Contract Price No Bid
3.13 DELIVERY STARTING POINT - City, State, Zip Buffalo,Mn <55313
See Special Terms and Conditions - No flat rate allowed $3.50 per mile
Minimum Delivery Charge $250.00
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CASE i

AGRICULTURE

VESTRUM ACTIVEDRIVE 8 SERIES

US PRICE LIST

Standard Equipment

MODELS

Vestrum 100 Active Drive 8
Rated PTO HP - 86

Rat ed Engi ne HP - 100

Maxi mum Engi ne HP 110

Rat ed Speed - 2200 RPM

274 cu. in. (4.5L) - 4 Cylinder
Fuel Tank: 47 Gallon (180L)
DEF Tank: 5 Gallon (19L)

Vestrum 130 Active Drive 8
Rated PTO HP - 111

Rat ed Engine HP - 130

Maxi mum Engi ne HP 140

Rat ed Speed - 2200 RPM

274 cu. in. (4.5L) - 4 Cylinder
Fuel Tank: 47 Gallon (180L)
DEF Tank: 5 Gallon (19L)

ENG NE:

Ti er 4B Em ssions Conpli ant

4 val ves per cylinder

Bosch fuel injection punp (el ectronic)
Air Cleaner w Precleaner & Exhaust
Aspiration

Dual elenment air filter

Hand and foot throttle

Gid Heater Starting Ad

Fuel (DEF) Tank

Vi scous fan

Engi ne auto shut down feature

Fuel Cool er

EXHAUST:
A- Post exhaust with integral nuffler

OPERATOR PROTECTI VE STRUCTURE:

CAB:
ROPS protected, flat deck platform
with Standard Cab, with heater and
air conditioner (with 4 speed
pressurizer), tinted windshield with

| ess sunshade, opening hi-visibility roof

wi ndow with retractabl e sun screen,

10f 38

front and less rear intermttent w pers
and washers, two doors with |ocks, two
tel escopi ng heated, renote adjustable
external mrrors, hinged
rear wi ndow (fully opens), deluxe radio
with Bl uetooth (speakers, wring,
antenna), rear w ndow access panel for
control /nonitor box or wring harness
entrance, digital clock, interior dome
light, self cancelling turn signal, and
two external courtesy lights

Steering wheel: tilt and tel escoping

Seat: Del uxe air suspension seat with
operator's presence sensor, seat belt,
and swi vel

Mul ti Control Arnrest with |Integrated
Transm ssion, Throttle, PTO and
Hitch Controls

I NSTRUVENTATI ON:

A-Post nounted Anal og/ Digital
Instrument Cluster with display of
engi ne oil pressure, fuel |evel,

cool ant tenperature and speed,

hitch and PTO operational indicators

TRANSM SSI ON:

-24x24 ActiveDrive 8

Power shi ft Transmi ssi on

- utchl ess Range Change between Ranges
A/B, BIC

MFD -- 25 nph (40 kph)
Speed varies with tire selection

STEERI NG BRAKES:

Hydrostatic Power Steering

Hydraul i cal |y actuated wet disc brakes
(sel f-equalizing and sel f-adjusting)

I ndependent parki ng brake

HYDRAULI CS:

Pressure and fl ow conpensat ed
hydraul i ¢ system (PFC):

Vari abl e di spl acenent pi ston punp

-TINA 01
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CASE i

AGRICULTURE

-TINA 01

VESTRUM ACTIVEDRIVE 8 SERIES

US PRICE LIST

Standard Equipment

Maxi mum fl ow at rated engi ne speed
28.5 gpm (108 I/ m) flow

(1 npl enent punp)

2 Mechanical, 1 Electronic Renotes
Val ves with in-cab flow control
Hydraul i ¢ Tappi ng Port

(Power Beyond Ready)

AXLES:

Class 1.75 MFD Front Axle:

El ectro-hydraulic auto MFD and
di ff-1ock engagenent

Fully locking front differenti al
Dual steering cylinders

Adj ustable tread width from
61.4 in. to 88.8 in. (Muy vary
up to 1 in. depending on tires)
55 degree Turning Angle

12 degree Axle Gscillation
Drive Shaft Shield

Standard front tires:

14. 9R24 (R1W

Rear Axl e:

Fl ange type

Wet plate rear differential |ock
MFD - El ectro-hydraulic engaged
Standard rear tires:

18. 4R34 (R1W

HI TCH:

El ectronic draft control
(lower link sensing)

3-point hitch category Il with

flex link ends and tel escoping stabilizers

Fast Rai se/Lower Control (in cab)
6700 | b/ 3039 kg lift capacity (OECD)
wi th dual 80nm external assist ram
Rear fender nounted renote

hitch sw tches

Ri de control

Swi ngi ng dr awbar

PTO
I ndependent 540/ 540E/ 1000 RPM

2 of 38

with single reversible shaft

Mul ti-plate wet clutch design

El ectro-hydraul i c engagenent

with soft start/auto feathering
Fl i p-up PTO shaft guard

Fender nounted PTO control switch

ELECTRI CAL:

(1) 12-volt 1300 cca Battery
Geared starter notor (4.2kW

7-pin outlet for trailer/inplement
I'ighting

3-pin inplenment socket (40 amp)

15 anp screw type positivel/negative
term nal s

Single pin (8 anp) accessory power
out| et

200 anp Alternator

1 SO'JD (30 anp) socket

LI GHTI NG

Two hood nounted forward facing

Ei ght LED worklights
Two cab roof mounted forward facing
Two grab rail mounted forward facing
Two cab roof nounted rear facing
Two rear "C'-post mounted rear
facing

Two tailights

self cancelling turn indicators with
audi bl e war ni ng

Front and rear cab roof mounted
flashing safety lights

M SCELLANECUS:

Pi voting engi ne hood
SW enbl em

Tool box

Hor n

Case | H standard warranty applies
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CASE il B

AGRICULTURE
VESTRUM ACTIVEDRIVE 8 SERIES
US PRICE LIST
Models

COMMERCIAL ENGINE POWER SPEC. CATEGORY Weight Factory Data List Price

MODEL

VESTRUM 110HP 4CYL. ACTDRV 9083650P32 $107,244.00
100ACTIVEDRIVES

VESTRUM 140HP 4CYL. ACTDRV 9091840P32 $117,744.00
130ACTIVEDRIVES

Factory Supplied Options
Order Code Description | Weight Factory Data List Price

30of 38 -TINA 01 052 000 02-JAN-20
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CASE il e
AGRICULTURE
VESTRUM ACTIVEDRIVE 8 SERIES
US PRICE LIST
| OPERATOR STRUCTURE |
| OPERATOR STRUCTURE |
SD_T9200 OPERATOR STRUCTURE #1
759722 | STANDARD CAB 759722 No Charge
Standard Cab - Does not include Cab Suspension
758479 | Suspended_Cab 9001376P70 $1,765.00

Two shocks mounted in rear of cab increase operator comfort
Reduces shock loads transmitted to the tractor by up to 25%
When coupled with a suspended axle, the ultimate in ride comfort
is achieved

Includes tinted rear window

5 of 38
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CASE il A
AGRICULTURE
VESTRUM ACTIVEDRIVE 8 SERIES
US PRICE LIST
759725 SUSP CAB HTD 9001772P16 $2,272.00
Includes 758479, plus heated front and rear windscreens
Requires 200A alternator
| caB |
SD _T7620 SPEAKERS
| | | 743714 | Deluxe Radio with Bluetooth No Charge |
SD_T8500 SEAT
759735 DLX AIR SUSP. + BELT No Charge
Deluxe Seat with Low Frequency Air Suspension
758362 | Deluxe Fabric w HT + VENT 9001524P90 $1,955.00
Deluxe air seat with low frequency suspension,
swivel headrest, heated, and passive venting
Deluxe fabric material
758363 MAX EVO LEATHER ACTIVE 9002988P96 $3,832.00
Active air suspension leather seat with low frequency suspension,
headrest, heated, and venting
SD_T9000 STORAGE BOX/SEAT
758569 | Instructional Seat with Belt No Charge
Includes seatbelt
Cloth/Leather will match operator seat
SD_T9010 REAR CAB STORAGE BO
759733 L/REAR STORAGE BOX 759733 No Charge
758570 | Lefthand Rear Cab Storage Box 9000174P72 $224.00
Large LH storage box
Located in the back left hand corner, behind instructor seat area
Compatible with or without instructor seat/front toolbox options
SD_T9230 CLIMATE CONTROL
759728 AIR CONDITIONING 759728 No Charge
Standard A/C
758482 | Air Conditioning W/ATC 9000568P62 $729.00
Automatic Temperature Control (ATC). Operator sets desired
temperature and system maintains set temperature.
SD_T9291 REAR WINDOW SUNSHADE
759841 L/REAR SUNSHADE No Charge
758580 | Sunshade, Rear Window 9000160P68 $206.00
Pull down perforated material sunscreen.
SD_T9553 LUXURY PACK
759729 STD STEERING WHEEL No Charge
Standard, non-leather steering wheel

6 of 38

-TINA 01 052 000 02-JAN-20




| |
CASE Il e
AGRICULTURE
VESTRUM ACTIVEDRIVE 8 SERIES
US PRICE LIST
758483 | Leather Steering Wheel +Carpet 9000202P80 $260.00
Black Leather wrapped steering wheel with red stitching. Includes
Wheat Brown carpet with Case Logo.
STEERING COLUMN
SD_T6300 STEERING OR AUTOGUIDANCE READY
759759 [ STANDARD STEER 759759 No Charge
759185 | Autoguidance Ready 9004148P82 $5,319.00
Includes steering valve and manifold, hoses, wiring harness, and
roof mounting bracket for receiver
Does not include display mount
SD_T9180 AUDIBLE WARNING TURN INDICATOR
758504 | Self-Cancel + Audible Turn No Charge
Cancels automatically with the turn of the steering wheel
Sound and dash light indicates turn signal active
MIRRORS
SD_T9360 RR MIRRORS
759154 | 2 Tele/Heat/Rem Adj Mirror No Charge
2 Telescopic, Heated, Remote Adjustable Mirrors: Shatter proof
with Large Head and Spotter
7.9" x 11.8" (200 x 300 mm)
759153 | 2 Telescopic Mirrors 759153 (900051P48) ($66.00)
2 Telescopic Mirrors: Shatter Proof with Large Head and Spotter
7.9" x 11.8" (200 x 300 mm)
INSTRUMENTATION
SD_T7610 INSTRUMENT PANEL
758546 | A Pillar CIH Enhanced Instru No Charge
Includes oil, brake, PTO speed, hitch, reset, electronic remote flow
and timer (when equipped), engine hours, fault codes, egress light
settings.
Also includes A-Post data display, slip control, area worked, tractor
performance monitoring.
759752 | A-PILLAR BASIC - CIH (900129P48) ($166.00)
Includes oil, brake, PTO speed, hitch, reset, electronic remote flow
and timer (when equipped), engine hours, fault codes, egress light
settings.

7 of 38
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CASE il A
VESTRUM ACTIVEDRIVE 8 SERIES
US PRICE LIST
WORK LIGHTING
SD_T9110 HOOD LIGHTS
759446 | BASIC HOOD LIGHTS No Charge
New Grill Styling with updated hoodlights
2 halogen roadlights 2 halogen worklights
759447 | HIGH SPEC HOOD LIGHT 9000789P36 $1,012.00
New Grill Styling with LED High Spec Hood Lights
2 Halogen roadlights 4 led worklights 2 led signature lights
SD_T9130 WORK LAMPS
758357 | 8 LED High Power Hi-Roof No Charge
High Power LED lights produce 1950 Lumens
4 front roof-mounted LED work lights
4 rear roof-mounted LED work lights
2 halogen road hood lights
2 halogen work hood lights
759743 | HI ROOF 8 LED (900305P76) ($392.00)
Standard Power LED lights produce 1000 Lumens
4 front roof-mounted LED work lights
4 rear roof-mounted LED work lights
2 halogen road hood lights
2 halogen work hood lights
758594 | 12 LED High Power Hi-Roof 9001223P04 $1,568.00
High Power LED lights produce 1950 Lumens
4 front roof-mounted LED work lights
4 rear roof-mounted LED work lights
2 front grab rail-mounted LED work lights
2 rear post-mounted LED work lights
2 halogen road hood lights
2 halogen work hood lights
758595 | 14 LED High Power Hi-Roof 9001833P78 $2,351.00
High Power LED lights produce 1950 Lumens
4 front roof-mounted LED work lights
6 rear roof-mounted LED work lights
2 front grab rail-mounted LED work lights
2 rear post-mounted LED work lights
2 halogen road hood lights
2 halogen work hood lights
SD_T9131 FRONT WORK LAMPS ON
[ | | 759739 [LHiGH HEADLAMPS No Charge

8 of 38
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AGRICULTURE

VESTRUM ACTIVEDRIVE 8 SERIES
US PRICE LIST

BEACON LIGHTING

SD_T9146 ROTARY BEACON
759842 [ LIROTARY BEACON 759842 No Charge
759777 | ROTARY BEACON 759777 9000326P04 $418.00
Single Rotary Beacon placed on rear left of tractor for increased
safety and visibility

758491 [ Twin Beacon 9000652P08 $836.00
Dual Rotary Beacons placed on the rear of the cab on both the left
and right side for maximum safety and visibility

DISPLAY MOUNTING

SD_T9223 RH WINDOW BAR MOUNT

759754 FIXINGS IN CAB FRAME 759754 No Charge
No Bar or Monitor

758153 | Monitor Mounting Bracket. 9000117P00 $150.00
Includes Bar mounted in righthand side of cab without Monitor

758154 | RH Window Bar Display Ready. 9000190P32 $244.00

Includes Bar mounted in righthand side of cab with AFS ready
harness and window mount without Monitor

758621 10~ Color Touch Screen Display 9004151P16 $5,322.00
Includes Bar mounted in righthand side of cab
Includes AFS ready harness

Includes AFS Pro 700 Color Touchscreen display

SD_T9228 RH ARMREST MOUNT
759755 | LIARMREST MONITOR No Charge
759756 | LARGE T.S. DISPLAY 9004137P90 $5,305.00
Includes AFS Pro 700 Color Touchscreen display mounted at the
end of MultiControl Armrest.

| PRECISION FARMING

| AUTOGUIDANCE

SD_T4820 HEADLAND SYSTEM
759861 L/HTS No Charge
759750 HEADLAND CNTRL SYSTM 9001170P00 $1,500.00
End of Row functionality programmed through the tractors
A-Post display

If equipped, sequences may be stored in the AFS Pro 700

SD_T7616 AUTOGUIDANCE NAV/CO
[ | [ 759760 [L/aG NAV-CNTRL No Charge
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AGRICULTURE

VESTRUM ACTIVEDRIVE 8 SERIES
US PRICE LIST

762158 AUTOGUID. - Lv.1 9011508P90 $14,755.00
Includes WAAS with accuracy to +/- 3 Ft
762159 AUTOGUID. - Lv.2 9013650P00 $17,500.00

Includes Omnistar activation with accuracy to +/- 1.5 In.
Requires subscription

762160 | AUTOG. - Lv.3 430MHZ 9015600P00 $20,000.00
Full AG NAV GPS Level 3

Includes Omnistar and RTK receiver activation with accuracy
to +/-1In.

Requires an RT radio or modem

Requires subscription

ENGINE

SD_T1000 ENGINE

759651 [ STG V L/BOOST L/BRK

Elect. Fuel pump - 4 valves without Power Boost
759652 [ STG V L/BOOST W/BRK 9000266P76 $342.00
Elect. Fuel pump - 4 valves without Power Boost and with
Engine Exhaust

No Charge

Brake - Activated by depressing a pedal on left side in the cab
Closes the exhaust flap to act as an exhaust brake to reduce
braking when hauling heavy loads on steep terrain.

SD_T1010 ENGINE OPTIONS
759653 [ STD COOLING FAN No Charge
759654 [ REV. COOLING FAN 9000186P42 $239.00
Revering engine fan clears debris from front grill screen when
activated via in-cab control

SD_T1040 CHARGING SYSTEMS
[ | [ 759663 [200 AMP ALTERNATOR 759663

No Charge |
[ STARTING AID |
SD_T1938 WEATHER PACK
758401 | Grid_Heater No Charge
-18F (-10C) to -32.4F (-18C)
758402 | Grid_Heater + 110V Pack 9000315P90 $405.00
Improves cold weather starting abilities; transmission heat
maintainer

110V Electrical Plug in

Engine block heater includes 2 heaters: 1 for engine block heater
and 1 for transmission and hydraulic heat maintainer

Plugs located side by side, below door opening
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AGRICULTURE
VESTRUM ACTIVEDRIVE 8 SERIES
US PRICE LIST
BATTERY
SD T7420 BATTERY
758407 HD Battery 176AH No Charge
Heavy Duty Battery (176Ah 1300 EN cca)
Does not include battery isolator
759183 HD BATT W/ISOLATOR 9000341P64 $438.00
Includes electronic battery isolator switch on right hand rear
c-pillar in cab
In-cab switch disconnects battery to prevent battery drainage
FUEL TANK
SD_T1400 FUEL TANK
759656 L/GUARD L/LOCK. CAP No Charge
Without guard and without locking cap
759658 W/GUARD W/LOCK. CAP 9000183P30 $235.00

Fuel tank with guard and locking cap

| TRANSMISSION

| TRANSMISSION

SD_T2800 SPEED

759111 40 KPH ECO - DCT

24 Speed ActiveDrive 8 Transmission up to 8 Power Shifts per
range over 3 ranges. Pushbutton shifts, no need for mechanical
range lever, no need to clutch between ranges.

No Charge

759112 40K ECO - DCT+CREEPE 9001950P00
24 Speed ActiveDrive 8 Transmission up to 8 Power Shifts

per range over 3 ranges Pushbutton shift, no need for mechanical
range lever, no need to clutch between ranges

Creeper - 722 Feet per hour (220 meteres per hour)

$2,500.00

SD_T2816 AUTO FEATURES

759166 BASIC AUTO FEATURE

Includes 392359 plus

Pedal Kick Down: Enhances acceleration while in autoshift mode
during transport applications

AutoShift: Automates shifting of gears based on engine load

Active Clutch II: Allows operator finite inching control by utilizing
brake pedal on the tractor

No Charge
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AGRICULTURE
VESTRUM ACTIVEDRIVE 8 SERIES
US PRICE LIST
759855 | LIAUTO FEATURES (900719P16) ($922.00)
Includes:
Smart Range Shift: automatically selcts the correct gear when
shifting through ranges instead of just the next gear
Memory Shuttle: adapts to the users operating style when shuttling
from forward to reverse; remembers the last selected gear in the
opposite direction
Smooth Shift: enables engine rpm modulation fo further enhance
shift quality
758631 ADV TRANS AUTO FEAT 9001294P80 $1,660.00
Includes 759855 and 759166 plus
Target Speed Management (APM): Maintains set speed; similar
to Magnum. APM requires Pro 700 Monitor
RADAR
SD_T7580 RADAR
759758 L/RADAR 759758 No Charge
758501 | Radar NAR 9000638P04 $818.00
Provides more accurate speed readings and area measurements
Requires enhanced instrumentation
758546 A Pillar CIH Enhanced Instru
| TRAILER BRAKES |
| TRAILER BRAKES |
SD T7130 TRLR BRKVLV
| | | 758304 | L/Hydr Brk L/Air Brk No Charge |
| HITCH |
| REAR 3-POINT |
SD_T8950 AUX RAMS
759696 EDC 2 EXT 80MM CYL No Charge

3-Point Hitch Capacity with two 80mm lift cylinders
Category Il with flex link ends and telescopic stabilizers
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AGRICULTURE
VESTRUM ACTIVEDRIVE 8 SERIES
US PRICE LIST
HYDRAULICS
SD_T8230 HYD PUMP
758441 | CCLS Pump No Charge
Pressure Flow Compensating (PFC) Closed Center Load Sensing
108L/Min.
REAR REMOTE VALVES
SD_T8270 REAR REMOTES
759690 | 2RR MV + 1 EH.RR.V. No Charge
2 mechanical plus 1 electronic remote, 3 total valves
Configurable Detent
759691 [2RR MV +2EH.RR.V. 9000705P90 $905.00
2 Mechanical plus 2 Electronic Remotes
4 total remotes
Configurable Detent
POWER BEYOND
SD_T8275 POWER BEYOND COUPLE
759693 [ HYD. POWER BEYOND 759693 No Charge
758540 Low-Pressure Return 9000140P40 $180.00
Low pressure return line with 1/2" hydraulic quick coupler.
ISO 7241 Series A hydraulic quick coupler, non-flat face design.
Does not include load sense line
Requires male end on implement 83972881 (CNH Industrial Parts)
| PTO |
SD_T8720 AUTO PTO
[ | | 759857 |AutopPTO 759857 No Charge |
| FRONT AXLE |
SD_T4010 FRONT AXLE
759667 | Class 1.75 Front Axle No Charge

MFD axle with multi-plate fully locking, front differential

with steering sensors

Requires 113 L/min pump (758441)

Hydraulic Differential Lock: Multiplate differential lock, engages
when operator engages the rear differential lock

Incompatible with 34 inch rear wheels

13 of 38

-TINA 01 052 000 02-JAN-20




| |
CASE il A
VESTRUM ACTIVEDRIVE 8 SERIES
US PRICE LIST
759670 | Class 1.75 Suspd Front Axle 9002956P20 $3,790.00
Axle less brakes with Steering Sensors
Suspension: Cushions and dampens the movement of the front
axle, Smoother ride for increased operator comfort and decreased
fatigue, Improved traction, Suspenso can be locked solid by the
operator using an in-cab switch, located on the RH console
FRONT WHEELS AND TIRES
SD _T4940 FRONT WHEELS AND TIRES
8242301 | 14.9R24 A8 HD Rim No Charge
R1W RADIAL ISO 4WD ADJUSTABLE RIM
Match with 8365401 rear tire/wheel
8299801 | Non-Return Ship Wheels - 4WD 9000074P10 $95.00
8235401 | 12.4R24 A8 9001119P30 $1,435.00
R1W RADIAL ISO 4WD ADJUSTABLE RIM
Match w/ 8357401 rear tire/wheel
8236701 | 13.6R24 A8 HD Rim 9001142P70 $1,465.00
8247401 | 11.2R28 A8 9001158P30 $1,485.00
R1W RADIAL ISO 4WD ADJUSTABLE RIM
Matches with 8372401 Rear tires 13.6R38 (340/85R38) MAVT
8880401 | 360/80R24 GRSLND, Adj. Rim 9001524P90 $1,955.00
| REAR AXLE |
SD_T3200 REAR AXLE
[ | | 759673 |HDFLNG AXL (275mm) No Charge |
| REAR WHEELS AND TIRES |
SD_T4950 REAR WHEELS AND TIRES
8365401 | 460/85(18.4)R34 A8 FI,MI,CO,TR No Charge
R1IW RADIAL ISO 4WD ADJUSTABLE RIM
Matches with 8242301 14.9R24 (380/85R24) MAVT
8300000 | Less Rear Rims & Tires No Charge
8399801 | Non-Returnable Shipping Wheel 9000452P40 $580.00
8916401 | 440/80R34 GRSLND, Adj. Rim 9002538P90 $3,255.00
Matches with 888041, 360/80R24 TRI 2 MAVT
Front Tires
8372401 | 13.6R38 A8 9001824P42 $2,339.00
R1W RADIAL ISO 4WD ADJUSTABLE RIM
Matches with 8247401 Fronts 11.2R28 (280/85R28) MAVT
8353401 | 14.9 R38 A8 DWW12-38 9002242P50 $2,875.00
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CASE Il e
AGRICULTURE
VESTRUM ACTIVEDRIVE 8 SERIES
US PRICE LIST
8357401 | 18.4R30 R1W 9002714P40 $3,480.00
R1W RADIAL ISO 4WD ADJUSTABLE RIM
Match w/ 8235401 front tire/wheel
Not compatible with narrow rear fenders
option code: 331870
FENDERS
SD_T8710 FENDERS PTO CONTROL
759687 | EXT EDC/PTO CNTR No Charge
Fender mounted switches for rear PTO and rear three-point hitch
for operation from outside cab
743680 | Fender EDC/PTO/Rem Valv Contrl 9000226P20 $290.00
Fender mounted switches for rear PTO, rear three-point hitch, and
third electronic rear remote.
FRONT FENDERS
SD_T8740 FRONT FENDERS
759843 [ L/IFRONT FENDERS 759843 No Charge
758330 | Dynamic Front Fenders 480mm 9000577P20 $740.00
| REAR FENDERS |
SD_T8700 FENDERS
| | | 743777 | Standard fenders with extensn No Charge |
| LOADER |
SD_T7780 JOYSTICK
759694 | LIJOYSTICK W/EDC POD 759694 No Charge
758069 | Joystick with Rocker Switch 9001251P90 $1,605.00
Electronic Joystick with Proportional Rocker
Required if loader will include "Live" 3rd function circuit
759396 | EHSTICK ADV +/- PROP 9001950P00 $2,500.00
Enhanced Electronic Joystick with Proportional Rocker
Advanced +/- Buttons Enables Gear/Speed Shifts
Directly from Loader Joystick
SD_T7790 MID-MOUNT VALVES
759695 [ L/MID-MOUNT VALVES 759695 No Charge
743689 | 2 Electronic MMV 9001949P22 $2,499.00
2 Electronic Mid-Mount Valves
Requires Electronic Joystick
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AGRICULTURE
VESTRUM ACTIVEDRIVE 8 SERIES
US PRICE LIST
743690 | 3 Electronic MMV 9002987P40 $3,830.00
3 Electronic Mid-Mount Valves
Requires Electronic Joystick
MOUNTING BRACKETS
SD_T8110 LOADER BRACKETS
744711 L/Loader Ready w/MMV No Charge
758980 | Loader Ready. 9003576P30 $4,585.00
Includes TPS mounting bracket set (with Grill Guard), and hose kit
Choice of Advanced Joystick 759396 or Joystick with Rocker
Switch 758069
Choice of 2 MMV 743689 or 3 MMV 743690
| OTHER EQUIPMENT
| FRONT BALLAST
SD_T2150 FRONT BALLAST
759844 | LIFRONT WEIGHTS No Charge
No Front Weights
759771 | FRNT BALLAST - 495KG 9001094P34 $1,403.00
838 Ibs/380 kg
REAR BALLAST
SD_T4960 WHEEL WEIGHTS
759845 | LIWHEEL WEIGHTS 759845 No Charge
759773 | 6X50 Rear Wheel Weights 9000934P44 $1,198.00
Recommended for Loader Applications
6 x 110 Ibs (50 kQg)
3 weights are on each side on the rear
Total weight = 660 Ibs. (300 kg)
759137 | 2X150KG + 2X250KG Wheel Weight 9001219P14 $1,563.00
Recommended for Loader Applications
2 x 331 Ibs. (150kg) and 2 x 551 Ibs. (250 kg)
2 weights are on each side on the rear
Total weight = 1,764 Ibs (800 kg)
ADDITIONAL EQUIPMENT
SD_T2820 PARK LOCK
759860 | L/EPL No Charge

Less EPL willprevent full functionality of ISOBUS CLS 3 automation
There is no DIA kit to install this feature at a later date
EPL must be ordered from the factory
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758034 | EPL Electronic parkbrake75803 9000957P06 $1,227.00
Electronic Park Lock is required for ISOBUS CLS 3 automation
SD_T7642 1SO BUS
759757 | L/ISOBUS SOCKET 759757 No Charge
758632 | ISO CL2+9PIN IN CAB 9000210P60 $270.00
Includes 9-pin in-cab connector on back RH c-pillar and
break-away connection on cab rear
758710 | ISO CL3+9PIN+SPEED 9000305P76 $392.00
OTHER OPTIONS
SD_T9850 SPECIAL COLORS/PANELS
759768 | BASE COLOUR HI ROOF No Charge
Includes high visibility roof panel
TIRE BRAND PREFERENCE
SD_T4900 TIRE CATEGORY CHOICE
330438 No tire brand preference No Charge
330418 | Trelleborg 9000436P80 $560.00
330439 | Continental 9000436P80 $560.00
330442 | Michelin 9000436P80 $560.00
330446 | Firestone 9000436P80 $560.00
OPERATOR MANUALS
SD_T9802 OPERATORS MANUAL
759854 | L/ADD. OPS MANUAL No Charge
Includes standard English Operators Manual
Does not include additional Operators Manual
758534 | English USA No Charge
Extra Operators Manual
758535 | Spanish NAR No Charge
Extra Operators Manual
759101 French NAR No Charge
Extra Operators Manual
| TELEMATICS

SD_T7625 TELEMATICS

[ T T 759764 [UTELEMATICS

No Charge
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759394 | Basic Telematics 9000557P70 $715.00
Offering includes: Mounting Kit, Modem, 1 Year
susbcription to AFS Connect Essential
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US PRICE LIST

Standard Equipment

MODELS

Vestrum 100 CVX Drive

Rated PTO HP - 86

Rat ed Engi ne HP - 100

Maxi mum Engi ne HP - 110

Rat ed Speed - 2200 RPM

274 cu. in. (4.5L) - 4 Cylinder
Fuel Tank: 47 Gallon (180L)
DEF Tank: 5 Gallon (19L)

Vestrum 130 CVX Drive

Rated PTO HP - 111

Rat ed Engine HP - 130

Maxi mum Engi ne HP - 140

Rat ed Speed - 2200 RPM

274 cu. in. (4.5L) - 4 Cylinder
Fuel Tank: 47 Gallon (180L)
DEF Tank: 5 Gallon (19L)

ENG NE:

273 cu. in. (4.5 L) Displacenent

4 Cylinder Turbocharged and
Intercool ed Engine with El ectronic
Power Managenment and Const ant
RPM f eat ure Power Boost in Transport
and PTO Mbdes

Tier 4B Em ssions Conpli ant

4 val ves per cylinder

Bosch fuel injection punp (el ectronic)
Air Cleaner w Precleaner & Exhaust
Aspiration

Dual elenent air filter

Hand and foot throttle

Gid Heater Starting Ad

Fuel (DEF) Tank

Vi scous fan

Engi ne auto shut down feature

Fuel Cool er

EXHAUST:
A-Post exhaust with integral nuffler

OPERATOR PROTECTI VE STRUCTURE:
CAB:
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ROPS protected, flat deck platform

with Standard Cab, with heater and

air conditioner (with 4 speed

pressurizer), tinted windshield with
OPERATOR PROTECTI VE STRUCTURE:

| ess sunshade, opening hi-visibility roof
wi ndow with retractabl e sun screen,

front and less rear internmttent w pers and
washers, two doors with | ocks, two

tel escopi ng heated, renpte adjustable
external nmirrors, hinged

rear window (fully opens), deluxe radio with
Bl uet oot h (speakers, wiring, antenna), rear
wi ndow access panel for control /

nmoni tor box or wiring harness

entrance, interior storage box,

interior dome |light, self-cancelling

turn signal, and two external courtesy
lights

Steering wheel: tilt and tel escoping

Seat: Deluxe air suspension seat with
operator's presence sensor, seat belt,

and swi vel

Mul ti Control Arnrest with Integrated
Transm ssion, Throttle, PTO and

Hitch Controls

I NSTRUVENTATI ON:

A-Post nounted Anal og/ Digital
Instrument Cluster with display of
engine oil pressure, fuel |evel,

cool ant tenperature and speed,

hitch and PTO operational indicators

TRANSM SSI ON: CVX Drive

Auto Command CVT with col um
mount ed power shuttle Conmand
Gip multi-function controller

3 target speed sel ections
Infinite target speed thunb wheel
Ri ght foot "go pedal"

MD -- 25 nph (40 kph)
Speed varies with tire selection

-TINB 01
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VESTRUM CVXDRIVE SERIES

US PRICE LIST

Standard Equipment

CLUTCH:
Doubl e wet clutch technol ogy

STEERI NG BRAKES:

Hydrostatic Power Steering
Hydraulically actuated wet disc brakes
(sel f-equalizing and sel f-adj usting)

I ndependent parki ng brake

HYDRAULI CS:

Pressure and fl ow conpensat ed
hydraul i ¢ system (PFC):

Vari abl e di spl acenment pi ston punp
Maxi mum fl ow at rated engi ne speed
28.5 gpm (108 I/ m flow

(i npl enent punp)

2 Mechanical, 1 Electrical Renotes
Val ves with in-cab flow control
Hydraul i ¢ Tappi ng Port

(Power Beyond Ready)

AXLES:

MFD Front Axl e:

Class 1.75 MFD Axl e

El ectro-hydraulic auto M-D and
di ff-1ock engagenent

Fully locking front differential
Dual steering cylinders

Adj ustable tread width from
61.4 in. to 88.8 in. (May vary
up to 1 in. depending on tires)
55 degree Turning Angle

12 degree Axle Gscillation
Drive Shaft Shield

Standard front tires:

14. 9R24 (R1W

Rear Axl e:

Fl ange type

Wet plate rear differential |ock:
MFD - El ectro-hydraulic engaged
(front and rear)

Rear Axle: (continued)

Standard rear tires:

18. 4R34 (R1W
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H TCH:

El ectronic draft control

(lower link sensing)

3-point hitch category Il with flex
link ends and tel escoping stabilizers
Fast Rai se/Lower Control (in cab)
6700 | b/ 3039 kg lift capacity (COECD)
with dual 80mm external assist ram
Rear fender nounted renote

hitch sw tches

Ri de control

Swi ngi ng dr awbar

PTO

I ndependent 540/ 540E/ 1000 RPM
with single reversible shaft

Mul ti-plate wet clutch design

El ectro-hydraul i c engagenent

with soft start/auto feathering
Fl i p-up PTO shaft guard

Fender nounted PTO control switch

ELECTRI CAL:

(1) 12-volt 1300 cca Battery
Geared starter notor (4.2kW

7-pin outlet for trailer/inplenment
I'ighting

3-pin inplenment socket (40 amp)

15 anp screw type positivel/negative
term nal s

Single pin (8 anp) accessory power
out | et

200 anp Alternator

1 SO'JD (30 anp) socket

I SO BUS 11783 rear breakaway socket

LI GHTI NG

Two hood nounted forward facing

Ei ght LED worklights

Two cab roof mounted forward facing
Two grab rail nounted forward facing
Two cab roof mounted rear facing
Two rear "C'-post nounted rear
facing
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VESTRUM CVXDRIVE SERIES
US PRICE LIST

Standard Equipment

Two tailights

self cancelling turn indicators with
audi bl e war ni ng

Front and rear cab roof nounted
flashing safety lights

M SCELLANEQUS:
Pi voti ng engi ne hood

SW enbl em
Tool box
Hor n

Case | H standard warranty applies
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CASE i
' AGRICULTUREJ

VESTRUM CVX DRIVE SERIES

US PRICE LIST
Models
COMMERCIAL BRAND ENGINE POWER SPEC. CATEGORY Weight Factory Data List Price
MODEL
VERSUM 100C CVX | Case IH 110HP 4CYL. VERSCVX 9101806P32 $132,216.00
DRIVE
VERSUM 130C CVX | Case IH 140HP 4CYL. VERSCVX 9109891P32 $142,716.00
DRIVE
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VESTRUM CVXDRIVE SERIES
US PRICE LIST

| OPERATOR STRUCTURE

| OPERATOR STRUCTURE

SD_T9200 OPERATOR STRUCTURE #1

759722 STANDARD CAB 759722 No Charge
Standard Cab - Does not include Cab Suspension

758479 | Suspended_Cab 9001376P70 $1,765.00
Two shocks mounted in rear of cab increase operator comfort
Reduces shock loads transmitted to the tractor by up to 25%
When coupled with a suspended axle, the ultimate in ride comfort
is achieved
Includes tinted rear window

759725 SUSP CAB HTD 9001772P16 $2,272.00
Includes 758479, plus heated front and rear windscreens
Requires 200A alternator
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[ caB |
SD _T7620 SPEAKERS
| | 743714 | Deluxe Radio with Bluetooth No Charge |
SD_T8500 SEAT
759735 DLX AIR SUSP. + BELT No Charge
Deluxe Seat with Low Frequency Air Suspension
758362 | Deluxe Fabric w HT + VENT 9001524P90 $1,955.00
Deluxe air seat with low frequency suspension,
swivel headrest, heated, and passive venting
Deluxe, heated, and active venting
758363 | MAX EVO LEATHER ACTIVE 9002988P96 $3,832.00
Active air suspension leather seat with low frequency suspension,
headrest, heated, and venting
SD_T9000 STORAGE BOX/SEAT
758569 Instructional Seat with Belt No Charge
Includes seatbelt
Cloth/Leather will match operator seat
SD_T9010 REAR CAB STORAGE BO
759733 L/REAR STORAGE BOX 759733 No Charge
758570 | Lefthand Rear Cab Storage Box 9000174P72 $224.00
Large LH storage box
Located in the back left hand corner, behind instructor seat area
Compatible with or without instructor seat/front toolbox options
SD_T9230 CLIMATE CONTROL
759728 AIR CONDITIONING 759728 No Charge
Standard A/C
758482 | Air Conditioning W/ATC 9000568P62 $729.00
Automatic Temperature Control (ATC). Operator sets desired
temperature and system maintains set temperature.
SD_T9291 REAR WINDOW SUNSHADE
759841 L/REAR SUNSHADE No Charge
758580 | Sunshade, Rear Window 9000160P68 $206.00
Pull down perforated material sunscreen.
SD_T9553 LUXURY PACK
759729 STD STEERING WHEEL No Charge
Standard, non-leather steering wheel
758483 Leather Steering Wheel +Carpet 9000202P80 $260.00
Black Leather wrapped steering wheel with red stitching. Includes
Wheat Brown carpet with Case Logo.
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New Grill Styling with updated hoodlights
2 halogen roadlights 2 halogen worklights

| |
CASE Il e
AGRICULTURE
VESTRUM CVXDRIVE SERIES
US PRICE LIST
STEERING COLUMN
SD_T6300 STEERING OR AUTOGUIDANCE READY
759759 STANDARD STEER 759759 No Charge
759185 | Autoguidance Ready 9004148P82 $5,319.00
Includes steering valve and manifold, hoses, wiring harness, and
roof mounting bracket for receiver
Does not include display mount
SD_T9180 AUDIBLE WARNING TURN INDICATOR
758504 | Self-Cancel + Audible Turn No Charge
Cancels automatically with the turn of the steering wheel
Sound and dash light indicates turn signal active
MIRRORS
SD_T9360 RR MIRRORS
759154 | 2 Tele/Heat/Rem Adj Mirror No Charge
2 Telescopic, Heated, Remote Adjustable Mirrors: Shatter proof
with Large Head and Spotter
7.9" x 11.8" (200 x 300 mm)
759153 | 2 Telescopic Mirrors 759153 (900051P48) ($66.00)
2 Telescopic Mirrors: Shatter Proof with Large Head and Spotter
7.9" x 11.8" (200 x 300 mm)
INSTRUMENTATION
SD _T7610 INSTRUMENT PANEL
758546 | A Pillar CIH Enhanced Instru No Charge
Includes oil, brake, PTO speed, hitch, reset, electronic remote flow
and timer (when equipped), engine hours, fault codes, egress light
settings.
Also includes A-Post data display, slip control, area worked, tractor
performance monitoring.
759752 A-PILLAR BASIC - CIH (900129P48) ($166.00)
Includes oil, brake, PTO speed, hitch, reset, electronic remote flow
and timer (when equipped), engine hours, fault codes, egress light
settings.
WORK LIGHTING
SD_T9110 HOOD LIGHTS
759446 BASIC HOOD LIGHTS No Charge
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759447 HIGH SPEC HOOD LIGHT 9000789P36 $1,012.00
New Grill Styling with LED High Spec Hood Lights
2 Halogen roadlights 4 led worklights 2 led signature lights

SD_T9130 WORK LAMPS
758357 | 8 LED High Power Hi-Roof No Charge
High Power LED lights produce 1950 Lumens
4 front roof-mounted LED work lights

4 rear roof-mounted LED work lights

2 halogen road hood lights

2 halogen work hood lights

759743 | HI ROOF 8 LED (900305P76) ($392.00)
Standard Power LED lights produce 1000 Lumens
4 front roof-mounted LED work lights

4 rear roof-mounted LED work lights

2 halogen road hood lights

2 halogen work hood lights

758594 | 12 LED High Power Hi-Roof 9001223P04 $1,568.00
High Power LED lights produce 1950 Lumens
4 front roof-mounted LED work lights

4 rear roof-mounted LED work lights

2 front grab rail-mounted LED work lights

2 rear post-mounted LED work lights

2 halogen road hood lights

2 halogen work hood lights

758595 | 14 LED High Power Hi-Roof 9001833P78 $2,351.00
High Power LED lights produce 1950 Lumens
4 front roof-mounted LED work lights

6 rear roof-mounted LED work lights

2 front grab rail-mounted LED work lights

2 rear post-mounted LED work lights

2 halogen road hood lights

2 halogen work hood lights

SD_T9131 FRONT WORK LAMPS ON
[ | | 759739 |LHiGH HEADLAMPS No Charge |

| BEACON LIGHTING |

SD_T9146 ROTARY BEACON
759842 L/ROTARY BEACON 759842 No Charge
759777 ROTARY BEACON 759777 9000326P04 $418.00
Single Rotary Beacon placed on rear left of tractor for increased
safety and visibility

758491 [ Twin Beacon 9000652P08 $836.00
Dual Rotary Beacons placed on the rear of the cab on both the left

and right side for maximum safety and visibility
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DISPLAY MOUNTING

SD_T9223 RH WINDOW BAR MOUNT

759754 FIXINGS IN CAB FRAME 759754 No Charge
No Bar or Monitor

758153 | Monitor Mounting Bracket. 9000117P00 $150.00
Includes Bar mounted in righthand side of cab without Monitor

758154 | RH Window Bar Display Ready. 9000190P32 $244.00

Includes Bar mounted in righthand side of cab with AFS ready
harness and window mount without Monitor

758621 10~ Color Touch Screen Display 9004151P16 $5,322.00
Includes Bar mounted in righthand side of cab
Includes AFS ready harness

Includes AFS Pro 700 Color Touchscreen display

SD T9228 RH ARMREST MOUNT
759755 L/ARMREST MONITOR No Charge
759756 LARGE T.S. DISPLAY 9004137P90 $5,305.00
Includes AFS Pro 700 Color Touchscreen display mounted at the
end of MultiControl Armrest.

| PRECISION FARMING

| AUTOGUIDANCE

SD_T4820 HEADLAND SYSTEM
759750 | HEADLAND CNTRL SYSTM No Charge
End of Row functionality programmed through the tractors
A-Post display

If equipped, sequences may be stored in the AFS Pro 700
758592 | Adv. Headland Ctrl Confg EHR 9000759P72 $974.00
Allows End of Row functions to be precisely programmed within
AFS Pro 700 monitor

More user-friendly than basic End of Row controls

Allows operator to choose within the display which remote is
operated on the MultiFunction handle

Requires an AFS Pro 700 display

SD_T7616 AUTOGUIDANCE NAV/CO

759760 [ L/AG NAV-CNTRL No Charge

762158 | AUTOGUID. - Lv.1 9011508P90 $14,755.00
Includes WAAS with accuracy to +/- 3 Ft

762159 | AUTOGUID. - Lv.2 9013650P00 $17,500.00

Includes Omnistar activation with accuracy to +/- 1.5 In.
Requires subscription
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762160 | AUTOG. - Lv.3 430MHZ 9015600P00 $20,000.00
Full AG NAV GPS Level 3
Includes Omnistar and RTK receiver activation with accuracy
to +/- 1 In.
Requires an RT radio or modem
Requires subscription
ENGINE
SD_T1000 ENGINE
759651 | STGV L/BOOST L/BRK No Charge
Elect. Fuel pump - 4 valves without Power Boost
759652 | STG V L/BOOST W/BRK 9000266P76 $342.00
Elect. Fuel pump - 4 valves without Power Boost and with Engine
Exhaust rake - Activated by depressing a pedal on left side in the
cab. Closes the exhaust flap to act as an exhaust brake to reduce
braking when hauling heavy loads on steep terrain.
SD_T1010 ENGINE OPTIONS
759653 | STD COOLING FAN No Charge
759654 | REV. COOLING FAN 9000186P42 $239.00
Revering engine fan clears debris from front grill screen when
activated via in-cab control
SD_T1040 CHARGING SYSTEMS
[ | | 759663 [200AMP ALTERNATOR 759663 No Charge |
[ STARTING AID |
SD_T1938 WEATHER PACK
758401 | Grid_Heater No Charge
-18F (-10C) to -32.4F (-18C)
758402 | Grid_Heater + 110V Pack 9000315P90 $405.00
Improves cold weather starting abilities; transmission heat
maintainer
110V Electrical Plug in
Engine block heater includes 2 heaters: 1 for engine block heater
and 1 for transmission and hydraulic heat maintainer
Plugs located side by side, below door opening
BATTERY
SD_T7420 BATTERY
758407 HD Battery 176AH No Charge

Heavy Duty Battery (176Ah 1300 EN cca)
Does not include battery isolator

29 of 38

-TINB 01 052 000 02-JAN-20




| |
CASE M T
AGRICULTURE
VESTRUM CVXDRIVE SERIES
US PRICE LIST
759183 HD BATT W/ISOLATOR 9000341P64 $438.00
Includes electronic battery isolator switch on right hand rear
c-pillar in cab
In-cab switch disconnects battery to prevent battery drainage
FUEL TANK
SD_T1400 FUEL TANK
759656 L/GUARD L/LOCK. CAP No Charge
Without guard and without locking cap
759658 W/GUARD W/LOCK. CAP 9000183P30 $235.00
Fuel tank with guard and locking cap
| TRANSMISSION |
TRANSMISSION |
SD_T2800 SPEED
759664 40 KPH ECO CVT No Charge
25 mph (40 KPH)
Max ground speed possible as low as 1550 engine RPM
RADAR
SD_T7580 RADAR
759758 L/RADAR 759758 No Charge
758501 | Radar NAR 9000638P04 $818.00
Provides more accurate speed readings and area measurements
Requires enhanced instrumentation
758546 A Pillar CIH Enhanced Instru
| TRAILER BRAKES |
| TRAILER BRAKES |
SD_T7130 TRLR BRK VLV
[ [ | 758304 [ vLmHydrBrk L/Air Brk No Charge |
| HITCH |
| REAR 3-POINT |
SD_T8950 AUX RAMS
759696 [ EDC 2 EXT 80MM CYL No Charge

3-Point Hitch Capacity with two 80mm lift cylinders
Category Il with flex link ends and telescopic stabilizers
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SD_T8960 DRAWBAR AND 3 POINT HITCH
[ | | 759698 |caT.2FLEXLINKS No Charge |
| HYDRAULICS |
SD_T8230 HYD PUMP
758441 CCLS Pump No Charge
Pressure Flow Compensating (PFC) Closed Center Load Sensing
108L/Min.
REAR REMOTE VALVES
SD_T8270 REAR REMOTES
759690 [2RR MV +1EH.RR.V. No Charge
2 mechanical plus 1 electronic remote, 3 total valves
Configurable detent
759691 [2RR MV +2EH.RR.V. 9000705P90 $905.00
2 Mechanical plus 2 Electronic Remotes
4 total remotes
Configurable detent
POWER BEYOND
SD_T8275 POWER BEYOND COUPLE
758540 Low-Pressure Return No Charge
Low pressure return line with 1/2" hydraulic quick coupler.
ISO 7241 Series A hydraulic quick coupler, non-flat face design.
Does not include load sense line
Requires male end on implement 83972881 (CNH Industrial Parts)
759693 [ HYD. POWER BEYOND 759693 (900140P40) ($180.00)
FRONT AXLE |
SD_T4010 FRONT AXLE
759667 | Class 1.75 Front Axle No Charge

MFD axle with multi-plate fully locking, front differential

with steering sensors

Requires 113 L/min pump (758441)

Hydraulic Differential Lock: Multiplate differential lock, engages
when operator engages the rear differential lock

Incompatible with 34 inch rear wheels
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759670 | Class 1.75 Suspd Front Axle 9002956P20 $3,790.00
Axle less brakes with Steering Sensors
Suspension: Cushions and dampens the movement of the front
axle, Smoother ride for increased operator comfort and decreased
fatigue, Improved traction, Suspenso can be locked solid by the
operator using an in-cab switch, located on the RH console
FRONT WHEELS AND TIRES
SD _T4940 FRONT WHEELS AND TIRES
8242301 | 14.9R24 A8 HD Rim No Charge
R1W RADIAL ISO 4WD ADJUSTABLE RIM
Match with 8365401 rear tire/wheel
8299801 | Non-Return Ship Wheels - 4WD 9000074P10 $95.00
8235401 | 12.4R24 A8 9001119P30 $1,435.00
R1W RADIAL ISO 4WD ADJUSTABLE RIM
Match w/ 8357401 rear tire/wheel
8236701 | 13.6R24 A8 HD Rim 9001142P70 $1,465.00
8247401 | 11.2R28 A8 9001158P30 $1,485.00
R1W RADIAL ISO 4WD ADJUSTABLE RIM
Matches with 8372401 Rear tires 13.6R38 (340/85R38) MAVT
8880401 | 360/80R24 GRSLND, Adj. Rim 9001524P90 $1,955.00
Match with 8916401 rear tire/wheel
Municipal tire with adjustable rim
| REAR AXLE |
SD_T3200 REAR AXLE
[ | | 759673 |HDFLNG AXL (275mm) No Charge |
| REAR WHEELS AND TIRES |
SD_T4950 REAR WHEELS AND TIRES
8365401 | 460/85(18.4)R34 A8 FI,MI,CO,TR No Charge
R1W RADIAL ISO 4WD ADJUSTABLE RIM
Matches with 8242301 14.9R24 (380/85R24) MAVT
8399801 | Non-Returnable Shipping Wheel 9000452P40 $580.00
8372401 | 13.6R38 A8 9001824P42 $2,339.00
R1W RADIAL ISO 4WD ADJUSTABLE RIM
Matches with 8247401 Fronts 11.2R28 (280/85R28) MAVT
8353401 | 14.9 R38 A8 DWW12-38 9002242P50 $2,875.00
8916401 | 440/80R34 GRSLND, Adj. Rim 9002538P90 $3,255.00
Matches with 888041, 360/80R24 TRI 2 MAVT
Front Tires
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8357401 | 18.4R30 R1W 9002714P40 $3,480.00
R1W RADIAL ISO 4WD ADJUSTABLE RIM
Match w/ 8235401 front tire/wheel
Not compatible with narrow rear fenders
option code: 331870
FENDERS
SD_T8710 FENDERS PTO CONTROL
759687 | EXT EDC/PTO CNTR No Charge
Fender mounted switches for rear PTO and rear three-point hitch
for operation from outside cab
743680 | Fender EDC/PTO/Rem Valv Contrl 9000226P20 $290.00
Fender mounted switches for rear PTO, rear three-point hitch, and
third electronic rear remote.
| REAR FENDERS |
SD_T8700 FENDERS
| | | 743777 | Standard fenders with extensn No Charge |
| LOADER |
SD_T7780 JOYSTICK
759694 [ L/IJOYSTICK W/EDC POD 759694 No Charge
758069 | Joystick with Rocker Switch 9001251P90 $1,605.00
Electronic Joystick with Proportional Rocker
Required if loader will include "Live" 3rd function circuit
SD_T7790 MID-MOUNT VALVES
759695 [ L/MID-MOUNT VALVES 759695 No Charge
743689 | 2 Electronic MMV 9001949P22 $2,499.00
2 Electronic Mid-Mount Valves
Requires Electronic Joystick
743690 | 3 Electronic MMV 9002987P40 $3,830.00
3 Electronic Mid-Mount Valves
Requires Electronic Joystick
| MOUNTING BRACKETS |
SD_T8110 LOADER BRACKETS
| | | 744711 L/Loader Ready w/ MMV No Charge |
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758980 | Loader Ready. 9003576P30 $4,585.00
Includes TPS mounting bracket set (with Grill Guard), and hose kit
Choice of Advanced Joystick 759396 or Joystick with Rocker
Switch 758069
Choice of 2 MMV 743689 or 3 MMV 743690
| OTHER EQUIPMENT
| FRONT BALLAST
SD_T2150 FRONT BALLAST
759844 L/FRONT WEIGHTS No Charge
No Front Weights
759771 FRNT BALLAST - 495KG TBD
838 Ibs/380 kg
REAR BALLAST
SD_T4960 WHEEL WEIGHTS
759845 L/WHEEL WEIGHTS 759845 No Charge
759773 | 6X50 Rear Wheel Weights 9000934P44 $1,198.00
Recommended for Loader Applications
6 x 110 Ibs (50 kg)
3 weights are on each side on the rear
Total weight = 660 Ibs. (300 kg)
759137 2X150KG + 2X250KG Wheel Weight 9001219P14 $1,563.00
Recommended for Loader Applications
2 x 331 Ibs. (150kg) and 2 x 551 Ibs. (250 kg)
2 weights are on each side on the rear
Total weight = 1,764 Ibs (800 kg)
ADDITIONAL EQUIPMENT
SD_T7642 1SO BUS
759757 L/ISOBUS SOCKET 759757 No Charge
758632 | ISO CL2+9PIN IN CAB 9000210P60 $270.00
Includes 9-pin in-cab connector on back RH c-pillar and
break-away connection on cab rear
758710 [ISO CL3+9PIN+SPEED 9000305P76 $392.00
OTHER OPTIONS
SD_T9850 SPECIAL COLORS/PANELS
759768 BASE COLOUR HI ROOF No Charge

Includes high visibility roof panel
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| |
CASE M T
AGRICULTURE
VESTRUM CVXDRIVE SERIES
US PRICE LIST
TIRE BRAND PREFERENCE
SD_T4900 TIRE CATEGORY CHOICE
330438 No tire brand preference No Charge
330418 | Trelleborg 9000436P80 $560.00
330442 Michelin 9000436P80 $560.00
330446 | Firestone 9000436P80 $560.00
OPERATOR'S MANUAL
SD_T9802 OPERATORS MANUAL
759854 L/ADD. OPS MANUAL No Charge
Includes standard English Operators Manual
Does not include additional Operators Manual
758534 | English USA No Charge
Extra Operators Manual
758535 | Spanish NAR No Charge
Extra Operators Manual
759101 French NAR No Charge
Extra Operators Manual
TELEMATICS
SD _T7625 TELEMATICS
759764 L/TELEMATICS No Charge
759394 Basic Telematics 9000557P70 $715.00

Offering includes: Mounting Kit, Modem, 1 Year
susbcription to AFS Connect Essential
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