
T-628(5)
TRACTORS, AG TYPE and ATTACHMENTS
#422-1118

AGRICULTURAL TYPE TRACTORS AND ATTACHMENTS
DISCOUNT OFF LIST
SPECIFICATION 3.0

November, 2019

Vendor Name:
Contact Person:
Street Address:
P.O. Box:
City, State, Zip
Phone #:
Toll Free #:
Email Address: seth@welters.net

Spec. Number Information Requested Answer

3.1 MANUFACTURER Case IH

3.2 DATE AND ID. OF PRICE LIST PL-100 CA Rev 1 Nov.1,2019

3.3 CATALOG SECTION TITLE Farmall A Series 95A,105A,115A 

3.4 PERCENTAGE DISCOUNT FROM PRICE LIST 14%

3.5 DISCOUNT OFF LIST PRICE FOR RELATED PARTS  & ACCESSORIES 
 (See Special Terms and Conditions) NO BID

3.6 PRICE FOR MANUALS (1 operator's manual included at no cost, per specs)
SERVICE MANUAL

Digital $150.00
Paper $750.00

PARTS MANUAL 
Digital Free on Line
Paper N/A

PRICE FOR ADDITIONAL OPERATIONS MANUAL 
Digital $100.00
Paper $250.00

3.7 PRICE FOR SET OF FLUID AND AIR FILTERS $650.00

3.8 STANDARD WARRANTY:  24 Month/2000 Hours

3.9 PERFORMANCE/EXTENDED WARRANTY OPTIONS
Offer performance/warranty options.  (Add additional lines if necessary.)
(Specify years, miles or hours extended term covers.)

______________________________________________ NO BID
______________________________________________ NO BID

3.10 INSTALLATION - PER HOUR  (Hourly Shop Rate) $119.00
Installation services may be requested on an "as needed" basis.
See Special Terms and Conditions

3.11 NEW EQUIPMENT RENTAL PROGRAM
If rental programs are available on the new equipment offered, with the option to purchase, list 
the hourly/weekly/monthly rental rate.  Indicate the percent of rental fee paid by the purchaser 
that will be applied to the purchase price.  See Solicitation Special Terms & Conditions.

Hourly Rental Rate: NO BID
Weekly Rental Rate:  NO BID
Monthly Rental Rate:  NO BID

Percent (%) of Rental Fee applied to purchase price:  NO BID

If the new rental equipment is purchased and finance
charges are applicable for the actual rental term only,
state the actual interest rate here:  ________________

3.12 VENDOR OWNED RENTAL RETURN OR DEMO EQUIPMENT PROGRAM
(See Special Terms and Conditions.)
DEDUCT cost per Used Hour from the original Contract Price NO BID

3.13 DELIVERY STARTING POINT -                                                   City, State, Zip Buffalo,Mn 55313
See Special Terms and Conditions - No flat rate allowed               $3.50 Per Loaded Mile

$250.00 Minimum

Buffalo,Mn<55313
763-682-2200
n/a

Trueman Welters
Seth Strehler
1600 Highway 55 east

mailto:seth@welters.net
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FARMALL UTILITY 95A
US PRICE LIST

-T1LA  01

Standard Equipment

 The Farmall Utility tractors from   Limited Slip
 Case IH are the perfect   Electro-Hydraulic engagement standard
 combination of basic value, comfort, and   Tread Width: 66.5 in. to 72.9 in.
 features with the visibility to ensure you   
 are productive in all your chores.   REAR AXLE

  Flange Type
 Farmall 95A   Tread Width: 63.8 in. to 79.5 in.
 97 Gross Engine hp
 78 PTO hp @ 2300 rpm   HYDRAULIC SYSTEM:
 4 Cyl Turbocharged Engine   Open Center System
 207cu in (3.4L) Displacement   Dual Gear Pumps

    Implement Pump: 16.9 gpm (64 L)
 ALL MODELS:     Steering Pump: 9.7 gpm (37 L)
 Tier B Emissions Compliant:     Total Flow: 26.6 gpm (101 L)
   (CEGR + SCR + CUC)   (2) Open Center Remote Valves with
 Electronic Injection Bosch     Detent & Kickout on #2 &
   High-pressure Common Rail System     Float on #1
 Electric Engine Shutoff
 Hand and Foot Throttle Controls   REAR DIFFERENTIAL LOCK:
 Grid Heater Starting Aid   Mechanically Engaged
 Powercore Dry Air Cleaner
 Under Hood Muffler   PTO:
 Vertical Exhaust   Fully Independent
 29 gal Fuel Tank   Flip-up PTO Shaft Guard
 2.9 gal DEF Tank   540 RPM hydraulic wet clutch
 2 function mid mount valve & joystick   Electronic engagement

  1-3/8 in. 6 splines

 TRANSMISSION:   3-POINT LIFT SYSTEM:
 LH side steering column mounted   Right hand console mounted
 Power Shuttle     lever control
   12 Forward and 12 Reverse Speeds   Mechanical Draft Control
   Creeper ready   3,200 Pounds Lift Capacity
   (4) Synchronized Gears   Category I/II Combi Ball Ends
   (3) Non-synchronized Ranges   Telescopic Stabilizers
   (2) clutches, 5 wet disc plates   Flexible Lower Link Ends
 FWD - 19 mph (30 KPH)
 Speed varies with tire selection   ELECTRICAL:
 Hand Operated Park Brake   (1) 900 cca Heavy-Duty Battery

  120 amp Alternator
 STEERING/BRAKES:   7-pin Outlet for trailer/implement lighting
 Hydrostatic Power Steering     and signals
 Brakes- Hydraulically assisted wet disc   30 amp power plug

  12V power socket (cigarette lighter)
 4WD FRONT AXLE:
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FARMALL UTILITY 95A
US PRICE LIST

-T1LA  01

Standard Equipment

 INSTRUMENTATION:     retractable seat belt and arm rests
 Digital /Analog Instrumentation with   Instructor Seat
 warning lights for turn signals, high   Suspended pedals
 beam, work lights, side lights,   Radio, speakers, and antenna
 rear PTO, 4WD, differential lock,
 low fuel, alternator, oil pressure,   MISCELLANEOUS:
 brake fluid, grid heater & hand brake   Pivoting Engine Hood
 Gauges for fuel level, engine   SMV Emblem
   temperature and tachometer   Toolbox
 Digital Readout for PTO speed,
   ground speed, battery, hours &   WARRANTY:
   DEF level percentage   Case IH Standard Warranty Applies

 LIGHTING:
 Front: (2) Halogen Headlights
          (2) cab mounted worklights
 Rear:  (2) cab mounted worklights
 Turn Signals/Flashers/Rear Lights

 TIRES:
 12.4x24 R1 Front
 18.4X30 R1 Rear

 OPERATOR PROTECTIVE STRUCTURE:
 CAB MODELS

 KEY SELLING POINTS
  - Best-in-Class value cab
  -Instructor seat
  - Air suspension seat
  - 12x12 power shuttle transmission
  - Lift-O-Matic

 ROPS protected, 4 post, flat deck
   platform with heat and air
   conditioning, tinted windshield,
   retractable sun screen, front wiper
   and washer, rear wiper and washer,
   two doors with locks, two external
   mirrors, hinged rear window (opens
   completely). High Vis Roof Panel
 Steering Wheel - adjustable tilt
 Seat - Cloth covered air suspension,
   operator's presence sensor,
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FARMALL UTILITY 95A
US PRICE LIST

-T1LA  01

Models

COMMERCIAL
MODEL

 VERSION  ENGINE POWER  TRACTION Weight Factory Data List Price

 FARMALL UTILITY
95A

 Cab  80 PTO HP (95
ENGINE HP)

 2WD  7,451 LB  9049331P10            $63,245.00

Includes the following Equipment
10.0 - 16 F/HD AXLE (8892303)           ($125.00)

 FARMALL UTILITY
95A

 Cab  80 PTO HP (95
ENGINE HP)

 MFD  7,936 LB  9053328P60            $68,370.00

 FARMALL UTILITY
95A

 Rops  80 PTO HP (95
ENGINE HP)

 2WD  7,936 LB  9037627P20            $48,240.00

Includes the following Equipment
10.0 - 16 F/HD AXLE (8892303)           ($125.00)

 FARMALL UTILITY
95A

 Rops  80 PTO HP (95
ENGINE HP)

 MFD  7,451 LB  9041624P70            $53,365.00

Factory Supplied Options

Order Code Description Weight Factory Data List Price

  PACKAGES

          SD_T9980    PACKAGING
       X99801X  Custom Configuration

  No Package selected; Custom build premium pricing.
            No Charge

-T1LA   01 052 000 01-FEB-20
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FARMALL UTILITY 95A
US PRICE LIST

-T1LA  01

                Cab Packages
       XF9911X   Standard Cab Fast Pick

  Standard Cab Fast Pick pricing includes:
    Cab with Hi Vis Panel
  -342043 (Exhaust Guard)
  -759926 (MMV & Joystick)
  -343422 (Loader Ready)
  -343425 (Less Bucket)
  -762052 (2 Rear Remotes)
  -XT8500X (Standard Seat)
  -X9150XX (Rear Wiper)
  -762204 HVAC Cab 2 Remotes PS)
  -342086 (2 External Mirrors)

  Allows for choice of the following:
  Tires:
    18.4-30 R1 rear with 12.4-24 R1 front OR
    16.9-34 R1 rear with 13.6-24 R1 front
  PTO:
    540 OR 540/1000 RPM
  Rear weights:
    4 rear wheel weights OR NO rear wheel weights

 (902964P00)           ($3,800.00)

                ROPS Packages
       XF9913X   Standard ROPS Fast Pick

  ROPS Standard Fast Pick pricing includes:
  -342043 (Exhaust Guard)
  -759926 (MMV & Joystick)
  -343422 (Loader Ready)
  -343425 (Less Bucket)
  -762052 (2 Rear Remotes)
  -342063 (Fabric Seat)

  Allows for choice of the following:
  Tires:
    18.4-30 R1 rear with 12.4-24 R1 front OR
    16.9-34 R1 rear with 13.6-24 R1 front
  PTO:
    540 OR 540/1000 RPM
  Rear weights:
    4 rear wheel weights OR NO rear wheel weights

 (902964P00)           ($3,800.00)

-T1LA   01 052 000 01-FEB-204 of 32



FARMALL UTILITY 95A
US PRICE LIST

-T1LA  01

       XF9915X  Poultry NSL Loader Fast Pick
  Poultry NSL Loader Fast Pick pricing includes:
  -343473 (Reversing Engine Fan)
  -759992 (Horizontal Exhaust)
  -759926 (MMV & Joystick)
  -343422 (Loader Ready)
  -343425 (Less Bucket)
  -762052 (2 Rear Remotes)
  -342063 (Fabric Seat)

  Allows for choice of the following:
  Tires:
    19.5L24 R4 rear with 12.5-80/18 R4 front OR
    500/60-22.5 R1 rear with 11.5/80-15.3 R1 front
  PTO:
    540 OR 540/1000 RPM
  Rear weights:
    4 rear wheel weights OR NO rear wheel weights

  Note: Order your NSL Loader through the Loader and Implement
  price book.

 (902964P00)           ($3,800.00)

       XF9916X  Poultry NO Loader Fast Pick
  Poultry NSL Loader Fast Pick pricing includes:
  -343473 (Reversing Engine Fan)
  -759992 (Horizontal Exhaust)
  -759926 (MMV & Joystick)
  -343425 (Less Bucket)
  -342063 (Fabric Seat)

  Allows for choice of the following:
  Tires:
    19.5L24 R4 rear with 12.5-80/18 R4 front OR
    500/60-22.5 R1 rear with 11.5/80-15.3 R1 front
  PTO:
    540 OR 540/1000 RPM
  Rear weights:
    4 rear wheel weights OR NO rear wheel weights

 (902964P00)           ($3,800.00)
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FARMALL UTILITY 95A
US PRICE LIST

-T1LA  01

       XF9917X  Low Profile All Purpose Fast P
  Low Profile All Purpose Fast Pick includes:
  -343473 (Reversing Engine Fan)
  -759623 (Down Exhaust)
  -759926 (MMV & Joystick)
  -343422 (Loader Ready)
  -343425 (Less Bucket)
  -342063 (Fabric Seat)

  Allows for choice of the following:
  Tires:
    16.9-30 R1 rear with 11.2-24 R1 front OR
    19.5L24 R4 rear with 12.5-80/18 R4 front OR
    500/60-22.5 R1 rear with 11.5/80-15.3 R1 front
  Rear Remotes:
    2 or 3 remotes
  PTO:
    540 OR 540/1000 RPM
  Rear weights:
    4 rear wheel weights OR NO rear wheel weights
  Front weights:
    8, 10 OR NO front weights

 (902964P00)           ($3,800.00)

       XF9918X  ROPS Mowing Fast Pick
  ROPS Mowing Fast Pick
  -343421 (Less loader ready)
    -762053 (3 rear remotes)

  Allows for choice of the following:
  Tires:
    18.4-30 R1 rear with 12.4-24 R1 front OR
    16.9-34 R1 rear with 13.6-24 R1 front
  PTO:
    540 OR 540/1000 RPM
  Rear weights:
    4, 8 OR NO rear wheel weights
  Front weights:
    8, 10 OR NO front weights

 (902964P00)           ($3,800.00)

  OPERATOR STRUCTURE

     OPERATOR STRUCTURE

          SD_T8500    SEAT
       342062  Driver Seat-Vinil

  Vinyl mechanical suspension seat for Open Platform models
  ROPS only

             No Charge

-T1LA   01 052 000 01-FEB-206 of 32



FARMALL UTILITY 95A
US PRICE LIST

-T1LA  01

       342063  Driver Seat-Fabric
  Air suspension seat
  Vinyl for Open Platform models
  ROPS only

             No Charge

       XT8500X  Standard seat
  Cab only

             No Charge

          SD_T9200    OPERATOR STRUCTURE #1
       762204  HVAC CAB 2 REMOTE PS

  Cab only
             No Charge

       762205  HVAC CAB 3 REMOTE PS
  Cab only

   9000624P00               $800.00

                Open Platform
       762132  OPEN STATION 762132

  Semi-straddle Open Platform with foldable ROPS
  Includes:
  - Rubber floor mat
  - Rear work light

             No Charge

  HITCH

          SD_T8200    HITCH
       342053  2000KG-Telesc/COMBI              No Charge

  HYDRAULICS

          SD_T8270    REAR REMOTES
       762052  2 REMOTE     762052              No Charge
       762053  3 REMOTE     762053

  3 rear remotes for Open Platform with foldable ROPS
    Float on remote 1 & 3
    Extend and retract detent and kick-out on remote 2

   9000624P00               $800.00

     HYDRAULIC PUMP

          SD_T8230    HYD PUMP
       342056  HYD PUMP 70,0 LPM              No Charge

  PTO

          SD_T8010    PTO
       759271  540 RPM W CAP              No Charge
       759272  540-540E RPM W CAP    9000354P90               $455.00
       759273  540-1000 RPM W CAP    9000413P40               $530.00
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FARMALL UTILITY 95A
US PRICE LIST

-T1LA  01

  FRONT WHEELS AND TIRES

          SD_T4940    FRONT WHEELS AND TIRES
                4WD Front Tires - Ag

       8230506  FRONT  12.4 - 24
  Requires 18.4-30 rear tires

             No Charge

       8220701  11.2 - 24
  Requires 16.9-30 rear tires

 (900046P80)              ($60.00)

       8230505  13.6 -24
  Requires 16.9-34 rear tires

   9000171P60               $220.00

       8811501  11.5/80-15.3
  Requires 500/60-22.5 rear tires
  (POULTRY PACKAGE/ROPS ONLY)

   9000546P00               $700.00

                2WD Front tires
       8892302  7.50 - 16 F/HD AXLE

  Requires 16.9-30 rear tires
 (900429P00)             ($550.00)

       8892303  10.0 - 16 F/HD AXLE
  Requires 18.4-30 or 16.9-34 rear tires

 (900097P50)             ($125.00)

                4WD Front Tires - Ind
       8230503  FRONT  12.5 - 18

  Requires 19.5L-24 rear tires
   9000546P00               $700.00

  REAR WHEELS AND TIRES

          SD_T4950    REAR WHEELS AND TIRES
                Rear tires - Ag

       8930605  REAR 18.4 - 30
  Requires 12.4-24 4WD front or 10.0-16 2WD front

             No Charge

       8930601  REAR  16.9 - 34
  Requires 13.6-24 4WD front or 10.0-16 2WD front

 (900109P20)             ($140.00)

       8930602  REAR  16.9 - 30
  Requires 11.2-24 4WD front or 7.50-16 2WD front

   9000234P00               $300.00

       8310501  500/60-22.5
  Requires 11.5/80-15.3 4WD front tires
  (POULTRY PACKAGE/ROPS ONLY)

   9000487P50               $625.00

                Rear tires - Ind
       8930603  REAR  19.5 - 24

  Requires 12.5/80-18 4WD front tires
   9000487P50               $625.00

  OTHER EQUIPMENT

          SD_T2151    WEIGHT PACK
       342067  Less CARRIER              No Charge

-T1LA   01 052 000 01-FEB-208 of 32



FARMALL UTILITY 95A
US PRICE LIST

-T1LA  01

       342069  110KgFC W/8X40-430kg
  Front carrier (154 lbs) + 8 weights (88lbs each) = 858 lbs

   9000780P00             $1,000.00

       342070  110KgFCW/10X40-510kg
  Front carrier (154 lbs) + 10 weights (88lbs each) = 1,034 lbs

   9000975P00             $1,250.00

          SD_T4960    WHEEL WEIGHTS
       342071  LESS/ REAR WEIGHTS              No Charge
       762028  2X55or32Kg EACH SIDE

  2 (110 lb) rear weights per side = 220 lbs total for all rear tires
    sizes except 500/60-22.5

  2 (70 lb) rear weights per side = 140 lbs total for 500/60-22.5
    rear tires

   9000491P40               $630.00

       759650  4X55or32Kg EACH SIDE
  4 (110 lb) rear weights per side = 440 lbs total for all rear tires
    sizes except 500/60-22.5

  4 (70 lb) rear weights per side = 280 lbs total for 500/60-22.5
    rear tires

   9000982P80             $1,260.00

  OPERATOR'S MANUAL

          SD_T9805    OPERATOR MANUAL (SE
       342075  English (USA)              No Charge
       342076  French (Canada)              No Charge
       342077  Spanish              No Charge

          SD_T9840    COUNTRY CONFIGURATION
       343432  LESS PACKAGE              No Charge
       343433  POULTRY PACKAGE

  Poultry House Special - 4WD ONLY

  Includes:  Engine reversing fan, low profile air suspension seat, and
    rearward facing horizontal exhaust

  Requires one of the following two tire choices:
    1. 500/60-22.5 R1 rear and 11.5/80-15.3 R1 front tires
    2.  19.5L24 R4 rear and 12.5/80-18 R4 front tires

  ROPS only

   9002457P00             $3,150.00
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FARMALL UTILITY 105A
US PRICE LIST

-T1LA  02

Standard Equipment

 The Farmall Utility tractors from   Limited Slip
 Case IH are the perfect   Electro-Hydraulic engagement standard
 combination of basic value, comfort, and   Tread Width: 66.5 in. to 72.9 in.
 features with the visibility to ensure you   
 are productive in all your chores.   REAR AXLE

  Flange Type
 Farmall 105A   Tread Width: 63.8 in. to 79.5 in.
 112 Gross Engine hp
 92 PTO hp @ 2300 rpm   HYDRAULIC SYSTEM:
 4 Cyl Turbocharged Engine   Open Center System
 207cu in (3.4L) Displacement   Dual Gear Pumps

    Implement Pump: 16.9 gpm (64 L)
 ALL MODELS:     Steering Pump: 9.7 gpm (37 L)
 Tier B Emissions Compliant:     Total Flow: 26.6 gpm (101 L)
   (CEGR + SCR + CUC)   (2) Open Center Remote Valves with
 Electronic Injection Bosch     Detent & Kickout on #2 &
   High-pressure Common Rail System     Float on #1
 Electric Engine Shutoff
 Hand and Foot Throttle Controls   REAR DIFFERENTIAL LOCK:
 Grid Heater Starting Aid   Mechanically Engaged
 Powercore Dry Air Cleaner
 Under Hood Muffler   PTO:
 Vertical Exhaust   Fully Independent
 29 gal Fuel Tank   Flip-up PTO Shaft Guard
 2.9 gal DEF Tank   540 RPM hydraulic wet clutch
 2 function mid mount valve & joystick   Electronic engagement

  1-3/8 in. 6 splines

 TRANSMISSION:   3-POINT LIFT SYSTEM:
 LH side steering column mounted   Right hand console mounted
 Power Shuttle     lever control
   12 Forward and 12 Reverse Speeds   Mechanical Draft Control
   Creeper ready   3,200 Pounds Lift Capacity
   (4) Synchronized Gears   Category I/II Combi Ball Ends
   (3) Non-synchronized Ranges   Telescopic Stabilizers
   (2) clutches, 5 wet disc plates   Flexible Lower Link Ends
 FWD - 19 mph (30 KPH)
 Speed varies with tire selection   ELECTRICAL:
 Hand Operated Park Brake   (1) 900 cca Heavy-Duty Battery

  120 amp Alternator
 STEERING/BRAKES:   7-pin Outlet for trailer/implement lighting
 Hydrostatic Power Steering     and signals
 Brakes- Hydraulically assisted wet disc   30 amp power plug

  12V power socket (cigarette lighter)
 4WD FRONT AXLE:
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FARMALL UTILITY 105A
US PRICE LIST

-T1LA  02

Standard Equipment

 INSTRUMENTATION:   Steering Wheel - adjustable tilt
 Digital /Analog Instrumentation with   Seat - Cloth covered air suspension,
 warning lights for turn signals, high     operator's presence sensor,
 beam, work lights, side lights,     retractable seat belt and arm rests
 rear PTO, 4WD, differential lock,   Instructor Seat
 low fuel, alternator, oil pressure,   Suspended pedals
 brake fluid, grid heater & hand brake   Radio, speakers, and antenna
 Gauges for fuel level, engine
   temperature and tachometer   MISCELLANEOUS:
 Digital Readout for PTO speed,   Pivoting Engine Hood
   ground speed, battery, hours &   SMV Emblem
   DEF level percentage   Toolbox

 LIGHTING:   WARRANTY:
 Front: (2) Halogen Headlights   Case IH Standard Warranty Applies
          (2) cab mounted worklights
 Rear:  (2) cab mounted worklights
 Turn Signals/Flashers/Rear Lights

 TIRES:
 12.4x24 R1 Front
 18.4X30 R1 Rear

 OPERATOR PROTECTIVE STRUCTURE:
 CAB MODELS

 KEY SELLING POINTS
  - Best-in-Class value cab
  -Instructor seat
  - Air suspension seat
  - 12x12 power shuttle transmission
  - Lift-O-Matic

 ROPS protected, 4 post, flat deck
   platform with heat and air
   conditioning, tinted windshield,
   retractable sun screen, front wiper
   and washer, rear wiper and washer,
   two doors with locks, two external
   mirrors, hinged rear window (opens
   completely). High Vis Roof Panel
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Factory Supplied Options

Order Code Description Weight Factory Data List Price

  PACKAGES

          SD_T9980    PACKAGING
       X99801X  Custom Configuration

  No Package selected; Custom build premium pricing.
             No Charge

                Cab Packages
       XF9911X   Standard Cab Fast Pick

  Standard Cab Fast Pick pricing includes:
    Cab with Hi Vis Panel
  -342043 (Exhaust Guard)
  -759926 (MMV & Joystick)
  -343422 (Loader Ready)
  -343425 (Less Bucket)
  -762052 (2 Rear Remotes)
  -XT8500X (Standard Seat)
  -X9150XX (Rear Wiper)
  -762204 HVAC Cab 2 Remotes PS)
  -342086 (2 External Mirrors)

  Allows for choice of the following:
  Tires:
    18.4-30 R1 rear with 12.4-24 R1 front OR
    16.9-34 R1 rear with 13.6-24 R1 front
  PTO:
    540 OR 540/1000 RPM
  Rear weights:
    4 rear wheel weights OR NO rear wheel weights

 (902964P00)           ($3,800.00)
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                ROPS Packages
       XF9913X   Standard ROPS Fast Pick

  ROPS Standard Fast Pick pricing includes:
  -342043 (Exhaust Guard)
  -759926 (MMV & Joystick)
  -343422 (Loader Ready)
  -343425 (Less Bucket)
  -762052 (2 Rear Remotes)
  -342063 (Fabric Seat)

  Allows for choice of the following:
  Tires:
    18.4-30 R1 rear with 12.4-24 R1 front OR
    16.9-34 R1 rear with 13.6-24 R1 front
  PTO:
    540 OR 540/1000 RPM
  Rear weights:
    4 rear wheel weights OR NO rear wheel weights

 (902964P00)           ($3,800.00)

       XF9915X  Poultry NSL Loader Fast Pick
  Poultry NSL Loader Fast Pick pricing includes:
  -343473 (Reversing Engine Fan)
  -759992 (Horizontal Exhaust)
  -759926 (MMV & Joystick)
  -343422 (Loader Ready)
  -343425 (Less Bucket)
  -762052 (2 Rear Remotes)
  -342063 (Fabric Seat)

  Allows for choice of the following:
  Tires:
    19.5L24 R4 rear with 12.5-80/18 R4 front OR
    500/60-22.5 R1 rear with 11.5/80-15.3 R1 front
  PTO:
    540 OR 540/1000 RPM
  Rear weights:
    4 rear wheel weights OR NO rear wheel weights

  Note: Order your NSL Loader through the Loader and Implement
  price book.

 (902964P00)           ($3,800.00)

-T1LA   02 052 000 01-FEB-2015 of 32



FARMALL UTILITY 105A
US PRICE LIST

-T1LA  02

       XF9916X  Poultry NO Loader Fast Pick
  Poultry NSL Loader Fast Pick pricing includes:
  -343473 (Reversing Engine Fan)
  -759992 (Horizontal Exhaust)
  -759926 (MMV & Joystick)
  -343425 (Less Bucket)
  -342063 (Fabric Seat)

  Allows for choice of the following:
  Tires:
    19.5L24 R4 rear with 12.5-80/18 R4 front OR
    500/60-22.5 R1 rear with 11.5/80-15.3 R1 front
  PTO:
    540 OR 540/1000 RPM
  Rear weights:
    4 rear wheel weights OR NO rear wheel weights

 (902964P00)           ($3,800.00)

       XF9917X  Low Profile All Purpose Fast P
  Low Profile All Purpose Fast Pick includes:
  -343473 (Reversing Engine Fan)
  -759623 (Down Exhaust)
  -759926 (MMV & Joystick)
  -343422 (Loader Ready)
  -343425 (Less Bucket)
  -342063 (Fabric Seat)

  Allows for choice of the following:
  Tires:
    16.9-30 R1 rear with 11.2-24 R1 front OR
    19.5L24 R4 rear with 12.5-80/18 R4 front OR
    500/60-22.5 R1 rear with 11.5/80-15.3 R1 front
  Rear Remotes:
    2 or 3 remotes
  PTO:
    540 OR 540/1000 RPM
  Rear weights:
    4 rear wheel weights OR NO rear wheel weights
  Front weights:
    8, 10 OR NO front weights

 (902964P00)           ($3,800.00)
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       XF9918X  ROPS Mowing Fast Pick
  ROPS Mowing Fast Pick
  -343421 (Less loader ready)
    -762053 (3 rear remotes)

  Allows for choice of the following:
  Tires:
    18.4-30 R1 rear with 12.4-24 R1 front OR
    16.9-34 R1 rear with 13.6-24 R1 front
  PTO:
    540 OR 540/1000 RPM
  Rear weights:
    4, 8 OR NO rear wheel weights
  Front weights:
    8, 10 OR NO front weights

 (902964P00)           ($3,800.00)

  OPERATOR STRUCTURE

     OPERATOR STRUCTURE

          SD_T8500    SEAT
       342062  Driver Seat-Vinil

  Vinyl mechanical suspension seat for Open Platform models
  ROPS only

             No Charge

       342063  Driver Seat-Fabric
  Air suspension seat
  Vinyl for Open Platform models
  ROPS only

             No Charge

       XT8500X  Standard seat
  Cab only

             No Charge

          SD_T9200    OPERATOR STRUCTURE #1
       762204  HVAC CAB 2 REMOTE PS

  Cab only
             No Charge

       762205  HVAC CAB 3 REMOTE PS
  Cab only

   9000624P00               $800.00

                Open Platform
       762132  OPEN STATION 762132

  Semi-straddle Open Platform with foldable ROPS
  Includes:
  - Rubber floor mat
  - Rear work light

             No Charge
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  HITCH

          SD_T8200    HITCH
       342053  2000KG-Telesc/COMBI              No Charge

  HYDRAULICS

          SD_T8270    REAR REMOTES
       762052  2 REMOTE     762052              No Charge
       762053  3 REMOTE     762053

  3 rear remotes for Open Platform with foldable ROPS
    Float on remote 1 & 3
    Extend and retract detent and kick-out on remote 2

   9000624P00               $800.00

     HYDRAULIC PUMP

          SD_T8230    HYD PUMP
       342056  HYD PUMP 70,0 LPM              No Charge

  PTO

          SD_T8010    PTO
       759271  540 RPM W CAP              No Charge
       759272  540-540E RPM W CAP    9000354P90               $455.00
       759273  540-1000 RPM W CAP    9000413P40               $530.00

  FRONT WHEELS AND TIRES

          SD_T4940    FRONT WHEELS AND TIRES
                4WD Front Tires - Ag

       8230506  FRONT  12.4 - 24
  Requires 18.4-30 rear tires

             No Charge

       8220701  11.2 - 24
  Requires 16.9-30 rear tires

 (900046P80)              ($60.00)

       8230505  13.6 -24
  Requires 16.9-34 rear tires

   9000171P60               $220.00

       8811501  11.5/80-15.3
  Requires 500/60-22.5 rear tires
  (POULTRY PACKAGE/ROPS ONLY)

   9000546P00               $700.00

                2WD Front tires
       8892302  7.50 - 16 F/HD AXLE

  Requires 16.9-30 rear tires
 (900429P00)             ($550.00)
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       8892303  10.0 - 16 F/HD AXLE
  Requires 18.4-30 or 16.9-34 rear tires

             No Charge

                4WD Front Tires - Ind
       8230503  FRONT  12.5 - 18

  Requires 19.5L-24 rear tires
   9000546P00               $700.00

  REAR WHEELS AND TIRES

          SD_T4950    REAR WHEELS AND TIRES
                Rear tires - Ag

       8930605  REAR 18.4 - 30
  Requires 12.4-24 4WD front or 10.0-16 2WD front

             No Charge

       8930601  REAR  16.9 - 34
  Requires 13.6-24 4WD front or 10.0-16 2WD front

 (900109P20)             ($140.00)

       8930602  REAR  16.9 - 30
  Requires 11.2-24 4WD front or 7.50-16 2WD front

   9000234P00               $300.00

       8310501  500/60-22.5
  Requires 11.5/80-15.3 4WD front tires
  (POULTRY PACKAGE/ROPS ONLY)

   9000487P50               $625.00

                Rear tires - Ind
       8930603  REAR  19.5 - 24

  Requires 12.5/80-18 4WD front tires
   9000487P50               $625.00

  OTHER EQUIPMENT

          SD_T2151    WEIGHT PACK
       342067  Less CARRIER              No Charge
       342069  110KgFC W/8X40-430kg

  Front carrier (154 lbs) + 8 weights (88lbs each) = 858 lbs
   9000780P00             $1,000.00

       342070  110KgFCW/10X40-510kg
  Front carrier (154 lbs) + 10 weights (88lbs each) = 1,034 lbs

   9000975P00             $1,250.00

          SD_T4960    WHEEL WEIGHTS
       342071  LESS/ REAR WEIGHTS              No Charge
       762028  2X55or32Kg EACH SIDE

  2 (110 lb) rear weights per side = 220 lbs total for all rear tires
    sizes except 500/60-22.5

  2 (70 lb) rear weights per side = 140 lbs total for 500/60-22.5
    rear tires

   9000491P40               $630.00
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       759650  4X55or32Kg EACH SIDE
  4 (110 lb) rear weights per side = 440 lbs total for all rear tires
    sizes except 500/60-22.5

  4 (70 lb) rear weights per side = 280 lbs total for 500/60-22.5
    rear tires

   9000982P80             $1,260.00

  OPERATOR'S MANUAL

          SD_T9805    OPERATOR MANUAL (SE
       342075  English (USA)              No Charge
       342076  French (Canada)              No Charge
       342077  Spanish              No Charge

          SD_T9840    COUNTRY CONFIGURATION
       343432  LESS PACKAGE              No Charge
       343433  POULTRY PACKAGE

  Poultry House Special - 4WD ONLY

  Includes:  Engine reversing fan, low profile air suspension seat, and
    rearward facing horizontal exhaust

  Requires one of the following two tire choices:
    1. 500/60-22.5 R1 rear and 11.5/80-15.3 R1 front tires
    2.  19.5L24 R4 rear and 12.5/80-18 R4 front tires

  ROPS only

   9002457P00             $3,150.00
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Standard Equipment

 The Farmall Utility tractors from   Limited Slip
 Case IH are the perfect   Electro-Hydraulic engagement standard
 combination of basic value, comfort, and   Tread Width: 66.5 in. to 72.9 in.
 features with the visibility to ensure you   
 are productive in all your chores.   REAR AXLE

  Flange Type
 Farmall 115A   Tread Width: 63.8 in. to 79.5 in.
 120 Gross Engine hp
 100 PTO hp @ 2300 rpm   HYDRAULIC SYSTEM:
 4 Cyl Turbocharged Engine   Open Center System
 207cu in (3.4L) Displacement   Dual Gear Pumps

    Implement Pump: 16.9 gpm (64 L)
 ALL MODELS:     Steering Pump: 9.7 gpm (37 L)
 Tier B Emissions Compliant:     Total Flow: 26.6 gpm (101 L)
   (CEGR + SCR + CUC)   (2) Open Center Remote Valves with
 Electronic Injection Bosch     Detent & Kickout on #2 &
   High-pressure Common Rail System     Float on #1
 Electric Engine Shutoff
 Hand and Foot Throttle Controls   REAR DIFFERENTIAL LOCK:
 Grid Heater Starting Aid   Mechanically Engaged
 Powercore Dry Air Cleaner
 Under Hood Muffler   PTO:
 Vertical Exhaust   Fully Independent
 29 gal Fuel Tank   Flip-up PTO Shaft Guard
 2.9 gal DEF Tank   540 RPM hydraulic wet clutch
 2 function mid mount valve & joystick   Electronic engagement

  1-3/8 in. 6 splines

 TRANSMISSION:   3-POINT LIFT SYSTEM:
 LH side steering column mounted   Right hand console mounted
 Power Shuttle     lever control
   12 Forward and 12 Reverse Speeds   Mechanical Draft Control
   Creeper ready   3,200 Pounds Lift Capacity
   (4) Synchronized Gears   Category I/II Combi Ball Ends
   (3) Non-synchronized Ranges   Telescopic Stabilizers
   (2) clutches, 5 wet disc plates   Flexible Lower Link Ends
 FWD - 19 mph (30 KPH)
 Speed varies with tire selection   ELECTRICAL:
 Hand Operated Park Brake   (1) 900 cca Heavy-Duty Battery

  120 amp Alternator
 STEERING/BRAKES:   7-pin Outlet for trailer/implement lighting
 Hydrostatic Power Steering     and signals
 Brakes- Hydraulically assisted wet disc   30 amp power plug

  12V power socket (cigarette lighter)
 4WD FRONT AXLE:
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Standard Equipment

 INSTRUMENTATION:     two doors with locks, two external
 Digital /Analog Instrumentation with     mirrors, hinged rear window (opens
 warning lights for turn signals, high     completely). High Vis Roof Panel
 beam, work lights, side lights,   Steering Wheel - adjustable tilt
 rear PTO, 4WD, differential lock,   Seat - Cloth covered air suspension,
 low fuel, alternator, oil pressure,     operator's presence sensor,
 brake fluid, grid heater & hand brake     retractable seat belt and arm rests
 Gauges for fuel level, engine   Instructor Seat
   temperature and tachometer   Suspended pedals
 Digital Readout for PTO speed,   Radio, speakers, and antenna
   ground speed, battery, hours &
   DEF level percentage   MISCELLANEOUS:

  Pivoting Engine Hood
 LIGHTING:   SMV Emblem
 Front: (2) Halogen Headlights   Toolbox
          (2) cab mounted worklights
 Rear:  (2) cab mounted worklights   WARRANTY:
 Turn Signals/Flashers/Rear Lights   Case IH Standard Warranty Applies

 TIRES:
 12.4x24 R1 Front
 18.4X30 R1 Rear

 OPERATOR PROTECTIVE STRUCTURE:
 CAB MODELS

 KEY SELLING POINTS
  - Best-in-Class value cab
  -Instructor seat
  - Air suspension seat
  - 12x12 power shuttle transmission
  - Lift-O-Matic

 ROPS protected, 4 post, flat deck
   platform with heat and air
   conditioning, tinted windshield,
   retractable sun screen, front wiper
   and washer, rear wiper and washer,

 -T1LA   03 052 000 01-FEB-20
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Order Code Description Weight Factory Data List Price

  PACKAGES

          SD_T9980    PACKAGING
       X99801X  Custom Configuration

  No Package selected; Custom build premium pricing.
             No Charge

                Cab Packages
       XF9911X   Standard Cab Fast Pick

  Standard Cab Fast Pick pricing includes:
    Cab with Hi Vis Panel
  -342043 (Exhaust Guard)
  -759926 (MMV & Joystick)
  -343422 (Loader Ready)
  -343425 (Less Bucket)
  -762052 (2 Rear Remotes)
  -XT8500X (Standard Seat)
  -X9150XX (Rear Wiper)
  -762204 HVAC Cab 2 Remotes PS)
  -342086 (2 External Mirrors)

  Allows for choice of the following:
  Tires:
    18.4-30 R1 rear with 12.4-24 R1 front OR
    16.9-34 R1 rear with 13.6-24 R1 front
  PTO:
    540 OR 540/1000 RPM
  Rear weights:
    4 rear wheel weights OR NO rear wheel weights

 (902964P00)           ($3,800.00)
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                ROPS Packages
       XF9913X   Standard ROPS Fast Pick

  ROPS Standard Fast Pick pricing includes:
  -342043 (Exhaust Guard)
  -759926 (MMV & Joystick)
  -343422 (Loader Ready)
  -343425 (Less Bucket)
  -762052 (2 Rear Remotes)
  -342063 (Fabric Seat)

  Allows for choice of the following:
  Tires:
    18.4-30 R1 rear with 12.4-24 R1 front OR
    16.9-34 R1 rear with 13.6-24 R1 front
  PTO:
    540 OR 540/1000 RPM
  Rear weights:
    4 rear wheel weights OR NO rear wheel weights

 (902964P00)           ($3,800.00)

       XF9915X  Poultry NSL Loader Fast Pick
  Poultry NSL Loader Fast Pick pricing includes:
  -343473 (Reversing Engine Fan)
  -759992 (Horizontal Exhaust)
  -759926 (MMV & Joystick)
  -343422 (Loader Ready)
  -343425 (Less Bucket)
  -762052 (2 Rear Remotes)
  -342063 (Fabric Seat)

  Allows for choice of the following:
  Tires:
    19.5L24 R4 rear with 12.5-80/18 R4 front OR
    500/60-22.5 R1 rear with 11.5/80-15.3 R1 front
  PTO:
    540 OR 540/1000 RPM
  Rear weights:
    4 rear wheel weights OR NO rear wheel weights

  Note: Order your NSL Loader through the Loader and Implement
  price book.

 (902964P00)           ($3,800.00)
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       XF9916X  Poultry NO Loader Fast Pick
  Poultry NSL Loader Fast Pick pricing includes:
  -343473 (Reversing Engine Fan)
  -759992 (Horizontal Exhaust)
  -759926 (MMV & Joystick)
  -343425 (Less Bucket)
  -342063 (Fabric Seat)

  Allows for choice of the following:
  Tires:
    19.5L24 R4 rear with 12.5-80/18 R4 front OR
    500/60-22.5 R1 rear with 11.5/80-15.3 R1 front
  PTO:
    540 OR 540/1000 RPM
  Rear weights:
    4 rear wheel weights OR NO rear wheel weights

 (902964P00)           ($3,800.00)

       XF9917X  Low Profile All Purpose Fast P
  Low Profile All Purpose Fast Pick includes:
  -343473 (Reversing Engine Fan)
  -759623 (Down Exhaust)
  -759926 (MMV & Joystick)
  -343422 (Loader Ready)
  -343425 (Less Bucket)
  -342063 (Fabric Seat)

  Allows for choice of the following:
  Tires:
    16.9-30 R1 rear with 11.2-24 R1 front OR
    19.5L24 R4 rear with 12.5-80/18 R4 front OR
    500/60-22.5 R1 rear with 11.5/80-15.3 R1 front
  Rear Remotes:
    2 or 3 remotes
  PTO:
    540 OR 540/1000 RPM
  Rear weights:
    4 rear wheel weights OR NO rear wheel weights
  Front weights:
    8, 10 OR NO front weights

 (902964P00)           ($3,800.00)
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       XF9918X  ROPS Mowing Fast Pick
  ROPS Mowing Fast Pick
  -343421 (Less loader ready)
    -762053 (3 rear remotes)

  Allows for choice of the following:
  Tires:
    18.4-30 R1 rear with 12.4-24 R1 front OR
    16.9-34 R1 rear with 13.6-24 R1 front
  PTO:
    540 OR 540/1000 RPM
  Rear weights:
    4, 8 OR NO rear wheel weights
  Front weights:
    8, 10 OR NO front weights

 (902964P00)           ($3,800.00)

  OPERATOR STRUCTURE

     OPERATOR STRUCTURE

          SD_T8500    SEAT
       342062  Driver Seat-Vinil

  Vinyl mechanical suspension seat for Open Platform models
  ROPS only

             No Charge

       342063  Driver Seat-Fabric
  Air suspension seat
  Vinyl for Open Platform models
  ROPS only

             No Charge

       XT8500X  Standard seat
  Cab only

             No Charge

          SD_T9200    OPERATOR STRUCTURE #1
       762204  HVAC CAB 2 REMOTE PS

  Cab only
             No Charge

       762205  HVAC CAB 3 REMOTE PS
  Cab only

   9000624P00               $800.00

                Open Platform
       762132  OPEN STATION 762132

  Semi-straddle Open Platform with foldable ROPS
  Includes:
  - Rubber floor mat
  - Rear work light

             No Charge
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  HITCH

          SD_T8200    HITCH
       342053  2000KG-Telesc/COMBI              No Charge

  HYDRAULICS

          SD_T8270    REAR REMOTES
       762052  2 REMOTE     762052              No Charge
       762053  3 REMOTE     762053

  3 rear remotes for Open Platform with foldable ROPS
    Float on remote 1 & 3
    Extend and retract detent and kick-out on remote 2

   9000624P00               $800.00

     HYDRAULIC PUMP

          SD_T8230    HYD PUMP
       342056  HYD PUMP 70,0 LPM              No Charge

  PTO

          SD_T8010    PTO
       759271  540 RPM W CAP              No Charge
       759272  540-540E RPM W CAP    9000354P90               $455.00
       759273  540-1000 RPM W CAP    9000413P40               $530.00

  FRONT WHEELS AND TIRES

          SD_T4940    FRONT WHEELS AND TIRES
                4WD Front Tires - Ag

       8230506  FRONT  12.4 - 24
  Requires 18.4-30 rear tires

             No Charge

       8220701  11.2 - 24
  Requires 16.9-30 rear tires

 (900046P80)              ($60.00)

       8230505  13.6 -24
  Requires 16.9-34 rear tires

   9000171P60               $220.00

       8811501  11.5/80-15.3
  Requires 500/60-22.5 rear tires
  (POULTRY PACKAGE/ROPS ONLY)

   9000546P00               $700.00

                2WD Front tires
       8892302  7.50 - 16 F/HD AXLE

  Requires 16.9-30 rear tires
 (900429P00)             ($550.00)
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       8892303  10.0 - 16 F/HD AXLE
  Requires 18.4-30 or 16.9-34 rear tires

             No Charge

                4WD Front Tires - Ind
       8230503  FRONT  12.5 - 18

  Requires 19.5L-24 rear tires
   9000546P00               $700.00

  REAR WHEELS AND TIRES

          SD_T4950    REAR WHEELS AND TIRES
                Rear tires - Ag

       8930605  REAR 18.4 - 30
  Requires 12.4-24 4WD front or 10.0-16 2WD front

             No Charge

       8930601  REAR  16.9 - 34
  Requires 13.6-24 4WD front or 10.0-16 2WD front

 (900109P20)             ($140.00)

       8930602  REAR  16.9 - 30
  Requires 11.2-24 4WD front or 7.50-16 2WD front

   9000234P00               $300.00

       8310501  500/60-22.5
  Requires 11.5/80-15.3 4WD front tires
  (POULTRY PACKAGE/ROPS ONLY)

   9000487P50               $625.00

                Rear tires - Ind
       8930603  REAR  19.5 - 24

  Requires 12.5/80-18 4WD front tires
   9000487P50               $625.00

  OTHER EQUIPMENT

          SD_T2151    WEIGHT PACK
       342067  Less CARRIER              No Charge
       342069  110KgFC W/8X40-430kg

  Front carrier (154 lbs) + 8 weights (88lbs each) = 858 lbs
   9000780P00             $1,000.00

       342070  110KgFCW/10X40-510kg
  Front carrier (154 lbs) + 10 weights (88lbs each) = 1,034 lbs

   9000975P00             $1,250.00

          SD_T4960    WHEEL WEIGHTS
       342071  LESS/ REAR WEIGHTS              No Charge
       762028  2X55or32Kg EACH SIDE

  2 (110 lb) rear weights per side = 220 lbs total for all rear tires
    sizes except 500/60-22.5

  2 (70 lb) rear weights per side = 140 lbs total for 500/60-22.5
    rear tires

   9000491P40               $630.00
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       759650  4X55or32Kg EACH SIDE
  4 (110 lb) rear weights per side = 440 lbs total for all rear tires
    sizes except 500/60-22.5

  4 (70 lb) rear weights per side = 280 lbs total for 500/60-22.5
    rear tires

   9000982P80             $1,260.00

  OPERATOR'S MANUAL

          SD_T9805    OPERATOR MANUAL (SE
       342075  English (USA)              No Charge
       342076  French (Canada)              No Charge
       342077  Spanish              No Charge

          SD_T9840    COUNTRY CONFIGURATION
       343432  LESS PACKAGE              No Charge
       343433  POULTRY PACKAGE

  Poultry House Special - 4WD ONLY

  Includes:  Engine reversing fan, low profile air suspension seat, and
    rearward facing horizontal exhaust

  Requires one of the following two tire choices:
    1. 500/60-22.5 R1 rear and 11.5/80-15.3 R1 front tires
    2.  19.5L24 R4 rear and 12.5/80-18 R4 front tires

  ROPS only

   9002457P00             $3,150.00
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Pricing and program details can be found on the Dealer Portal or by contacting 
the CPP hotline @ 1-866-606-1802.  Not all models are eligible for CPP.
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