T-628(5)

AGRICULTURAL TYPE TRACTORS AND ATTACHMENTS

TRACTORS, AG TYPE and ATTACHMENTS DISCOUNT OFF LIST

#422-1118

Vendor Name:
Contact Person:
Street Address:
P.O. Box:

City, State, Zip
Phone #:

Toll Free #:
Email Address:

SPECIFICATION 3.0

Trueman Welters

November, 2019

Seth Strehler

1600 Highway 55 east

Buffalo,Mn<55313

763-682-2200

n/a

seth@welters.net

Spec. Number Information Requested Answer
3.1 MANUFACTURER Case |H
3.2 DATE AND ID. OF PRICE LIST PL-100 FA Rev 13 Jan.2,2020
3.3 CATALOG SECTION TITLE Farmall A Series 50A,60A,70A NO CAB
3.4 PERCENTAGE DISCOUNT FROM PRICE LIST 21%

3.5 DISCOUNT OFF LIST PRICE FOR RELATED PARTS & ACCESSORIES
(See Special Terms and Conditions) NO BID
3.6 PRICE FOR MANUALS (1 operator's manual included at no cost, per specs)
SERVICE MANUAL
Digital $150.00
Paper $750.00
PARTS MANUAL
Digital Free on Line
Paper N/A
PRICE FOR ADDITIONAL OPERATIONS MANUAL
Digital $100.00
Paper $250.00
3.7 PRICE FOR SET OF FLUID AND AIR FILTERS $500.00
3.8 STANDARD WARRANTY: 24 Month/2000 Hours
3.9 PERFORMANCE/EXTENDED WARRANTY OPTIONS
Offer performance/warranty options. (Add additional lines if necessary.)
(Specify years, miles or hours extended term covers.)
NO BID
NO BID
3.10 INSTALLATION - PER HOUR (Hourly Shop Rate) $119.00
Installation services may be requested on an "as needed" basis.
See Special Terms and Conditions
3.11 NEW EQUIPMENT RENTAL PROGRAM
If rental programs are available on the new equipment offered, with the option to purchase, list
the hourly/weekly/monthly rental rate. Indicate the percent of rental fee paid by the purchaser
that will be applied to the purchase price. See Solicitation Special Terms & Conditions.
Hourly Rental Rate: NO BID
Weekly Rental Rate: NO BID
Monthly Rental Rate: NO BID
Percent (%) of Rental Fee applied to purchase price: NO BID
If the new rental equipment is purchased and finance
charges are applicable for the actual rental term only,
state the actual interest rate here:
3.12 VENDOR OWNED RENTAL RETURN OR DEMO EQUIPMENT PROGRAM
(See Special Terms and Conditions.)
DEDUCT cost per Used Hour from the original Contract Price NO BID
3.13 DELIVERY STARTING POINT - City, State, Zip Buffalo,Mn 55313

See Special Terms and Conditions - No flat rate allowed

$3.50 Per Loaded Mile

$250.00 Minimum
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CASE Hi

AGRICULTURE

-T1IX 01

FARMALL 50A
US PRICE LIST

Standard Equipment

DIESEL ENGINE:
Farmall 50A
53 Engine HP @ 2700
46 PTO HP @ 2700
3 Cylinder Turbo Charged
(Tier 4 B/Final) Engine
136 cu in (2.2 L) Displacement
13 Gallon Fuel Tank
High pressure common rail fuel system
Electric Engine Shutoff
Hand and Foot Throttle Controls
Thermostart Starting Aid
Air Cleaner with safety element
Under Hood Muffler
Downdraft Exhaust
Fuel Sediment Filter
Pivoting Engine Hood (full raise)
SMV Emblem

TRANSMISSION:
11 inch Traction Clutch
8 x 8 Transmission with Left Hand
Shuttle (Gears Synchronized,
Ranges are non-Synchronized)

FRONT AXLE:

Two-wheel Drive (2WD):
Adjustable Front Axle
Adjustable Rear Rims

Four-wheel Drive (4WD):
Mechanical FWD Engagement
Front Drive Shaft Shield
Adjustable Front & Rear Rims

TIRES:
Tires - 2wd - F-2 Multiple-rib
Front: 7.5 X 16 6PR (F-2)
Rear: 13.6 X 28 8PR (R-1)
Tires - 4wd -R-1 Agriculture
Front: 8.3 X 24 6PR (R-1)
Rear: 13.6 X 28 8PR (R-1)
Tires - 4wd -R-4 Industrial
Front: 12.4 X 20 6PR (R-4)
Rear: 18.4 X 24 6PR (R-4)

HYDRAULIC SYSTEM:
Hydrostatic Power Steering
Open Center System
1 Lever Controlled Rear Remote Valve

(Self Centering)
Dual Gear Pumps
Total Hydraulic Flow:

17.4 gpm (66 L/M)
Implement Pump:

11.9 gpm (45 L/M)
Steering Pump:

5.5 gpm (21 L/M)

DIFFERENTIAL LOCKS/ BRAKES:

Rear Axle provides In-board Planetary
Rear Lock - Mechanical Engage
Mechanical Wet Brakes

Park Brake - hand engagement

PTO:

11 inch PTO Clutch

Independent, 540 rpm PTO

Single Lever, Mechanical Engagement
Flip-up PTO Shaft Guard

3-POINT LIFT SYSTEM:
Single Lever Position Control
Lift Capacity @ 24" behind ball ends:
2710 lbs. (1225 kg)
Category 11 (convertible to
Category 1 with bushings)
Telescoping Stabilizers
Flexible Link Ends
Flat Swinging Drawbar
Draft Control

INSTRUMENTATION:

Digital/Analog Instrument Panel with
warning lights plus engine
temperature, fuel level gauges,
tachometer and digital hour meter

10f20 -T1IX 01 051 000 01-JAN-20




CASE i B

AGRICULTURE

FARMALL 50A
US PRICE LIST

Standard Equipment

ELECTRICAL: WARRANTY :

(1) 12-volt, 720 CCA Battery Case IH Standard Warranty Applies
Alternator = 75 amp

7-pin Outlet for trailer/ OPERATOR"™S STATION:

implement lighting Straddle Deck Configuration
2-post Foldable ROPS

LIGHTING: Vinyl Seat with Operator”s
(2) Halogen front headlights Presence Sensor

(2) Halogen corner work lights Retractable Seat Belt

Tail lights /7 brake lights Cup Holder

Turn signals, Flashing warning lights Toolbox

20f20 -T1IX 01 051 000 01-JAN-20
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CASE M B
AGRICULTURE
FARMALL 50A
US PRICE LIST
Models
COMMERCIAL ENGINE POWER TRACTION Weight Factory Data List Price
MODEL
FARMALL 50A 50 HP 2WD 3,200 LB 9021200P28 $25,854.00
TRACTOR
FARMALL 50A 50 HP MFD 3,200 LB 9024089P 14 $29,377.00
TRACTOR
Factory Supplied Options
| Order Code Description | Weight Factory Data List Price |
| PACKAGES |
SD_T9980 PACKAGING
| | | X99801X [ Custom Configuration No Charge|
| ENGINE |
[ EXHAUST SYSTEMS |
SD_T1940 EXHAUST
337889 | Silencer Downswept No Charge
Required for Complete Loader Ready
337891 | Vertical Exhaust 9000016P40 $20.00
HYDRAULICS
SD_T8270 REAR REMOTES
337984 | 1 Remote - Float + Detent No Charge
337985 | 2 Remote 1 + Kickout 9000423P94 $517.00
PTO
SD_T8010 PTO
337896 | 540 RPM -Single PTO No Charge
337898 | 540 and 540E RPM PTO 9000423P94 $517.00

30f20
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CASE Il B
AGRICULTURE
FARMALL 50A
US PRICE LIST
FRONT WHEELS AND TIRES
SD_T4940 FRONT WHEELS AND TIRES
8199101 | Front Shipping Wheels-2wd (900221P40) ($270.00)
Disposable upon delivery; no return credit.
8299905 | Front Shipping Wheels-4WD (900266P50) ($325.00)
Disposable upon delivery; no return credit.
8840701 | Front - R4 -Tire 12.5x18 - 4WD 9000305P04 $372.00
8270600 | Front Wheel - 7.5 x 16 - 2WD No Charge
7.50 X 16 6PR (F-2) Multiple-rib
8270605 | Front Wheel - 8.3 X 24 - 4WD No Charge
8.3 X 24 6PR (R-1) Agricultural
8812461 | FR-R4-RYRE 11Lx15F3 - 2WD 9000221P40 $270.00
11L X 15 6PR (F-3) Multiple-rib
(Required with R-4 Industrial rear tire)
8812451 | FR-R4 TYRE 12.4x20 9000305P04 $372.00
12.4 X 20 (R-4) Industrial
8812471 | FR-R-3TYRE-9.5X24 - 4WD 9000305P04 $372.00
9.5 X 24 4PR (R-3) Turf
REAR WHEELS AND TIRES
SD_T4950 REAR WHEELS AND TIRES
8399905 | Shipping Wheels-Rear (900443P62) ($541.00)
Disposable upon delivery; no return credit.
8980270 | Rear Wheel - 13.6x28 No Charge
13.6 x 28 8PR (R-1) Agricultural
8940301 | Rear- R4 -18.4x 24 9000431P32 $526.00
18.4 X 24 (R-4) Industrial
8912481 | RR-R3-16.9x24 9000431P32 $526.00
16.9 X 24 6PR (R-3) Turf
| LOADER
| LOADER EQUIPMENT
SD_T8110 LOADER BRACKETS
337444 | Loader Mount Ready 9002554P30 $3,115.00

Complete Loader Ready includes

Mount Bracket Set (with Grill Guard) and
Mid Mounted Valve - 2 function mechanical
(Includes valve, joystick, cables, & hose kit)

4 of 20
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CASE Hi

AGRICULTURE

-T1IX 01

FARMALL 50A
US PRICE LIST

| OTHER EQUIPMENT

|  REAR BALLAST

SD_T4960 WHEEL WEIGHTS

337926 | Less Rear Ballast No Charge

337925 | Rear Weight - 40kg Each 9000246P00 $300.00
Rear Wheel Weight - 88 Ibs./40kg each side

338163 | Rear Weight 55kg Each 9000265P68 $324.00
Rear Wheel Weight - 121 Ibs./55kg each side
For R4 Tires Only

OPERATOR'S MANUAL
SD_T9800 OPERATORS MANUAL
337951 English Manual No Charge
337952 | French Manual No Charge

50f20
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CASE Hi

AGRICULTURE

-T1IX 02

FARMALL 60A
US PRICE LIST

Standard Equipment

DIESEL ENGINE:
Farmall 60A
60 Engine HP @ 2700
51 PTO HP @ 2700
3 Cylinder Turbo Charged
(Tier 4 B/Final) Engine
136 cu in (2.2 L) Displacement
13 Gallon Fuel Tank
High pressure common rail fuel system
Electric Engine Shutoff
Hand and Foot Throttle Controls
Thermostart Starting Aid
Air Cleaner with safety element
Under Hood Muffler
Downdraft Exhaust
Fuel Sediment Filter
Pivoting Engine Hood (full raise)
SMV Emblem

TRANSMISSION:
11 inch Traction Clutch
8 x 8 Transmission with Left Hand
Shuttle (Gears Synchronized,
Ranges are non-Synchronized)

FRONT AXLE:

Two-wheel Drive (2WD):
Adjustable Front Axle
Adjustable Rear Rims

Four-wheel Drive (4WD):
Mechanical FWD Engagement
Front Drive Shaft Shield
Adjustable Front & Rear Rims

TIRES:
Tires - 2wd - F-2 Ag Multiple-rib
Front: 7.5 X 16 6PR (F-2)
Rear: 14.9 X 28 8PR (R-1)
Tires - 4wd -R-1 Agriculture
Front: 9.5 X 24 6PR (R-1)
Rear: 14.9 X 28 8PR (R-1)
Tires - 4wd -R-4 Industrial
Front: 12.4 X 20 6PR (R-4)
Rear: 18.4 X 24 6PR (R-4)

HYDRAULIC SYSTEM:
Hydrostatic Power Steering
Open Center System
1 Lever Controlled Rear Remote Valve

(Self Centering)
Dual Gear Pumps
Total Hydraulic Flow:

17.4 gpm (66 L/M)
Implement Pump:

11.9 gpm (45 L/M)
Steering Pump:

5.5 gpm (21 L/M)

DIFFERENTIAL LOCKS/ BRAKES:

Rear Axle provides In-board Planetary
Rear Lock - Mechanical Engage
Mechanical Wet Brakes

Park Brake - hand engagement

PTO:

11 inch PTO Clutch

Independent, 540 rpm PTO

Single Lever, Mechanical Engagement
Flip-up PTO Shaft Guard

3-POINT LIFT SYSTEM:
Single Lever Position Control
Lift Capacity @ 24" behind ball ends:
2710 lbs. (1225 kg)
Category 11 (convertible to
Category 1 with bushings)
Telescoping Stabilizers
Flexible Link Ends
Flat Swinging Drawbar
Draft Control

INSTRUMENTATION:

Digital/Analog Instrument Panel with
warning lights plus engine
temperature, fuel level gauges,
tachometer and digital hour meter
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CASE i T

AGRICULTURE

FARMALL 60A
US PRICE LIST

Standard Equipment

ELECTRICAL: WARRANTY :

(1) 12-volt, 720 CCA Battery Case IH Standard Warranty Applies
Alternator = 75 amp

7-pin Outlet for trailer/ OPERATOR"™S STATION:

implement lighting Straddle Deck Configuration
2-post Foldable ROPS

LIGHTING: Vinyl Seat with Operator”s
(2) Halogen front headlights Presence Sensor

(2) Halogen corner work lights Retractable Seat Belt

Tail lights /7 brake lights Cup Holder

Turn signals, Flashing warning lights Toolbox

80of 20 -T1IX 02 051 000 01-JAN-20
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CASE M T
AGRICULTURE
FARMALL 60A
US PRICE LIST
Models
COMMERCIAL ENGINE POWER TRACTION Weight Factory Data List Price
MODEL
FARMALL 60A 60 HP 2WD 3,200 LB 9022298P26 $27,193.00
TRACTOR
FARMALL 60A 60 HP MFD 3,200 LB 9025980P06 $31,683.00
TRACTOR
Factory Supplied Options
| Order Code Description | Weight Factory Data List Price |
| PACKAGES |
SD_T9980 PACKAGING
| | | X99801X [ Custom Configuration No Charge|
| ENGINE |
EXHAUST SYSTEMS |
SD_T1940 EXHAUST
337889 | Silencer Downswept No Charge
Required for Complete Loader Ready
337891 | Vertical Exhaust 9000016P40 $20.00
HYDRAULICS
SD_T8270 REAR REMOTES
337984 | 1 Remote - Float + Detent No Charge
337985 | 2 Remote 1 + Kickout 9000423P94 $517.00
PTO
SD_T8010 PTO
337896 | 540 RPM -Single PTO No Charge
337898 | 540 and 540E RPM PTO 9000423P94 $517.00
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CASE Il T
AGRICULTURE
FARMALL 60A
US PRICE LIST
FRONT WHEELS AND TIRES
SD_T4940 FRONT WHEELS AND TIRES
8199101 | Front Shipping Wheels-2wd (900221P40) ($270.00)
Disposable upon delivery; no return credit.
8299905 | Front Shipping Wheels-4WD (900266P50) ($325.00)
Disposable upon delivery; no return credit.
8840701 | Front - R4 -Tire 12.5x18 - 4WD 9000305P04 $372.00
8270600 | Front Wheel - 7.5 x 16 - 2WD No Charge
7.50 X 16 6PR (F-2) Multiple-rib
8270601 | Front Wheel - 9.5 X 24 - 4WD No Charge
9.5 X 24 6PR (R-1) Agricultural
8812461 | FR-R4-RYRE 11Lx15F3 - 2WD 9000221P40 $270.00
11L X 15 6PR (F-3) Multiple-rib
(Required with R-4 Industrial rear tire)
8812451 | FR-R4 TYRE 12.4x20 9000305P04 $372.00
12.4 X 20 (R-4) Industrial
8812471 | FR-R-3TYRE-9.5X24 - 4WD 9000305P04 $372.00
9.5 X 24 4PR (R-3) Turf
REAR WHEELS AND TIRES
SD_T4950 REAR WHEELS AND TIRES
8399905 | Shipping Wheels-Rear (900443P62) ($541.00)
Disposable upon delivery; no return credit.
8980280 | Rear Wheel - 14.9x28 No Charge
14.9 X 28 8PR (R-1) Agricultural
8940301 | Rear- R4 -18.4x 24 9000431P32 $526.00
18.4 X 24 (R-4) Industrial
8912481 | RR-R3-16.9x24 9000431P32 $526.00
16.9 X 24 6PR (R-3) Turf
| LOADER
| LOADER EQUIPMENT
SD_T8110 LOADER BRACKETS
337444 | Loader Mount Ready 9002554P30 $3,115.00

Complete Loader Ready includes

Mount Bracket Set (with Grill Guard) and
Mid Mounted Valve - 2 function mechanical
(Includes valve, joystick, cables, & hose kit)
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CASE Hi

AGRICULTURE

-T1IX 02

FARMALL 60A
US PRICE LIST

| OTHER EQUIPMENT

|  REAR BALLAST

SD_T4960 WHEEL WEIGHTS

337926 | Less Rear Ballast No Charge

337925 | Rear Weight - 40kg Each 9000246P00 $300.00
Rear Wheel Weight - 88 Ibs./40kg each side

338163 | Rear Weight 55kg Each 9000265P68 $324.00
Rear Wheel Weight - 121 Ibs./55kg each side
For R4 Tires Only

OPERATOR'S MANUAL
SD_T9800 OPERATORS MANUAL
337951 English Manual No Charge
337952 | French Manual No Charge
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CASE Hi

AGRICULTURE

-T1IX 03

FARMALL 70A
US PRICE LIST

Standard Equipment

DIESEL ENGINE:
Farmall 70A
70 Engine HP @ 2700
62 PTO HP @ 2700
3 Cylinder Turbo Charged
(Tier 4 B/Final) Engine
136 cu in (2.2 L) Displacement
13 Gallon Fuel Tank
High pressure common rail fuel system
Electric Engine Shutoff
Hand and Foot Throttle Controls
Thermostart Starting Aid
Air Cleaner with safety element
Under Hood Muffler
Downdraft Exhaust
Fuel Sediment Filter
Pivoting Engine Hood (full raise)
SMV Emblem

TRANSMISSION:
11 inch Traction Clutch
8 x 8 Transmission with Left Hand
Shuttle (Gears Synchronized,
Ranges are non-Synchronized)

FRONT AXLE:

Two-wheel Drive (2WD):
Adjustable Front Axle
Adjustable Rear Rims

Four-wheel Drive (4WD):
Mechanical FWD Engagement
Front Drive Shaft Shield
Adjustable Front & Rear Rims

TIRES:
Tires - 2wd - F-2 Ag Multiple-rib
Front: 7.5 X 16 6PR (F-2)
Rear: 14.9 X 28 8PR (R-1)
Tires - 4wd -R-1 Agriculture
Front: 9.5 X 24 6PR (R-1)
Rear: 14.9 X 28 8PR (R-1)
Tires - 4wd -R4 Industrial
Front: 12.4 X 20 6PR (R-4)
Rear: 18.4 X 24 6PR (R-4)

HYDRAULIC SYSTEM:
Hydrostatic Power Steering
Open Center System
1 Lever Controlled Rear Remote Valve

(Self Centering)
Dual Gear Pumps
Total Hydraulic Flow:

17.4 gpm (66 L/M)
Implement Pump:

11.9 gpm (45 L/M)
Steering Pump:

5.5 gpm (21 L/M)

DIFFERENTIAL LOCKS/ BRAKES:

Rear Axle provides In-board Planetary
Rear Lock - Mechanical Engage
Mechanical Wet Brakes

Park Brake - hand engagement

PTO:

11 inch PTO Clutch

Independent, 540 rpm PTO

Single Lever, Mechanical Engagement
Flip-up PTO Shaft Guard

3-POINT LIFT SYSTEM:
Single Lever Position Control
Lift Capacity @ 24" behind ball ends:
2710 lbs. (1225 kg)
Category 11 (convertible to
Category 1 with bushings)
Telescoping Stabilizers
Flexible Link Ends
Flat Swinging Drawbar
Draft Control

INSTRUMENTATION:

Digital/Analog Instrument Panel with
warning lights plus engine
temperature, fuel level gauges,
tachometer and digital hour meter

13 0f 20 -T1IX 03 051 000 01-JAN-20




CASE i T

AGRICULTURE

FARMALL 70A
US PRICE LIST

Standard Equipment

ELECTRICAL: WARRANTY :

(1) 12-volt, 720 CCA Battery Case IH Standard Warranty Applies
Alternator = 75 amp

7-pin Outlet for trailer/ OPERATOR"™S STATION:

implement lighting Straddle Deck Configuration
2-post Foldable ROPS

LIGHTING: Vinyl Seat with Operator”s
(2) Halogen front headlights Presence Sensor

(2) Halogen corner work lights Retractable Seat Belt

Tail lights /7 brake lights Cup Holder

Turn signals, Flashing warning lights Toolbox

14 of 20 -T1IX 03 051 000 01-JAN-20
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CASE il T
AGRICULTURE
FARMALL 70A
US PRICE LIST
Models
COMMERCIAL ENGINE POWER TRACTION Weight Factory Data List Price
MODEL
FARMALL 70A 70 HP 2WD 3,200 LB 9024186P72 $29,496.00
TRACTOR
FARMALL 70A 70 HP MFD 3,200 LB 9027075P58 $33,019.00
TRACTOR
Factory Supplied Options
Order Code Description | Weight Factory Data List Price
| ENGINE
[ EXHAUST SYSTEMS
SD_T1940 EXHAUST
337889 | Silencer Downswept No Charge
Required for Complete Loader Ready
337891 Vertical Exhaust 9000016P40 $20.00
HYDRAULICS
SD_T8270 REAR REMOTES
337984 1 Remote - Float + Detent No Charge
337985 | 2 Remote 1 + Kickout 9000423P9%4 $517.00
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CASE Ml T
FARMALL 70A
US PRICE LIST
PTO
SD_T8010 PTO
337896 | 540 RPM -Single PTO No Charge
337898 | 540 and 540E RPM PTO 9000423P94 $517.00
FRONT WHEELS AND TIRES
SD_T4940 FRONT WHEELS AND TIRES
8199101 | Front Shipping Wheels-2wd (900221P40) ($270.00)
Disposable upon delivery; no return credit.
8299905 | Front Shipping Wheels-4WD (900266P50) ($325.00)
Disposable upon delivery; no return credit.
8840701 | Front - R4 -Tire 12.5x18 - 4WD 9000305P04 $372.00
8270600 | Front Wheel - 7.5 x 16 - 2WD No Charge
7.50 X 16 6PR (F-2) Multiple-rib
8270601 | Front Wheel - 9.5 X 24 - 4WD No Charge
9.5 X 24 6PR (R-1) Agricultural
8812461 | FR-R4-RYRE 11Lx15F3 - 2WD 9000221P40 $270.00
11L X 15 6PR (F-3) Multiple-rib
(Required with R-4 Industrial rear tire)
8812451 | FR-R4 TYRE 12.4x20 9000305P04 $372.00
12.4 X 20 (R-4) Industrial
8812471 | FR-R-3TYRE-9.5X24 - 4WD 9000305P04 $372.00
9.5 X 24 4PR (R-3) Turf
REAR WHEELS AND TIRES
SD_T4950 REAR WHEELS AND TIRES
8399905 | Shipping Wheels-Rear (900443P62) ($541.00)
Disposable upon delivery; no return credit.
8980280 | Rear Wheel - 14.9x28 No Charge
14.9 X 28 8PR (R-1) Agricultural
8940301 | Rear- R4 -18.4x 24 9000431P32 $526.00
18.4 X 24 (R-4) Industrial
8912481 | RR-R3-16.9x24 9000431P32 $526.00

16.9 X 24 6PR (R-3) Turf
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CASE Hi

AGRICULTURE

-T1IX 03

FARMALL 70A
US PRICE LIST

| LoADER

| LOADER EQUIPMENT

SD_T8110 LOADER BRACKETS

337444

Loader Mount Ready

Complete Loader Ready includes

Mount Bracket Set (with Grill Guard) and
Mid Mounted Valve - 2 function mechanical
(Includes valve, joystick, cables, & hose kit)

9002554P30 $3,115.00

| OTHER EQUIPMENT

| REAR BALLAST

SD_T4960 WHEEL WEIGHTS

337926 [ Less Rear Ballast No Charge

337925 | Rear Weight - 40kg Each 9000246P00 $300.00
Rear Wheel Weight - 88 Ibs./40kg each side

338163 | Rear Weight 55kg Each 9000265P68 $324.00
Rear Wheel Weight - 121 |bs./55kg each side
For R4 Tires Only

OPERATOR'S MANUAL
SD_T9800 OPERATORS MANUAL
337951 English Manual No Charge
337952 French Manual No Charge
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