
T-628(5)
TRACTORS, AG TYPE and ATTACHMENTS
#422-1118

AGRICULTURAL TYPE TRACTORS AND ATTACHMENTS
DISCOUNT OFF LIST
SPECIFICATION 3.0

November, 2019

Vendor Name:
Contact Person:
Street Address:
P.O. Box:
City, State, Zip
Phone #:
Toll Free #:
Email Address: GovContractSupport@JohnDeere.com

Spec. Number Information Requested Answer

3.1 MANUFACTURER John Deere

3.2 DATE AND ID. OF PRICE LIST
07Nov2019; 

FR_Spray_20191107.pdf

3.3 CATALOG SECTION TITLE Frontier Sprayers

3.4 PERCENTAGE DISCOUNT FROM PRICE LIST 17%

3.5 DISCOUNT OFF LIST PRICE FOR RELATED PARTS  & ACCESSORIES 

 (See Special Terms and Conditions)

0% for incidental miscellaneous non-
contract items; 17% for 
attachments/accessories on contract.

3.6 PRICE FOR MANUALS (1 operator's manual included at no cost, per specs)
SERVICE MANUAL

Digital  N/A 
Paper N/A

PARTS MANUAL 
Digital  N/A 
Paper N/A

PRICE FOR ADDITIONAL OPERATIONS MANUAL 
Digital N/A
Paper N/A

3.7 PRICE FOR SET OF FLUID AND AIR FILTERS N/A

3.8 STANDARD WARRANTY:  12 months

3.9 PERFORMANCE/EXTENDED WARRANTY OPTIONS
Offer performance/warranty options.  (Add additional lines if necessary.)
(Specify years, miles or hours extended term covers.)

______________________________________________ No Bid
______________________________________________ No Bid

3.10 INSTALLATION - PER HOUR  (Hourly Shop Rate) N/A
Installation services may be requested on an "as needed" basis.
See Special Terms and Conditions

3.11 NEW EQUIPMENT RENTAL PROGRAM
If rental programs are available on the new equipment offered, with the option to purchase, list 
the hourly/weekly/monthly rental rate.  Indicate the percent of rental fee paid by the purchaser 
that will be applied to the purchase price.  See Solicitation Special Terms & Conditions.

Hourly Rental Rate: No Bid
Weekly Rental Rate: No Bid
Monthly Rental Rate: No Bid

Percent (%) of Rental Fee applied to purchase price: N/A

If the new rental equipment is purchased and finance
charges are applicable for the actual rental term only,
state the actual interest rate here:  ___N/A_____________

3.12 VENDOR OWNED RENTAL RETURN OR DEMO EQUIPMENT PROGRAM
(See Special Terms and Conditions.)
DEDUCT cost per Used Hour from the original Contract Price No Bid

3.13 DELIVERY STARTING POINT -                                                   City, State, Zip Location of delivering John Deere dealer

See Special Terms and Conditions - No flat rate allowed               $4 per loaded mile using Google Maps
$

Cary, NC 27513

800-358-5010, opt. 2

Deere & Company
Tamara Hebert
2000 John Deere Run

mailto:GovContractSupport@JohnDeere.com


Hitch: CAT II & III 3pt Mounted
Quick Hitch Compatible
Integrated Implement Stands w/Forklift Slots
Working Width: 25 Ft.
Transport Width: 8 Ft. 6 In.
Tractor Compatibility: Must not exceed 3pt Capacity
Shipping/Operating Weight: 842 lbs.
Frame: Powder Coat Tube Frame
Boom: Lattice Tube Frame
Manual Fold 3 piece boom
Breakaway w/Fore and Aft Movement

Controller: Manual Console Control
Nozzles: 10" Spaced Tee Jet Single Nozzle Body
Hand Wand
Light Kit
Approximate Assembly Time: 0.25 hrs

Code
Attachment
Identifier Description

List Price
Suggested

USD ($)

Select One Code From Each Required Category

BASE MACHINE
7361XF LS1125 3-pt Mounted Liquid Sprayer 8,552.00

PUMP SELECTION
7000 6 Roller PTO Pump In Base Price

7010 Hydraulic 75-204 Pump 763.00

TANK SIZE
7220 250 Gal. Tank In Base Price

7230 300 Gal. Tank 231.00

DESTINATION
0202 United States In Base Price

0184 Canada No Added Cost

0205 Quebec, Canada No Added Cost

OPERATOR'S MANUAL AND LABELS
0409 English Operator's Manual and Decal Kit In Base Price

0413 French Operator's Manual and Decal Kit No Added Cost

0437 Spanish Operator's Manual and Decal Kit No Added Cost

OPERATOR'S MANUAL AND LABELS
904J French Operator's Manual and Decal Kit 150.00

904V Spanish Operator's Manual and Decal Kit 150.00

MISCELLANEOUS
8213 Foam Markers 1,590.00

FRONTIER PRODUCTS

LS1125 3-pt Mounted Liquid Sprayer
Equipment for Base Machine

07 November 2019 US & Canada
1



Code
Attachment
Identifier Description

List Price
Suggested

USD ($)

ATTACHMENTS FOR FIELD CONVERSION

Miscellaneous
5FTFIMU2JD LS11 FOAM MARKER SYSTEM 1,717.20

Operator's Manual And Labels
5FT820018 LS11 French Operator's Manual & Decal Kit 168.00

5FT820019 LS11 Spanish Operator's Manual & Decal Kit 168.00

FRONTIER PRODUCTS

LS1125 3-pt Mounted Liquid Sprayer
Continued

07 November 2019 US & Canada
2



Hitch: CAT II & III 3pt Mounted
Quick Hitch Compatible
Integrated Implement Stands w/Forklift Slots
Working Width: 30 Ft.
Transport Width: 8 Ft. 6 In.
Tractor Compatibility: Must not exceed 3pt Capacity
Shipping/Operating Weight: 872 lbs.
Frame: Powder Coat Tube Frame
Boom: Lattice Tube Frame
Manual Fold 5 piece boom
Breakaway w/Fore and Aft Movement

Controller: Manual Console Control
Nozzles: 10" Spaced Tee Jet Single Nozzle Body
Hand Wand
Light Kit
Approximate Assembly Time: 0.25 hrs

Code
Attachment
Identifier Description

List Price
Suggested

USD ($)

Select One Code From Each Required Category

BASE MACHINE
7372XF LS1130 3-pt Mounted Liquid Sprayer 9,143.00

PUMP SELECTION
7000 6 Roller PTO Pump In Base Price

7010 Hydraulic 75-204 Pump 763.00

TANK SIZE
7220 250 Gal. Tank In Base Price

7230 300 Gal. Tank 231.00

DESTINATION
0202 United States In Base Price

0184 Canada No Added Cost

0205 Quebec, Canada No Added Cost

OPERATOR'S MANUAL AND LABELS
0409 English Operator's Manual and Decal Kit In Base Price

0413 French Operator's Manual and Decal Kit No Added Cost

0437 Spanish Operator's Manual and Decal Kit No Added Cost

OPERATOR'S MANUAL AND LABELS
904J French Operator's Manual and Decal Kit 150.00

904V Spanish Operator's Manual and Decal Kit 150.00

MISCELLANEOUS
8213 Foam Markers 1,590.00

FRONTIER PRODUCTS

LS1130 3-pt Mounted Liquid Sprayer
Equipment for Base Machine

07 November 2019 US & Canada
1



Code
Attachment
Identifier Description

List Price
Suggested

USD ($)

ATTACHMENTS FOR FIELD CONVERSION

Miscellaneous
5FTFIMU2JD LS11 FOAM MARKER SYSTEM 1,717.20

Operator's Manual And Labels
5FT820018 LS11 French Operator's Manual & Decal Kit 168.00

5FT820019 LS11 Spanish Operator's Manual & Decal Kit 168.00

FRONTIER PRODUCTS

LS1130 3-pt Mounted Liquid Sprayer
Continued

07 November 2019 US & Canada
2



Hitch: CAT II & III 3pt Mounted
Quick Hitch Compatible
Integrated Implement Stands w/Forklift Slots
Working Width: 30 Ft. and Under
Transport Width: 6 Ft. 11 In.
Tractor Compatibility: Must not exceed 3pt Capacity
Shipping/Operating Weight: 650 lbs.
Frame: Powder Coat Tube Frame
Controller: Manual Console Control
Nozzles: Hypro Boom Xtender Flat Fan Nozzles

Hand Wand
Light Kit
Approximate Assembly Time: 0.25 hrs

Code
Attachment
Identifier Description

List Price
Suggested

USD ($)

Select One Code From Each Required Category

BASE MACHINE
7383XF LS1130BL 3-pt Boomless Mounted Liquid Spayer 7,636.00

PUMP SELECTION
7000 6 Roller PTO Pump In Base Price

7010 Hydraulic 75-204 Pump 763.00

TANK SIZE
7220 250 Gal. Tank In Base Price

7230 300 Gal. Tank 231.00

DESTINATION
0202 United States In Base Price

0184 Canada No Added Cost

0205 Quebec, Canada No Added Cost

OPERATOR'S MANUAL AND LABELS
0409 English Operator's Manual and Decal Kit In Base Price

0413 French Operator's Manual and Decal Kit No Added Cost

0437 Spanish Operator's Manual and Decal Kit No Added Cost

OPERATOR'S MANUAL AND LABELS
904J French Operator's Manual and Decal Kit 150.00

904V Spanish Operator's Manual and Decal Kit 150.00

ATTACHMENTS FOR FIELD CONVERSION

FRONTIER PRODUCTS

LS1130BL 3-pt Boomless Mounted Liquid Spayer
Equipment for Base Machine

07 November 2019 US & Canada
1



Code
Attachment
Identifier Description

List Price
Suggested

USD ($)

ATTACHMENTS FOR FIELD CONVERSION ...Continued...

Operator's Manual And Labels
5FT820018 LS11 French Operator's Manual & Decal Kit 168.00

5FT820019 LS11 Spanish Operator's Manual & Decal Kit 168.00

FRONTIER PRODUCTS

LS1130BL 3-pt Boomless Mounted Liquid Spayer
Continued

07 November 2019 US & Canada
2



Hitch: CAT II & III 3pt Mounted
Quick Hitch Compatible
Integrated Implement Stands w/Forklift Slots
Working Width: 40 Ft.
Transport Width: 9 Ft. 3 In.
Tractor Compatibility: Must not exceed 3pt Capacity
Shipping/Operating Weight: 897 lbs.
Frame: Powder Coat Tube Frame
Boom: Lattice Tube Frame
Manual Fold 5 piece boom

Breakaway w/Fore and Aft Movement
Hand Wand
Light Kit
Approximate Assembly Time: 0.25 hrs

Code
Attachment
Identifier Description

List Price
Suggested

USD ($)

Select One Code From Each Required Category

BASE MACHINE
7394XF LS1140 3-pt Mounted Liquid Sprayer 10,354.00

CONTROLLER SELECTION
2230 Remcor Manual Console Controller In Base Price

2240 Raven Auto Console Controller 3,379.00

NOZZLE BODY SELECTION
7100 Single Nozzle Body In Base Price

7110 Triple Nozzle Body 638.00

PUMP SELECTION
7000 6 Roller PTO Pump In Base Price

7010 Hydraulic 75-204 Pump 763.00

TANK SIZE
7220 250 Gal. Tank In Base Price

7230 300 Gal. Tank 231.00

DESTINATION
0202 United States In Base Price

0184 Canada No Added Cost

0205 Quebec, Canada No Added Cost

OPERATOR'S MANUAL AND LABELS
0409 English Operator's Manual and Decal Kit In Base Price

0413 French Operator's Manual and Decal Kit No Added Cost

0437 Spanish Operator's Manual and Decal Kit No Added Cost

FRONTIER PRODUCTS

LS1140 3-pt Mounted Liquid Sprayer
Equipment for Base Machine

07 November 2019 US & Canada
1



Code
Attachment
Identifier Description

List Price
Suggested

USD ($)

OPERATOR'S MANUAL AND LABELS ...Continued...

OPERATOR'S MANUAL AND LABELS
904J French Operator's Manual and Decal Kit 150.00

904V Spanish Operator's Manual and Decal Kit 150.00

MISCELLANEOUS
8213 Foam Markers 1,590.00

ATTACHMENTS FOR FIELD CONVERSION

Miscellaneous
5FTFIMU2JD LS11 FOAM MARKER SYSTEM 1,717.20

Operator's Manual And Labels
5FT820018 LS11 French Operator's Manual & Decal Kit 168.00

5FT820019 LS11 Spanish Operator's Manual & Decal Kit 168.00

FRONTIER PRODUCTS

LS1140 3-pt Mounted Liquid Sprayer
Continued

07 November 2019 US & Canada
2



Hitch: CAT II & III 3pt Mounted
Quick Hitch Compatible
Integrated Implement Stands w/Forklift Slots
Working Width: 45 Ft.
Transport Width: 9 Ft. 12 In.
Tractor Compatibility: Must not exceed 3pt Capacity
Shipping/Operating Weight: 1400 lbs.
Frame: Powder Coat Tube Frame
Boom: Lattice Tube Frame
Hydraulic Fold 5 piece boom

Breakaway w/Fore and Aft Movement
Hand Wand
Light Kit
Approximate Assembly Time: 0.50 hrs

Code
Attachment
Identifier Description

List Price
Suggested

USD ($)

Select One Code From Each Required Category

BASE MACHINE
7405XF LS1145 3-pt Mounted Liquid Sprayer 17,844.00

CONTROLLER SELECTION
2230 Remcor Manual Console Controller In Base Price

2240 Raven Auto Console Controller 3,379.00

NOZZLE BODY SELECTION
7100 Single Nozzle Body In Base Price

7110 Triple Nozzle Body 638.00

PUMP SELECTION
7010 Hydraulic 75-204 Pump In Base Price

7011 Hydraulic 150-206 Pump 383.00

TANK SIZE
7220 250 Gal. Tank In Base Price

7230 300 Gal. Tank 231.00

DESTINATION
0202 United States In Base Price

0184 Canada No Added Cost

0205 Quebec, Canada No Added Cost

OPERATOR'S MANUAL AND LABELS
0409 English Operator's Manual and Decal Kit In Base Price

0413 French Operator's Manual and Decal Kit No Added Cost

0437 Spanish Operator's Manual and Decal Kit No Added Cost

FRONTIER PRODUCTS

LS1145 3-pt Mounted Liquid Sprayer
Equipment for Base Machine

07 November 2019 US & Canada
1



Code
Attachment
Identifier Description

List Price
Suggested

USD ($)

OPERATOR'S MANUAL AND LABELS ...Continued...

OPERATOR'S MANUAL AND LABELS
904J French Operator's Manual and Decal Kit 150.00

904V Spanish Operator's Manual and Decal Kit 150.00

MISCELLANEOUS
8213 Foam Markers 1,590.00

8214 LS11 Electric Fenceline Nozzles 654.00

ATTACHMENTS FOR FIELD CONVERSION

Miscellaneous
5FTEFLN2JD LS11 ELECTRIC FENCLINE NOZZLES 706.32

5FTFIMU2JD LS11 FOAM MARKER SYSTEM 1,717.20

Operator's Manual And Labels
5FT820018 LS11 French Operator's Manual & Decal Kit 168.00

5FT820019 LS11 Spanish Operator's Manual & Decal Kit 168.00

FRONTIER PRODUCTS

LS1145 3-pt Mounted Liquid Sprayer
Continued

07 November 2019 US & Canada
2
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