
SEQ #986-813

August 2013

STATE OF MINNESOTA PRICE SCHEDULE
(Typed Responses Required)

Price quote for:

Vendor Name:
Contact Person:
Street Address:
P.O. Box:
City, State, Zip
Phone #:
Toll Free #:
Fax #:
Email Address:

Spec # Information Requested Answer

5.0 Make & Model RST/SUBSITE

Inspection Vehicle Field Office Up-fit Package

Vehicle which package is designed to fit (van, trailer, etc.)
Trailers 12'-18', High Cube Van, Sprinter, 

Ford Transit, VEHICLES are optional.

Model and/or size 16' TRAILER IS INCLUDED

GVWR (Trailer only) 10,600 GVW

Operator area/studio

CUSTOMIZED, TRAILER OR VAN. 
STUDIO, LINOLEUM FLOORING, L-

SHAPED COUNTERTOP, BULKHEAD 
DOOR, 30" X 36" BULKHEAD SLIDING 

WINDOW, 110 VAC DUPLEX OUTLETS, 
INSULATED, GLUED AND SCREWED 

STUCTOGLASS WALLS AND CEILING, 
19" RACK MOUNT ELECTRONICS 

CUSTOM CABINETS, BENCH SEAT

Equipment storage area

CUSTOMIZED, TRAILER OR VAN 
EQUIPMENT ROOM, LINOLEUM 
FLOORING, RUBBER MATTING 

COVERED WORK BENCH TOP,110, 
VAC FOURPLEX OUTLETS, 

INSULATED, GLUED AND SCREWED 
STUCTOGLASS WALLS AND CEILING, 
AC AND DC BREAKER BOX, CUSTOM 

CABINETS

Other storage (cabinets, drawers, etc.)
5 DRAWER TOOL BOX, PRINTER 

SHELF, 

Generator/size 5.5KW

Generator compartment
ENCLOSED, VENTULATED, 

INSULATED

Wash down system 
SELF CONTAINED, ELECTRIC PUMP 

WITH HOSE AND REEL

Wash down system size 20 GALLON

Sink(s) OPTIONAL

Bathroom OPTIONAL

Interior lighting (how many/type) ALL LED, 110VAC AND 12VDC

608-575-7060
888-301-2409
NONE
NSE@HUGHES.NET

Inspection Vehicle Field Office Up-fit Package

NORTHERN SEWER EQUIPMENT CO INC
BRUCE WARD
W10417 HUBBLETON RD

WATERLOO, WI. 53594

mailto:NSE@HUGHES.NET#
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Exterior lighting (how many/type) LED FLOOD LIGHTS AND STROBE

Warranty ONE YEAR

Base Price $27,500.00
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STATE OF MINNESOTA PRICE SCHEDULE
(Typed Responses Required)

VENDOR NAME

MAKE AND MODEL

Spec # Description Qty Price Subtotal

5.0 Price for base unit: 27,500.00$      -$                 

5.10 Operator Area/Studio Options
Use this section to offer Operator Area/Studio options.  
Number items starting with 5.11, 5.12, etc. Use as 
many numbers as you need.

5.11 DIAMOND PLATE FLOOR 1,180.00$        -$                 
5.12 LONSEAL FLOORING 1,180.00$        
5.13 OPERATOR CHAIR 160.00$           
5.14 FLOOR TO CEILING CABINET WITH DOORS 1,140.00$        
5.15

CABLE KIT 520.00$           
5.16

FILE CABINET 278.00$           -$                 
5.17

13,500 BTU AIR CONDITIONER 1,995.00$        -$                 
5.18

1,500W WALL HEATER 250.00$           -$                 

5.30
Generator Options        
items starting with 5.31, 5.32, etc. Use as many 
numbers as you need.

5.31 7KW GAS GENERATOR IN LIEU OF 5.5K IN BASE 
BID 1,800.00$        -$                 

5.32 ROAD POWER SYSTEM FOR VEHICLES IN LIEU OF 
GENERATORS 4,000.00$        

5.33
8KW LIQUID COOLED QUIET DIESEL 5,700.00$        -$                 

5.40
Wash Down System Options         
items starting with 5.41, 5.42, etc. Use as many 
numbers as you need. 

5.41
30 GALLLON IN LIEU OF 20 G. IN BASE BID 100.00$           -$                 

5.42
-$                 

5.5
Other Inspection Vehicle Options     p   p  
Number items starting with 5.51, 5.52, etc. Use as 

5.51 MAINTENANCE TOOL KIT 450.00$           -$                 
5.52 LED LIGHT BAR REAR MOUNTED 775.00$           
5.53

AMBER STROBE LIGHT 345.00$           
5.54

AIR COMPRESSOR 1,590.00$        
5.55

DIAMOND PLATE FLOOR, EQUIPMENT ROOM 1,180.00$        
5.56

LONSEAL FLOORING, EQUIPMENT ROOM 1,180.00$        
5.57

REAR CABLE ACCESS DOOR 555.00$           
5.58

4" VISE MOUNTED ON WORK BENCH 115.00$           
5.59

FIRE EXTINGUISHER, 10 LB 65.00$             
5.60

1,500 W WALL HEATER IN EQUIPMENT ROOM 250.00$           
5.61

SINK WITH HOLDING TANK 1,598.00$        
5.62

22" LCD MONITOR IN EQUIPMENT ROOM 995.00$           
5.63

FUEL TANK FOR TRAILER UNITS ONLY 850.00$           
5.64

DOWNHOLE ROLLER SET WITH POLES, GUIDE 2,060.00$        
5.65

BATTERY, TRAILER ONLY 290.00$           
5.66

FLOOR TO CEILING CABINET WITH DOORS 1,140.00$        
5.67

-$                 

RST/SUBSITE INSTALL

NORTHERN SEWER EQUIPMENT CO 
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5.70
Installation

Per specification 5.5  INCLUDED IN BASE BID -$                 -$                 

5.80 EXTENDED WARRANTY OPTIONS

Use this section to offer performance/warranty options,
number these items starting with 9.1, 9.2, 9.3, etc.

(Specify years, miles or hours extended term covers.)
5.81 NOT AVAILABLE Price: $

5.90 VENDOR OWNED RENTAL RETURN OR DEMO EQUIPMEN  
See Solicitation Special Terms and Conditions.
DEDUCT cost per Used Hour from the original Contract Price

5.91 DISCOUNT OFF LIST PRICE FOR RELATED PARTS
AND ACCESSORIES (See Special Terms and Conditions

Price List Date and Number

6.0 NEW EQUIPMENT RENTAL PROGRAM

If rental programs are available on the new equipment
offered, with the option to purchase, list the 
hourly/weekly/monthly rental rate.  Indicate the percent 
of
rental fee paid by the purchaser that will be applied to
the purchase price.  See Solicitation Special Terms & 
Conditions.

Hourly Rental Rate:
Weekly Rental Rate:

Monthly Rental Rate:

6.10 Delivery Starting Point (city, state, zip code)
6.11 Price per loaded mile

Percent (%) of Rental Fee applied to purchase price:

SHIPPING INCLUDED

NOT AVAILABLE

5%

1/1/2018

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID

WATERLOO, WI
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