

Price quote for:

ENGINE DRIVEN SNOW BLOWER & ATTACHMENTS

Vendor Name:	Fair Manufacturing Inc.
Contact Person:	Lydel Thomas
Street Address:	2900 Alumax Rd.
P.O. Box:	-
City, State, Zip	Yankton, SD 57078
Phone #:	(605) 653-3247
Toll Free #:	-
Email Address:	sales@fairmfg.com

Spec. Number	Information Requested	Answer
3.0	Make & Model	Snocrete 948D
	Number of stages	Single
	Engine Type and net HP	Cummins B6.7 SV 326 HP/2200 RPM
	Instrument panel gauges	Fuel/Amp/Tach-Wireless Remote with Joystick
	Alternator size	130 Amp
	Fuel tank size	62 Gallons
	Drive line system	N/A
	Hydraulic system info	12 Volt DC
	Auger information	None
	Impeller information	4 Fan Blade/Replaceable Chopper Gathering Bars/Shear Bolt Protection
	Chute rotation	270 Degree
	Shoes/Scrapper blade information	Replaceable Bolt-On
	Performance (tons/hour)	3000
	Carrier requirements	3 Yards or Bigger
	Clearing width	108 Inches
	Clearing height	53 Inches
	Overall width	98 Inches
	Overall height	147 Inches
	Total weight	9000 lbs
	Warranty Details: (Months/Years, Hours, etc.)	1 year
3.1.1	Base Price:	\$132,546.00

EXHIBIT D
ENGINE DRIVEN SNOW BLOWERS

(Fixed Pricing - OPTIONS)
Specifications 4.0

VENDOR NAME: Fair Manufacturing Inc.

Spec #	Description		Price
--------	-------------	--	-------

MAKE AND MODEL:	Snocrete
	948D

Price for base unit:	\$ 132,546.00
-----------------------------	---------------

4.1 Chute Options:

Use this section to offer chute options such as truck loading chute, deflector flap, extensions, etc. (Number these items starting with 4.1.1, 4.1.2, 4.1.3 etc. until you have listed all chute options.)

4.1.1	Center Mounted, Hydraulic 270 Degree Rotating, Truck Loading	Standard
-------	--	----------

4.2 Blower Options:

Use this section to offer blower options such as steering vanes, caster wheels, replacement blades and shoes, etc. (Number these items starting with 4.2.1, 4.2.2, 4.2.3, etc.)

4.2.1	Windrow Extensions	\$ 300.00
4.2.2	Bolt On Curb Protector (per side)	\$ 580.00
4.2.3	Side Draft Compensator (each)	\$ 2,285.60
4.2.4	Snow Caster Wheels	\$ 3,700.00
4.2.5	948D Replacement Cutting Edge Set (includes hardware)	\$ 402.40
4.2.6	948D Replacement Skid Shoe Set (includes hardware)	\$ 600.00
4.2.7	948D Replacement Ice Chopper Gathering Bar Set (each, with hardware)	\$ 180.00

4.3 Engine Options:

Use this section to offer engine options such as starting aids, residential muffler, etc. (Number these items starting with 4.3.1, 4.3.2, 4.3.3, etc.)

4.3.1		No Bid
-------	--	--------

4.4 Other Options:

Use this section to offer options such as work lights, quick attachment hitch, standard attachment hitch, etc. (Number these items starting with 4.4.1, 4.4.2, 4.4.3, etc.)

4.4.1	Female Hitch Coupler of Choice	\$ 2,856.00
4.4.2	Additional Wireless Transmitter	\$ 1,280.00
4.4.3	Headlights and Flashers	\$ 680.00

4.5 Performance/Warranty Options

Use this section to offer performance/ warranty options. *Specify years, miles or hours extended term covers. (Number these starting with 4.5.1, 4.5.2, 4.5.3, etc.)

4.5.1		No Bid
-------	--	--------

EXHIBIT D
ENGINE DRIVEN SNOW BLOWERS

(Fixed Pricing - OPTIONS)
Specifications **4.0**

948D

4.6 New Equipment Rental Program

If rental programs are available on the new equipment offered, with the option to purchase, list the hourly/weekly/monthly rental rate. Indicate the percent of rental fee paid by the purchaser that will be applied to the purchase price. See Solicitation Special Terms & Conditions.

Hourly Rental Rate:	No Bid
Weekly Rental Rate:	\$ -
Monthly Rental Rate:	\$ -

Percent (%) of Rental Fee applied to purchase price:

If the new rental equipment is purchased and finance charges are applicable for the actual rental term only, state the actual interest rate here: _____

4.7 Vendor Owned Rental Return or Demo Equipment Program

See Solicitation Special Terms and Conditions.

DEDUCT cost per Used Hour from the original Contract Price No Bid

4.8 DELIVERY (See Special Terms and Conditions -No flat Rate Allowed)

4.8.1	Starting Point: (City, State, Zip Code)	Yankton, SD 57078
4.8.2	Price per Loaded Mile:	\$ 3.50
4.8.3	Minimum Delivery Charge:	\$ -

4.9 Installation - per Hour (Hourly Shop Rate)

See Special Terms and Conditions \$ 125.00

4.10 Price for Additional Manuals (1 ea. included at no cost, per specs)

Additional Service Manual

Digital	Free
Paper	\$ 125.00

Additional Parts Manual

Digital	Free
Paper	\$ 125.00

Additional Operatotion Manual

Digital	Free
Paper	\$ 125.00

