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March 19, 2014

Greg Paulson
MnDOT - District 6
2900 48" Street NW
Rochester, MN 55901

Subject: SP 055-609-018 (CSAH 9) Between Jct CSAH 22 and Jct CR 119
' " SP 055-625-023 (CSAH 25) Between Jct CSAH 22 and Jct CSAH 3

ATP Request to Move Projects

Greg,

MnDOT District 6 is planning to construct a roundabout at the TH 14/42 intersection during the 2015 season.
Establishment of a detour route utilizing Olmsted CSAH 9 is proposed as the means of controlling traffic during
the project. While this typically would not be problematic, a construction project is scheduled for CSAH 9 in

2015.

The proposed roundabout is an extremely important safety improvement. In an effort to maintain the schedule
established by MnDOT and accommodate using CSAH 9 as the detour route, Olmsted County respectfully

requests the following changes to the STIP:

e SP 055-609-018 (CSAH 9) is currently programmed for 2015 STIP improvements. Project costs are -
estimated at $3,225,100 federal funds (77%) and $974,900 local funds (23%), for a total of $4,200,000.

Move this project to the 2016 STIP.

SP 055-625-023 (CSAH 25) is currently programmed for 2016 STIP improvementé. Project costs are
estimated at $2,838,200 federal funds (69%) and $1,261,800 local funds (31%), for a total of

$4,100,000. Move this project to the 2015 STIP.

Recognizing that the dollar amounts cannot change in each of the fiscal years, the revised funding amounts
become: - _

o CSAH 25 in year 2015 - $3,225,100 federal (79%) and 874,900 (21%), for a total of $4,100,QOO..
CSAH 9 in year 2016 - $2,838,200 federal (68%) and $1,361,800 (32%), for a total of $4,200,000.

Please let me know if there are questions, or if additional information is needed.

Sincerely,

Kaye eniek, PE
Olmsted County Engineer

G Fausto Cabral, MnDOT District 6 State Aid Kyle Lake, MnDOT District 6 Project File
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Nagle, Laurie (DOT)

From: Schoenfelder, Mark (DOT)

Sent: Wednesday, March 26, 2014 10:20 AM

To: Nagle, Laurie (DOT)

Subject: FW: Wabasha federal project advance FY2017 into 2015
Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Flagged

From: Paulson, Greg (DOT)

Sent: Thursday, February 20, 2014 3:03 PM

To: Flesch, Dietrich

Cc: Cabral, Fausto (DOT); Schoenfelder, Mark (DOT)

Subject: Re: Wabasha federal project advance FY2017 into 2015

Thank you for the note Dietrich, informing the ATP of the advancement, they always appreciate being kept up

to date. We'll put this on the agenda, I'm sure the ATP will approve this, so I don't think you'll need to attend the
meeting, but of course you are always welcome if you would like to attend.

Greg
Sent from my iPad

On Feb 20, 2014, at 2:31 PM, "Flesch, Dietrich" <dflesch(@co.wabasha.mn.us> wrote:

Fausto and Greg

Please consider this as a request to the ATP for consideration of Wabasha County advancing SP 079-602-039 from
FY 2017 into 2015. Advancing the project is expected to result in better coordination with a planned 2015 project
that intersects with 079-602-039, and greater economy of scale for bid items. Attached is the STIP sheet with the
079-602-039 project highlighted. | understand federal funds would not be available until FY 2017 for the project if
advanced. If you have any questions or if you would like me present at the ATP meeting, please contact me.
Thanks,

Dietrich Flesch

Wabasha County Engineer
821 Hiawatha Drive West
Wabasha, MN 55981

Phone 651.565.3366 ext.113
Fax 651.565.4696

<STIP-2014-2017.pdf>



